

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

EXIDE TECHNOLOGIES,¹

Debtor.

Chapter 11

Case No. 13-11482 (KJC)

Objections Due: November 4, 2014 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)
Hearing Date: Only if objections are filed

**FOURTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF
LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR
SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE
OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD
JULY 1, 2014 THROUGH JULY 31, 2014**

Name of Applicant:	Lowenstein Sandler LLP
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Exide Technologies
Date of Retention:	August 6, 2013 (effective as of June 18, 2013)
Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought:	July 1, 2014 through July 31, 2014
Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	<u>\$515,082.60 (80% of \$643,853.25)</u>
Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable and necessary:	<u>\$140,492.75²</u>
This is the:	Fourteenth Monthly Fee Application

¹ The last four digits of the Debtor's taxpayer identification number are 2730. The Debtor's corporate headquarters are located at 13000 Deerfield Parkway, Building 200, Milton, Georgia 30004.

² Pursuant to the terms of the *Order Authorizing the Committee and the Debtor to Employ and Retain an Economic Consultant and Related Relief, Including a Waiver of Certain Provisions of Local Rule 2016* [D.I. 1674] (the "**Consultant Retention Order**"), these expenses include \$127,227.59 on behalf of the economic consultant, which represents 80% of the \$155,182.50 of fees and 100% of the \$3,081.59 of expenses incurred by the economic consultant between July 1, 2014 through July 31, 2014. In accordance with the terms of the Consultant Retention Order, the fee application of the economic consultant pursuant to which its fees and expenses are sought is being submitted to Judge Carey's Chambers, counsel for the Debtor, the Office of the United States Trustee and the fee examiner appointed in this case, all of which shall be deemed under seal.

If this is not the first application, disclose the following for each prior application:

Date Filed	Period Covered	Requested		Approved Amount		Certificate of No Objection / Signed Order
		Fees	Expenses	Fees	Expenses	
08/26/2013	06/18/2013-06/30/2013	\$232,804.50	\$1,384.98	\$186,243.60	\$1,384.98	09/19/2013
08/26/2013	07/01/2013-07/31/2013	\$664,531.00	\$3,093.39	\$531,624.80	\$3,093.39	09/19/2013
09/30/2013	08/01/2013-08/31/2013	\$473,619.00	\$3,722.33	\$378,895.20	\$3,722.33	10/23/2013
10/17/2013 First Interim Fee Application	06/18/2013-08/31/2013	\$1,370,954.50	\$8,200.70	\$1,305,072.37	\$8,200.70	07/14/2014
11/01/2013	09/01/2013-09/30/2013	\$418,044.50	\$8,791.52	\$334,435.60	\$8,791.52	12/02/2013
12/04/2013	10/01/2013-10/31/2013	\$474,565.00	\$3,152.72	\$379,652.00	\$3,152.72	12/30/2013
01/07/2014	11/01/2013-11/30/2013	\$455,110.00	\$9,247.11	\$364,088.00	\$9,247.11	01/30/2014
01/27/2014 Second Interim Fee Application	09/01/2013-11/30/2013	\$1,347,719.50	\$21,191.35	\$1,251,499.25	\$20,891.23	07/14/2014
02/12/2014	12/01/2013-12/31/2013	\$408,384.00	\$4,607.68	\$326,707.20	\$4,607.68	03/07/2014
03/31/2014	01/01/2014-01/31/2014	\$355,997.00	\$6,908.31	\$284,797.60	\$6,908.31	04/23/2014
04/28/2014	02/01/2014-02/28/2014	\$393,911.75	\$6,203.87	\$315,129.40	\$6,203.87	05/21/2014
04/29/2014 Third Interim Fee Application	12/01/2013-02/28/2014	\$1,158,292.75	\$17,719.86	\$1,128,225.75	\$17,388.85	09/22/2014
07/01/2014	03/01/2014-03/31/2014	\$417,591.50	\$188,019.06	\$334,073.20	\$188,019.06	07/24/2014
07/14/2014	04/01/2014-04/30/2014	\$378,640.25	\$17,558.87	\$302,912.20	\$17,558.87	08/06/2014
07/22/2014	05/01/2014-05/31/2014	\$386,646.50	\$7,450.57	\$309,317.20	\$7,450.57	08/19/2014
07/30/2014 Fourth Interim Fee Application	03/01/2014-05/31/2014	\$1,182,878.25	\$258,019.40			Pending
09/10/2014	06/01/2014-06/30/2014	\$516,209.50	\$156,258.39	\$156,258.39	\$156,258.39	10/03/2014

COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL**Exide Technologies****(Case No. 13-11482(KJC))****July 1, 2014 through July 31, 2014**

Name of Professional	Year Admitted	Title/Department	Hours	Rate³	Charge
Bender, Gerald C.	1984	Partner/Bankruptcy	77.10	\$855.00	\$65,920.50
*Bender, Gerald C. - Travel Time	1984	Partner/Bankruptcy	8.50	427.50	3,633.75
Blumenfeld, Jeffrey	1973	Partner/Litigation	49.10	960.00	47,136.00
*Blumenfeld, Jeffrey - Travel Time	1973	Partner/Litigation	11.00	480.00	5,280.00
Boxer, A. Matthew	1995	Partner/Litigation	27.80	700.00	19,460.00
Hahn, Michael J.	2001	Partner/Litigation	119.90	625.00	74,937.50
*Hahn, Michael J. - Travel Time	2001	Partner/Litigation	16.60	312.50	5,187.50
Kizel, Paul	1982	Partner/Bankruptcy	115.80	705.00	81,639.00
*Kizel, Paul - Travel Time	1982	Partner/Bankruptcy	11.00	352.50	3,877.50
Lichtenstein, Michael D.	1991	Partner/Litigation	6.70	720.00	4,824.00
Magidson, Matthew A.	1998	Partner/Corporate	3.80	750.00	2,850.00
Paradiso, Robert J.	1994	Partner/Corporate	28.80	725.00	20,880.00
*Paradiso, Robert J. - Travel Time	1994	Partner/Corporate	9.00	362.50	3,262.50
Rosen, Kenneth A.	1979	Partner/Bankruptcy	27.50	885.00	24,337.50
Stewart, James	1981	Partner/Litigation	14.10	640.00	9,024.00
Thompson, R. Scott	1986	Partner/Litigation	24.00	720.00	17,280.00
Chafetz, Eric S.	2004	Counsel/Bankruptcy	242.90	590.00	143,311.00
Montague, Maureen E.	1992	Counsel/Corporate	6.10	520.00	3,172.00

³ As set forth in paragraph 14 of the Committee's application to retain Lowenstein Sandler (the "Retention Application") [D.I. 370], it was expressly disclosed that Lowenstein Sandler, in accordance with its ordinary practice, intended to increase its hourly rates on an annual basis, on July 1 of each year. Accordingly, Lowenstein Sandler increased its hourly rates on July 1, 2014, as reflected on the chart above. In accordance with the Retention Application, Lowenstein Sandler advised the Debtor and the United States Trustee of the July 1, 2014, rate increase.

Adame Winningham, Nikki	2004	Associate/Litigation	46.70	415.00	19,380.50
Catalina, Frank T.M.	2009	Associate/Litigation	6.50	475.00	3,087.50
Newlands, Edward J.	2009	Associate/Corporate	4.60	480.00	2,208.00
Treseder, Megan B.	2013	Associate/Litigation	19.50	345.00	6,727.50
Waldron, Keara	2011	Associate/Bankruptcy	20.30	385.00	7,815.50
Worenklein, Elie J.	2011	Associate/Bankruptcy	144.00	385.00	55,440.00
Buccellato, Gina C.	N/A	Paralegal	43.30	200.00	8,660.00
Jelinski, Waldemar	N/A	Paralegal	5.10	120.00	612.00
Perrotta, Michael J.	N/A	Paralegal	13.30	200.00	2,660.00
Ramos, Damaris E.	N/A	Paralegal	5.10	245.00	1,249.50
Total Fees			1,108.10		\$643,853.25
Attorney Blended Rate				\$605.66	

*Reflects 50% rate reduction due to non-working travel time

COMPENSATION BY TASK CODE

Exide Technologies
(Case No. 13-11482(KJC))
July 1, 2014 through July 31, 2014

	Task Description	Hours	Fee
B110	Case Administration	27.30	\$13,280.00
B120	Asset Analysis and Recovery	217.90	139,187.50
B120A	Investigation of Prepetition Lenders	10.30	5,232.00
B120B	IP Asset Analysis	71.90	51,677.00
B140	Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	0.90	469.50
B150	Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	131.80	81,963.50
B160	Fee/Employment Applications	51.40	14,724.00
B165	Employment and Retention Applications - Others	3.60	2,081.00
B175	Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	21.40	10,497.00
B180	Avoidance Action Analysis	19.10	11,761.50
B185	Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts	0.70	310.50
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	24.90	16,760.00
B195	Non-Working Travel	56.10	21,241.25
B210	Business Operations	32.10	20,035.50
B230	Financing/Cash Collateral	100.10	55,581.50
B260	Board of Directors	0.10	70.50
B310	Claims Administration and Objections	5.60	2,551.00
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	159.60	98,850.50
B430A	Court Hearings	5.50	3,318.00
B450	Valuation	56.90	36,435.00
B460	Other - Insurance Matters	1.20	761.00

	Task Description	Hours	Fee
B460B	Other - Environmental Issues	109.70	57,065.50
	Total	1,108.10	\$643,853.25

EXPENSE SUMMARY

**Exide Technologies
(Case No. 13-11482(KJC))
July 1, 2014 through July 31, 2014**

Disbursements	Amount
Messenger and delivery charges	\$22.96
Computerized legal research	2,556.02
Searches	90.74
Telecommunications	2,263.37
Travel	8,245.47
Photocopies 866 pages at \$0.10 per page	86.60
Economic Consultant fees and expenses for the period of July 1, 2014 through July 31, 2014 (Fee statement to be provided under seal to the Court, the Debtor, the United States Trustee and the Fee Examiner, pursuant to the Order Authorizing the Committee and the Debtor to Employ and Retain an Economic Consultant and Related Relief, Including a Waiver of Certain Provisions of Local Rule 2016 [D.I. 1674]).	127,227.59
Total Disbursements	\$140,492.75

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

EXIDE TECHNOLOGIES,¹

Debtor.

Chapter 11

Case No. 13-11482 (KJC)

Objections Due: November 4, 2014 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

Hearing Date: Only if objections are filed

**FOURTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF
LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR
SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE
OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD
JULY 1, 2014 THROUGH JULY 31, 2014**

Lowenstein Sandler LLP (“**Lowenstein Sandler**”), bankruptcy counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “**Committee**”) in the above-captioned case, submits this application (the “**Application**”) for its fourteenth monthly allowance of compensation for professional services rendered to the Committee for the period of July 1, 2014 through July 31, 2014 (the “**Application Period**”) and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Application Period pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101 *et seq.* (the “**Bankruptcy Code**”), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “**Bankruptcy Rules**”), Rule 2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure for the United States Bankruptcy Court of the District of Delaware (the “**Local Rules**”), the United States Trustee’s *Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses filed under 11 U.S.C. § 330* (the “**US Trustee Guidelines**”) and the *Administrative Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* (D.I. 330) (the “**Interim Compensation Procedures Order**”).²

¹ The last four digits of the Debtor’s taxpayer identification number are 2730. The Debtor’s corporate headquarters are located at 13000 Deerfield Parkway, Building 200, Milton, Georgia 30004.

² Capitalized terms not defined herein are defined in the Interim Compensation Procedures Order.

JURISDICTION

1. This Court has jurisdiction over this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue in this district is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

BACKGROUND

2. On June 10, 2013 (the "**Petition Date**"), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for relief under chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtor continues to operate its business and manage its affairs as debtor-in-possession pursuant to sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.

3. On June 18, 2013, the Office of the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware appointed an official committee of unsecured creditors (the "**Committee**").

4. On June 18, 2013, the Committee engaged Lowenstein Sandler as bankruptcy counsel in connection with this bankruptcy case.

COMMITTEE PROFESSIONAL RETENTION

5. On August 6, 2013, this Court entered the *Order Authorizing and Approving the Employment and Retention of Lowenstein Sandler LLP as Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors Effective as of June 18, 2013* (D.I. 480).

FEE PROCEDURES ORDER

6. On July 11, 2013, the Court entered the Interim Compensation Procedures Order, which sets forth the procedures for interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses for all professionals in this case.

7. In particular, the Interim Compensation Procedures Order provides that a Professional may file and serve a Monthly Fee Application on or after the twenty fifth (25th) day of each month following the month for which compensation is sought. Provided that there are no

objections to the Monthly Fee Application filed within twenty one (21) days after the service of a Monthly Fee Application, the Professional may file a certificate of no objection with the court, after which the Debtor is authorized to pay such Professional 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in such Monthly Fee Application. If an objection is filed to the Monthly Fee Application, then the Debtor is authorized to pay 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses not subject to the objection.

RELIEF REQUESTED

8. Lowenstein Sandler submits this Application (a) for allowance of reasonable compensation for the actual, reasonable and necessary professional services that it rendered as counsel for the Committee in this case for the period of July 1, 2014 through July 31, 2014 and (b) for reimbursement of actual, reasonable and necessary expenses incurred in representing the Committee during that same period.

9. For the period covered by this Application, Lowenstein Sandler is seeking fees in the amount of \$643,853.25 and actual, reasonable and necessary expenses totaling \$140,492.75³. As of the date of this Application, Lowenstein Sandler has not received any payment for the fees and expenses requested herein.

10. The fees sought by this Application do not include any charges for certain timekeepers who billed less than five (5) hours during the Application Period. These hours total 10.80 hours, having a total savings value of \$5,661.50, based on the hourly rates charged by the timekeepers falling within this category. In the event that any objections to this Application are

³ Pursuant to the terms of the *Order Authorizing the Committee and the Debtor to Employ and Retain an Economic Consultant and Related Relief, Including a Waiver of Certain Provisions of Local Rule 2016* [D.I. 1674] (the "**Consultant Retention Order**"), these expenses include \$127,227.59 on behalf of the economic consultant, which represents 80% of the \$155,182.50 of fees and 100% of the \$3,081.59 of expenses incurred by the economic consultant between July 1, 2014 and July 31, 2014. In accordance with the terms of the Consultant Retention Order, the fee application of the economic consultant pursuant to which its fees and expenses are sought are being submitted to Judge Carey's Chambers, counsel for the Debtor, the Office of the United States Trustee and the fee examiner appointed in this case, all of which shall be deemed under seal.

filed, Lowenstein Sandler reserves the right to seek payment for all or any part of this voluntary reduction.

11. Exhibit A hereto contains logs, sorted by case project category, which reflect the time recorded by professionals, paraprofessionals and other support staff and a description of the services provided. During the Application, Period Lowenstein Sandler provided significant services to the Committee including, but not limited to, (a) assisting the Committee in investigating and monitoring the Debtor's business and financial affairs and operations, (b) investigating potential assets of the Debtor's estate, (c) investigating and assessing certain key environmental issues facing the Debtor, including a number of issues relating to the Debtor's lead recycling facility in Vernon, California, that was forced to temporarily cease operations in April 2014, (d) researching and preparing a draft objection to the Debtor's motion to amend its DIP facility, (e) negotiating plan term sheets and preparing for potential plan of reorganization issues; (f) engaging in extensive communications with representatives of the Debtor regarding numerous issues relating to the Debtor's chapter 11 case, and (g) engaging in extensive communications with the Committee regarding all aspects of the Debtor's chapter 11 case.

12. Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code provides that the Bankruptcy Court may award a professional employed under section 327 of the Bankruptcy Code "reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered . . . and reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses." 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(1). Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code also sets forth certain criteria for the award of such compensation and reimbursement:

In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded..., the court shall consider the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors, including –

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;

- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed; and
- (E) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.

Id. 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(3).

13. Lowenstein Sandler submits that the compensation requested in this Application is reasonable taking into account the various factors outlined in Section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code.

14. Exhibit B hereto contains an itemization of disbursements incurred by Lowenstein Sandler during the Application Period.

15. Lowenstein Sandler charges \$.10 per page for photocopying.

16. In accordance with Local Rule 2016-2, Lowenstein Sandler has reduced its request for compensation for any non-working travel to 50% of its normal hourly rate.

17. Lowenstein Sandler has endeavored to represent the Committee in the most expeditious and economical manner possible. Tasks have been assigned to attorneys, paralegals, and other support staff at Lowenstein Sandler so that work has been performed by those most familiar with the particular matter or task in the most economical manner. Lowenstein believes that it has been successful in this regard.

18. In addition, Lowenstein Sandler coordinated its efforts with the Committee's other professionals to avoid duplication of efforts.

19. Except to the extent permitted by § 504(b) of the Bankruptcy Code, no agreement or understanding exists between Lowenstein Sandler and any other person for the sharing of compensation received or to be received for services rendered or expenses incurred in or in connection with this case.

20. The undersigned has reviewed the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2 and certifies to the best of his information, knowledge and belief that this Application substantially complies with that Rule.

21. The Committee co-chairs have been provided an opportunity to review the Application and approved the requested fees and expenses.

WHEREFORE, Lowenstein Sandler respectfully requests that this Court: (a) allow Lowenstein Sandler (i) compensation in the amount of \$515,082.60 (\$643,853.25 minus a 20% holdback of \$128,770.65) for actual, reasonable and necessary professional services rendered on behalf of the Committee during the period July 1, 2014 through July 31, 2014, and (ii) reimbursement of \$140,492.75 for actual, reasonable and necessary expenses incurred during the same period; (b) authorize and direct the Debtor to pay to Lowenstein Sandler the amount of its allowed compensation and allowed expense reimbursement; and (c) grant such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated: October 14, 2014

Respectfully submitted,

LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP

By: /s/ Paul Kizel

Kenneth A. Rosen, Esq.
Paul Kizel, Esq.
65 Livingston Avenue
Roseland, NJ 07068
Telephone: (973) 597-2500
Facsimile: (973) 597-2400

-and-

Gerald C. Bender, Esq.
1251 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10020
Telephone: (212) 262-6700
Facsimile: (212) 262-7402

*Counsel to the Official Committee
of Unsecured Creditors*

EXHIBIT “A”

EXHIBIT A

Professional Services rendered by Lowenstein Sandler LLP, through July 31, 2014

In re: Exide Creditors Committee Chapter 11

I. SUMMARY OF TIME CHARGES AND HOURLY RATES

Name of Professional	Year Admitted	Title	Hours Spent	Hourly Rate	Charge
Bender, Gerald C.	1984	Partner	77.10	\$855.00	\$65,920.50
*Bender, Gerald C. - Travel Time	1984	Partner	8.50	427.50	3,633.75
Blumenfeld, Jeffrey	1973	Partner	49.10	960.00	47,136.00
*Blumenfeld, Jeffrey - Travel Time	1973	Partner	11.00	480.00	5,280.00
Boxer, A. Matthew	1995	Partner	27.80	700.00	19,460.00
Hahn, Michael J.	2001	Partner	119.90	625.00	74,937.50
*Hahn, Michael J. - Travel Time	2001	Partner	16.60	312.50	5,187.50
Kizel, Paul	1982	Partner	115.80	705.00	81,639.00
*Kizel, Paul - Travel Time	1982	Partner	11.00	352.50	3,877.50
Lichtenstein, Michael D.	1991	Partner	6.70	720.00	4,824.00
Magidson, Matthew A.	1998	Partner	3.80	750.00	2,850.00
Paradiso, Robert J.	1994	Partner	28.80	725.00	20,880.00
*Paradiso, Robert J. - Travel Time	1994	Partner	9.00	362.50	3,262.50
Rosen, Kenneth A.	1979	Partner	27.50	885.00	24,337.50
Stewart, James	1981	Partner	14.10	640.00	9,024.00
Thompson, R. Scott	1986	Partner	24.00	720.00	17,280.00
Chafetz, Eric S.	2004	Counsel	242.90	590.00	143,311.00
Montague, Maureen E.	1992	Counsel	6.10	520.00	3,172.00
Adame Winningham, Nikki	2004	Associate	46.70	415.00	19,380.50
Catalina, Frank T.M.	2009	Associate	6.50	475.00	3,087.50
Newlands, Edward J.	2009	Associate	4.60	480.00	2,208.00
Treseder, Megan B.	2013	Associate	19.50	345.00	6,727.50
Waldron, Keara	2011	Associate	20.30	385.00	7,815.50
Worenklein, Elie J.	2011	Associate	144.00	385.00	55,440.00
Buccellato, Gina C.	N/A	Paralegal	43.30	200.00	8,660.00
Jelinski, Waldemar	N/A	Paralegal	5.10	120.00	612.00
Perrotta, Michael J.	N/A	Paralegal	13.30	200.00	2,660.00
Ramos, Damaris E.	N/A	Paralegal	5.10	245.00	1,249.50
TOTAL FEES			1108.10		\$643,853.25

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 136
 September 30, 2014

Timekeeper Summary (by Task):

Task	Task Description	Hours	Fees
B110	Case Administration	27.30	\$13,280.00
B120	Asset Analysis and Recovery	217.90	139,187.50
B120A	Investigation of Prepetition Lenders	10.30	5,232.00
B120B	IP Asset Analysis	71.90	51,677.00
B140	Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings	0.90	469.50
B150	Meetings of and Communication with Creditors	131.80	81,963.50
B160	Fee/Employment Applications	51.40	14,724.00
B165	Employment and Retention Applications - Others	3.60	2,081.00
B175	Fee Applications and Invoices - Others	21.40	10,497.00
B180	Avoidance Action Analysis	19.10	11,761.50
B185	Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts	0.70	310.50
B190	Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	24.90	16,760.00
B195	Non-Working Travel	56.10	21,241.25
B210	Business Operations	32.10	20,035.50
B230	Financing/Cash Collateral	100.10	55,581.50
B260	Board of Directors	0.10	70.50
B310	Claims Administration and Objections	5.60	2,551.00
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)	159.60	98,850.50
B430A	Court Hearings	5.50	3,318.00
B450	Valuation	56.90	36,435.00
B460	Other - Insurance Matters	1.20	761.00
B460B	Other - Environmental Issues	109.70	57,065.50
	Total	1108.10	\$ 643,853.25

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632

Page 2
September 30, 2014

Attorney Blended Rate

\$605.66

*Reflects 50% rate reduction due to non-working travel time

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 3
 September 30, 2014

TIME DETAIL:

<u>Code</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>B100 - Administration</u>					
<u>B110 Case Administration</u>					
B110	07/01/14	EJW	Locate and circulate Debtor's SEC filings	0.40	\$154.00
B110	07/01/14	ESC	Review updated docket report	0.10	59.00
B110	07/01/14	GCB	Set up telephonic appearance for team	0.60	120.00
B110	07/02/14	ESC	Review daily docket report	0.10	59.00
B110	07/02/14	GCB	Review docket, download pleadings and circulate same to team for review	0.40	80.00
B110	07/03/14	EJW	Draft joinder to NDA for Sierra Research	0.90	346.50
B110	07/03/14	ESC	Review and comment on daily docket report	0.20	118.00
B110	07/03/14	ESC	Participate in weekly call with the debtor's professionals (Skadden, Alvarez, and Lazard) and committee professionals (Lowenstein, Guggenheim, Geosyntec and Zolfo) re: legal and business updates	0.90	531.00
B110	07/03/14	GB	Participate on weekly call with debtor professionals	0.90	769.50
B110	07/03/14	GCB	Review docket, download pleadings and circulate numerous pleadings to team and committee member	1.00	200.00
B110	07/03/14	PK	Communicate with E. Worenklein to have Sierra Research sign NDA	0.20	141.00
B110	07/03/14	PK	Communicate with G. Rubenstein (Sierra Research enviro consultant) re: need to execute NDA	0.10	70.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 4
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B110	07/03/14	WJ	Download pleadings	0.10	12.00
B110	07/07/14	GCB	Review docket, download pleadings and circulate same to team for review	0.60	120.00
B110	07/07/14	WJ	Download pleadings	0.40	48.00
B110	07/08/14	EJW	Circulate reminders to LS team re: recent pleadings	0.20	77.00
B110	07/08/14	ESC	Review updated task list	0.20	118.00
B110	07/08/14	GCB	Review docket, download pleadings and circulate same to team for review	0.50	100.00
B110	07/09/14	JB	E-mails on further detail for expenses, finding and reviewing expense details	0.60	576.00
B110	07/09/14	WJ	Download pleadings	0.30	36.00
B110	07/10/14	ESC	Prepare for and participate in weekly phone call with debtor professionals (Skadden, Lazard and A&M) and committee professionals (Lowenstein, Guggenheim, Zolfo, MNAT, and Geosyntec) re: business and legal updates	0.90	531.00
B110	07/10/14	ESC	Prepare for(.2) and participate in weekly phone call with committee professionals (Lowenstein, Guggenheim and Zolfo) re: strategy related to objection to amended DIP facility and MCAM diligence (.7)	0.90	531.00
B110	07/10/14	GB	Call with debtor advisors and committee advisors re: pending matters including environmental, DIP amendment, MCAM, etc.	0.50	427.50
B110	07/10/14	GCB	Review docket, download pleadings and circulate same to team for review	1.30	260.00
B110	07/11/14	GCB	Review docket and circulate numerous pleadings to team and committee member	0.20	40.00
B110	07/14/14	KW	Update critical dates memorandum with recently scheduled dates and deadlines and update internal calendars with same	0.60	231.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 5
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B110	07/15/14	GCB	Review docket, download pleadings and transfer same to filesite	0.50	100.00
B110	07/15/14	WJ	Download pleadings	0.50	60.00
B110	07/17/14	GB	Participate on weekly call with debtor professionals re: status of pending matters and business update	0.60	513.00
B110	07/17/14	GB	Phone call with P. Kizel re: upcoming meeting with noteholders' and debtor's professionals	0.30	256.50
B110	07/17/14	KAR	Participate in weekly call with debtor's professionals	0.50	442.50
B110	07/17/14	PK	Committee professionals call to discuss strategy/pending matters/workstreams	0.50	352.50
B110	07/17/14	WJ	Download pleadings	0.50	60.00
B110	07/18/14	WJ	Download pleadings	0.40	48.00
B110	07/20/14	PK	Telephone conference with Guggeheim and Zolfo re: case status/strategy	0.70	493.50
B110	07/22/14	GCB	Review docket, download pleadings and circualte same to team for review	0.30	60.00
B110	07/23/14	EJW	Review docket and calendar to confirm upcoming deadlines and tasks	0.30	115.50
B110	07/23/14	GCB	Review docket, download pleadings and circulate same to team for review	0.50	100.00
B110	07/23/14	KW	Update critical dates memorandum with recently scheduled dates and deadlines and update internal calendars regarding same	0.80	308.00
B110	07/24/14	ESC	Participate in weekly call with debtor's professionals (A&M, Skadden, Lazard) and Committee professionals (Zolfo, Guggenheim and Lowenstein) re: business and legal updates	0.50	295.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 6
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B110	07/24/14	GB	Participate in weekly call with debtor professionals re: pending legal, environmental and business update	0.50	427.50
B110	07/24/14	GB	Review and respond to E. Worenklein e-mail re: diligence requested of debtors	0.20	171.00
B110	07/24/14	KAR	Weekly call with debtor's professionals re: business and legal update	0.50	442.50
B110	07/24/14	KW	Update critical dates memorandum with recently scheduled dates and deadlines and update internal calendars regarding same	0.20	77.00
B110	07/24/14	PK	Attend weekly call with committee/debtor professionals re: case status/update	0.50	352.50
B110	07/24/14	PK	Confer with E. Chafetz re: various pending matters	0.30	211.50
B110	07/25/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Skadden re: data room access	0.10	38.50
B110	07/25/14	GCB	Review docket, download pleadings and circulate same to team	0.40	80.00
B110	07/25/14	KAR	Conference call with professionals re: Canon Hollow	0.50	442.50
B110	07/25/14	WJ	Download pleadings	0.50	60.00
B110	07/29/14	WJ	Download pleadings	0.40	48.00
B110	07/30/14	WJ	Download pleadings	0.60	72.00
B110	07/31/14	EJW	Draft follow-up e-mail to Skadden re: data room access	0.10	38.50
B110	07/31/14	ESC	Participate in weekly call with debtor professionals (Skadden, A&M, and Lazard) and committee professionals (Lowenstein, MNAT, Guggenheim and Zolfo) re: legal and business updates	0.20	118.00
B110	07/31/14	ESC	Discuss pending matters with P. Kizel and G. Bender	0.30	177.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 7
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B110	07/31/14	GB	Discuss pending matters with E. Chafetz and P. Kizel	0.30	256.50
B110	07/31/14	KAR	Review debtor's presentation (3) for Friday morning updates	0.60	531.00
B110	07/31/14	PK	Discuss pending matters with G. Bender and E. Chafetz	0.30	211.50
B110	07/31/14	PK	Prepare for (.2) and participate in weekly debtor/committee professionals call (.2)	0.80	564.00
Total B110 - Case Administration				27.30	\$13,280.00

B120 Asset Analysis and Recovery

B120	07/01/14	ESC	Review additional information/documentation related to lead investigation	0.20	118.00
B120	07/01/14	MJH	Conference call with M. Magidson re: financial and commodity markets issues (1.0); conference call with P. Kizel re: Guggenheim information request (.1); e-mail J. Blumenfeld re: document collection issues (.2); research lead inventory, warrants and market movement issues (3.0)	4.30	2,687.50
B120	07/02/14	GB	Discuss foreign lien perfection issues with E. Chafetz	0.30	256.50
B120	07/02/14	JB	Weekly call with economic consultant to update on Lead Pricing Investigation including discussion of data, potential theories of and approaches to liability, and additional work needed	1.30	1,248.00
B120	07/02/14	JB	Discussion and analysis with M. Hahn of facts and potential theories of liability and antitrust harm in connection with Lead Pricing Investigation	1.80	1,728.00
B120	07/02/14	MAM	Review materials on lead market (.8); conference with M. Hahn on same (1.0)	1.80	1,350.00
B120	07/02/14	MJH	Conference call with J. Blumenfeld re: theories of liability and factual development in lead investigation (1.8); research lead pricing and warehouse acquisitions and draft summaries (2.8)	4.60	2,875.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 8
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	07/02/14	MJH	Participate in investigation conference call with economic consulting firm and Debtor's counsel	1.60	1,000.00
B120	07/03/14	JB	E-mails with economic consultant on Lead Pricing Investigation source materials	0.20	192.00
B120	07/03/14	MAM	Research on lead market practices	1.20	900.00
B120	07/03/14	MJH	Research and summarize bank acquisitions of warehouses and review cited publications from zinc complaint	4.30	2,687.50
B120	07/07/14	MBT	Research London Metal Exchange standards and regulations	2.40	828.00
B120	07/07/14	MJH	Research antitrust issues re: warehouse acquisitions (2.2); research operations of warehouse companies prior to acquisitions and summarize re: same (2.6); review articles from zinc complaint and integrate into summary (1.1)	5.90	3,687.50
B120	07/08/14	JB	Meeting with economic consultant in Lead Pricing Investigation to discuss analysis	0.30	288.00
B120	07/08/14	MBT	Research standards for warehouses under London Metal Exchange	3.40	1,173.00
B120	07/08/14	MJH	Participate in meeting with economic consulting firm and debtor's counsel	3.20	2,000.00
B120	07/09/14	MBT	Research London Metal Exchange changes in load out limits	2.00	690.00
B120	07/09/14	MJH	Research re: lead market supply and inventory	2.10	1,312.50
B120	07/10/14	JB	Discussion with M. Hahn of issues for update to UCC on Lead Pricing Investigation	0.30	288.00
B120	07/10/14	MBT	Complete research on load out requirements; compose summary e-mail re: same	2.50	862.50
B120	07/10/14	MJH	Participate in meeting with economic consulting firm re: investigatory issues	1.60	1,000.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 9
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	07/10/14	MJH	Review article re: metals market	0.20	125.00
B120	07/10/14	MJH	Review articles from Zinc Complaint re: warehousing	0.90	562.50
B120	07/11/14	MBT	Telephone call with M. Hahn re: requested supplements to research	0.20	69.00
B120	07/11/14	MJH	Review and analyze LME rules	0.50	312.50
B120	07/11/14	MJH	Conference call with M. Treseder re: revision to analysis LME rules analysis	0.20	125.00
B120	07/11/14	MJH	Research re: pricing in effects in lead market, review articles compiled by economic consulting firms, review consulting firm charts and draft summary of pricing effects	5.80	3,625.00
B120	07/13/14	MBT	Plan necessary steps to complete research on London Metal Exchange rules and regulations	0.30	103.50
B120	07/14/14	ESC	Phone call with M. Hahn, J. Blumenfeld and P. Kizel re: update on lead investigation	0.80	472.00
B120	07/14/14	JB	Discussion with P. Kizel, M. Hahn on potential next steps in Lead Pricing Investigation	0.80	768.00
B120	07/14/14	JB	Discussion with M. Hahn of potential current issues in Lead Pricing Investigation	0.40	384.00
B120	07/14/14	MBT	Draft memorandum re: London Metal Exchange regulations	5.10	1,759.50
B120	07/14/14	MJH	Research lead inventory, supply and pricing movement issues and draft summary re: same (6.3); Conference call with P. Kizel, J. Blumenfeld and E. Chavetz re: relevant information in the possession of third parties as it relates to the lead investigation (.8); conference call with J. Blumenfeld re: manipulation theories and third party discovery (.4)	7.50	4,687.50
B120	07/14/14	PK	Call with J. Blumenfeld and M Hahn re: Lead Price Investigation	0.80	564.00
B120	07/15/14	ESC	Review, revise and discuss lien stipulation with G. Bender	0.60	354.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 10
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	07/15/14	GB	Review, revise and discuss lien stipulation with E. Chafetz	0.60	513.00
B120	07/15/14	JB	Logistics for meetings with Exide personnel in Atlanta for July 23, 2014 - July 25, 2014	0.30	288.00
B120	07/15/14	MBT	Complete draft of memorandum on London Market Exchange regulations	3.00	1,035.00
B120	07/15/14	MJH	Review economist charts (.3); research re: delisting of LME warehouses (.9); meet with M. Perotta re: compilation of pleading in aluminum litigation (.1); research and summarize additional information re: lead markets and operation of LME and LME contracts (3.6)	4.90	3,062.50
B120	07/15/14	MJP	Review docket sheet re: motions to dismiss in aluminum antitrust cases and review docket sheet re: compile motions to dismiss as per M. Hahn's request	3.30	660.00
B120	07/15/14	MJP	Communicate with M. Hahn re: motion to dismiss in aluminum cases	0.10	20.00
B120	07/15/14	PK	Exchange e-mails with E. Ivester re: scheduling call re: Canon Hollow issue	0.10	70.50
B120	07/16/14	JB	Review and analysis of Exide documents in Lead Pricing Investigation	4.40	4,224.00
B120	07/16/14	JB	Discussion with M. Hahn of issues in Lead Pricing Investigation	0.40	384.00
B120	07/16/14	JB	Logistics for Exide interviews in Lead Pricing Investigation	0.30	288.00
B120	07/16/14	MBT	Review memorandum re: London Market Exchange regulations; request creation of binders containing memorandum and corresponding documentation	0.40	138.00
B120	07/16/14	MJH	Conference call with J. Blumenfeld re: planning for Exide interviews, lead acquisition and liability issues (1.0); conference with M. Perotta re: compilation of aluminum case pleadings (.1); research information re: lead market bakwardation and contango and draft summary of market development issues (2.7)	3.80	2,375.00
B120	07/16/14	MJP	Review docket sheet in aluminum antitrust actions and compile declarations as per M. Hahn's request	4.20	840.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 11
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	07/17/14	AMB	Advise P. Kizel re: attorney-client privilege issues in connection with Akin Gump investigation of Canon Hollow inventory issue	0.20	140.00
B120	07/17/14	JB	Discussion of metal market issues with counsel for plaintiffs in aluminum complaint in connection with Lead Pricing Investigation	0.80	768.00
B120	07/17/14	JB	Analysis with M. Hahn of issues relating to Lead Pricing Investigation	0.60	576.00
B120	07/17/14	MAM	Conference with M. Hahn on lead market; research on same	0.80	600.00
B120	07/17/14	MJH	Conference with K. Campbell re: lead investigation database issues (.2); prepare lead investigation materials for J. Blumenfeld review (.2); conference with M. Perotta re: compilation of pleadings in aluminum investigation (.2); conference call with P. Kizel re: Exide interviews (.1); research and summarize short squeeze and cornering the market issues (1.6) research lead materials and draft document requests to Metro (1.8); review materials in preparation for Exide interviews (.8); conference call with third party re: investigation issues (1.5)	6.40	4,000.00
B120	07/17/14	MJP	Continue to review docket sheet in aluminum antitrust actions and assemble relevant pleadings	4.40	880.00
B120	07/18/14	ESC	Review updates regarding lead investigation	0.10	59.00
B120	07/18/14	MJH	Research and summarize market issues (1.2); conference call with economic consulting firm re: market manipulation issues (1.0); research, draft and compile document requests re: Metro (3.3)	5.50	3,437.50
B120	07/18/14	MJP	Communicate with M. Hahn re: motions to dismiss case along with several declarations	0.20	40.00
B120	07/18/14	MJP	Review docket sheet re: motions to dismiss; review docket sheet re: certifications; compile motions to dismiss as per M. Hahn's request	1.10	220.00
B120	07/18/14	PK	Exchange e-mails with J. Blumenfeld and M. Hahn re: lead pricing investigation	0.20	141.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 12
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	07/19/14	ESC	Review documents and correspondence associated with status of lead investigation	0.20	118.00
B120	07/19/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel and G. Bender re: call to discuss noteholders' liens on intellectual property	0.10	59.00
B120	07/21/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender and P. Kizel re: letter to the debtor re: MCAM IP process	0.20	118.00
B120	07/21/14	GB	Conference call with P. Kizel, J. Bilumenfeld and M. Hahn on discussion of status of Lead Pricing Investigation	0.60	513.00
B120	07/21/14	JB	Conference call with P. Kizel, G. Bender, M. Hahn on discussion of status of Lead Pricing Investigation	0.60	576.00
B120	07/21/14	JB	Weekly call with Debtor's counsel and economic consultant to discuss developments and status in Lead Pricing Investigation	0.60	576.00
B120	07/21/14	JB	Review and analyze documents on metal market manipulation to prepare for interviews with Exide executives	5.20	4,992.00
B120	07/21/14	MJH	Participate in conference call with G. Bender, P. Kizel, E. Chavetz and J. Blumenfeld re: lead investigation and plan for reorganization (.4); conference call with J. Blumenfeld re: upcoming call with Debtor's counsel and economic consulting firm matters (.3); conference call with economic consulting firm (.4); review Exide documents in lead investigation dataroom and prepare for interviews with Exide personnel (4.7); participate in conference call with economic consulting firm (.8); draft document requests to Metro (1.3)	7.90	4,937.50
B120	07/21/14	PK	Telephone conference with J. Blumenfeld, M. Hahn, G. Bender re: lead price investigation	0.60	423.00
B120	07/21/14	PK	Review economic consultant pleadings re: privilege and other issues (.4), e-mails (2) to LS team re: same (.3)	0.70	493.50
B120	07/22/14	ESC	Review update regarding status of the lead investigation	0.10	59.00
B120	07/22/14	JB	Review and analyze documents on metal market manipulation to prepare for interviews with Exide executives	1.70	1,632.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 13
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	07/22/14	JB	Work on logistics for interviews with Exide executives	0.70	672.00
B120	07/22/14	MJH	E-mail E. Bell re: privilege review issues (.1); draft document request to Metro and Goldman (2.8); conference call with economic consulting firm re: interview preparation (.2); review Exide documents in lead investigation dataroom and prepare for interviews with Exide personnel (1.2)	4.30	2,687.50
B120	07/23/14	JB	Review materials to prepare for interviews of Exide executives	3.90	3,744.00
B120	07/23/14	MJH	Conference call with J. Blumenfeld and economic consulting firm re: Exide interview preparations	0.50	312.50
B120	07/23/14	MJH	Conference call with debtor's counsel and economic consulting firm re: interview preparations	0.80	500.00
B120	07/23/14	MJH	Review Exide documents in lead investigation dataroom and prepare for interviews with Exide personnel	2.50	1,562.50
B120	07/23/14	MJH	Review articles and analyses re: commodities manipulation	1.00	625.00
B120	07/23/14	PK	E-mail to Akin re; status of providing report on inventory and review response	0.10	70.50
B120	07/23/14	RJP	Review of IP matters	2.00	1,450.00
B120	07/24/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with R. Paradisio re: call to discuss scope of noteholders' liens on intellectual property	0.10	59.00
B120	07/24/14	JB	Prepare for today's interviews of Exide personnel re: lead investigation	1.30	1,248.00
B120	07/24/14	JB	Interviews with Exide personnel on Lead Pricing Investigation	4.50	4,320.00
B120	07/24/14	MJH	Meet with J. Blumenfeld and economic consulting firm in preparation for Exide interviews (.5); participate in Exide interviews and meetings with debtor's counsel in Alpharetta, GA (8.7)	9.20	5,750.00
B120	07/24/14	PK	E-mail to Akin re: report on Canon Hollow Canon Hollow inventory (.2) and review response and e-mail in response (.1)	0.30	211.50

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 14
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	07/25/14	DER	Preparation and mailing to J. Blumenfeld	1.20	294.00
B120	07/25/14	DER	Completion of organization of documents	1.20	294.00
B120	07/25/14	DER	Download and print articles re: lead investigation	0.90	220.50
B120	07/25/14	DER	Organization of documents into chronological order	0.90	220.50
B120	07/25/14	DER	Create Index for J. Blumenfeld	0.90	220.50
B120	07/25/14	EJW	Locate documents in data room for discovery requests	0.50	192.50
B120	07/25/14	GB	Review illustrative value report	0.30	256.50
B120	07/25/14	JB	Prepare for today's interview session	1.30	1,248.00
B120	07/25/14	JB	Interviews with Exide personnel on Lead Pricing Investigation	7.00	6,720.00
B120	07/25/14	MJH	Meet with J. Blumenfeld and economic consulting firm in preparation for Exide interviews	0.50	312.50
B120	07/25/14	MJH	Participate in Exide interviews in Alpharetta, GA	7.80	4,875.00
B120	07/28/14	JB	E-mails with economic consultants on data and documents still needed	0.20	192.00
B120	07/28/14	MBT	Telephone call with M. Hahn re: research	0.20	69.00
B120	07/28/14	MJH	Compile Exide interview meeting notes (.4); review M. Treseder memo re: LME rules and cited documentation (1.0); conference call with M. Treseder re: LME rules (.2); review economic consulting firm's list of third part documents needed (.4); conference call with J. Blumenfeld re: preparation for call with co-chairs and issues coming out of Exide interviews (.6)	2.60	1,625.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 15
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	07/28/14	PK	E-mails exchange with J. Blumenfeld and M. Hahn re: lead price investigation	0.40	282.00
B120	07/29/14	EJW	Conference with E. Chafetz re: status of lead investigation	0.20	77.00
B120	07/29/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of lead investigation	0.20	118.00
B120	07/29/14	JB	Discussion with LS team on Lead Pricing Investigation	0.80	768.00
B120	07/29/14	MJH	Review economist document categories and edit Metro requests (1.1); conference call with P. Kizel re: lead investigation status (.6); e-mail J. Blumenfeld re: co-chair call preparations (.1); participate in co-chair conference call (1.1); conference call with P. Kizel re: status (.1)	3.00	1,875.00
B120	07/29/14	PK	Telephone conference with economist and J. Blumenfeld and M. Hahn re: lead price investigation update	0.60	423.00
B120	07/29/14	PK	Review e-mail from B. Mendelson (Akin) re: status of 10-K filing in light of inventory investigation	0.10	70.50
B120	07/29/14	PK	Telephone conference with J. Blumenfeld, M. Hahn and co-chairs re: lead price investigation status	0.70	493.50
B120	07/30/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: questions regarding lead investigation	0.10	59.00
B120	07/30/14	JB	Discussion with LS team on Lead Pricing Investigation	0.60	576.00
B120	07/30/14	JB	Call with economic consultant and timing and process issues in Lead Pricing Investigation	0.60	576.00
B120	07/30/14	MJH	Review pleading in crude oil market manipulation case and Commodities and Exchange Act citations (3.3); participate in conference call with J. Blumenfeld re: lead acquisition issues and strategy (.7); participate in two conference call with economists (1.4); review article circulated by A. Sole (.1); participate in committee conference call (.2); research and summarize issues re: lead and aluminum queues (1.9)	7.60	4,750.00
B120	07/30/14	PK	E-mail to Akin requesting KPMG materials presented to audit committee re: Canon Hollow inventory issue	0.20	141.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 16
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120	07/30/14	PK	Exchange e-mails with E. Bell re: KPMG materials presented to audit committee re: Canon Hollow inventory issue	0.20	141.00
B120	07/30/14	PK	Telephone conference with economist and J. Blumenfeld and M. Hahn re: status of lead investigation	0.80	564.00
B120	07/30/14	PK	Phone call with E. Chafetz re: questions re: lead investigation	0.10	70.50
B120	07/31/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender, J. Blumenfeld (partial) and M. Hahn re: update on lead investigation	0.50	295.00
B120	07/31/14	GB	Call with M. Hahn and J. Blumenfeld re: lead pricing litigation strategy	0.50	427.50
B120	07/31/14	JB	Discussion with M. Hahn on issues in Lead Pricing Investigation	0.80	768.00
B120	07/31/14	JB	Interview with N. Iuanow (Exide) on Europe issues in Lead Pricing Investigation	2.00	1,920.00
B120	07/31/14	MJH	Conference call with J. Blumenfeld re: lead acquisition issues (.4); participate in LS strategy conference call (.5); prepare for and participate in telephonic interview of Exide employee (2.4); research and summarize warehouse queue issues (3.7); conference call with J. Blumenfeld re: document requests (.2)	7.20	4,500.00
Total B120 - Asset Analysis and Recovery				217.90	\$139,187.50

B120A Investigation of Prepetition Lenders

B120A	07/02/14	ESC	Review correspondence between MCAM and the debtor re: additional diligence needed	0.10	59.00
B120A	07/03/14	EJN	Review and comment on draft stipulation re: prepetition liens	1.30	624.00
B120A	07/03/14	EJN	Discuss comments to lien stipulation with E. Chafetz	0.30	144.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 17
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120A	07/08/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Worenklein re: proposed letter to board regarding intellectual property infringement	0.10	59.00
B120A	07/09/14	EJN	E-mails with E. Chafetz re: scope of foreign counsel review of pre-petition notes agent's liens	0.40	192.00
B120A	07/09/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to R. Paradiso re: re: letter to board related to intellectual property infringement claims	0.10	59.00
B120A	07/16/14	EJN	Discuss comments to lien stipulation with G. Bender and E. Chafetz	0.40	192.00
B120A	07/19/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to O. Nitzan re: call to discuss scope of noteholders' liens on intellectual property lien issues	0.10	59.00
B120A	07/28/14	EJN	Discuss comments to lien stipulation with counsel to pre-petition noteholders	0.80	384.00
B120A	07/28/14	EJN	Discuss comments to lien stipulation with G. Bender and E. Chafetz	0.20	96.00
B120A	07/30/14	EJN	E-mails and discussions with M. Montague re: real estate-related comments to lien stipulation	0.40	192.00
B120A	07/30/14	MEM	Review property information for Texas, Georgia and PA; e-mail with E. Newlands re: same; online search re: information for Saylor Farms property in PA as well as TX and GA property	3.00	1,560.00
B120A	07/31/14	MEM	Continue online search re: PA property (.6); online search re: MO property (.4); review loan documents(1.9); e-mail with E. Newlands re: same (.2)	3.10	1,612.00
Total B120A - Investigation of Prepetition Lenders				10.30	\$5,232.00

B120B IP Asset Analysis

B120B	07/01/14	ESC	Review documents associated with MCAM's diligence status	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/02/14	GB	Discussions with E. Chafetz re: call with co-chairs and MCAM	0.20	171.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 18
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120B	07/02/14	GB	Communicate with O. Nitzan re: MCAM follow up diligence	0.20	171.00
B120B	07/02/14	GB	Review materials re: MCAM sent by Esopus	0.30	256.50
B120B	07/02/14	GB	Review exchange of e-mails between A&M and MCAM re: continuing due diligence	0.20	171.00
B120B	07/02/14	KAR	Draft e-mail to PwC re: MCAM references	0.30	265.50
B120B	07/02/14	KAR	Telephone conference with E. Schwartz re: MCAm references	0.20	177.00
B120B	07/02/14	KAR	Telephone conference with E. Schwartz re: disclosure of MCAm report	0.20	177.00
B120B	07/03/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to M. Kessler re: documents associated with MCAM's presentation to the committee	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/03/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender, J. Mitchell, O. Nitzan, M. Henkin, M. Strollo (PBGC) and A. Sole (Esopus) re: MCAM diligence issues	0.80	472.00
B120B	07/03/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to M. Kessler re: letter to debtor's board regarding potential intellectual property issues	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/03/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: MCAM issues	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/03/14	GB	Call with O. Nitzan and M. Henkin re: upcoming meeting with MCAM re: diligence and communications with same and R. Paradiso re: same	1.40	1,197.00
B120B	07/03/14	GB	Review MCAM response to A&M re: further diligence	0.20	171.00
B120B	07/03/14	GB	Communications with K. Ziman re: MCAM due diligence	0.20	171.00
B120B	07/04/14	GB	Communications with LS team and debtor re: upcoming meeting with MCAM in Virginia	0.40	342.00
B120B	07/05/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with MCAM due diligence status	0.20	118.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 19
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120B	07/05/14	GB	Numerous discussions with Zolfo and Guggenheim re: upcoming MCAM meeting in Virginia (.4) and call with R. Paradiso re: same (.1)	0.50	427.50
B120B	07/06/14	ESC	Review documents associated with M-Cam follow up meeting in Charlottesville, Virginia	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/06/14	RJP	Review of Exide patent matters re: MCAM presentation	6.00	4,350.00
B120B	07/07/14	EJW	Participate in conference call with G. Bender and R. Paradiso re: MCAM meeting	0.40	154.00
B120B	07/07/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with R. Paradiso re: letter to board addressing potential intellectual property issues	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/07/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: MCAM presentation in Virginia	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/07/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender, R. Paradiso and E. Worenklein re: preparation for MCAM meeting in Virginia	0.30	177.00
B120B	07/07/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: MCAM issues	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/07/14	GB	Call with R. Paradiso re: preparation for upcoming MCAM meeting	0.30	256.50
B120B	07/07/14	GB	Communications with O. Nitzan and D. MacGreevey re: preparation for upcoming MCAM meeting	0.30	256.50
B120B	07/07/14	GB	Prepare for meeting with MCAM re: patent review due diligence	1.20	1,026.00
B120B	07/07/14	RJP	Review of MCAM report	2.00	1,450.00
B120B	07/08/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: letter to board re: MCAM findings	0.10	38.50
B120B	07/08/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with MCAM's continued diligence	0.30	177.00
B120B	07/08/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel and E. Worenklein re: follow up meeting with MCAM in Virginia	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 20
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120B	07/08/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of MCAM meeting	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/08/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender re: status of MCAM meeting in Virginia	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/08/14	GB	Meetings in Charlottesville re: MCAM presentation	8.50	7,267.50
B120B	07/08/14	RJP	Meeting in Charlottesville re: MCAM presentation preparation	8.50	6,162.50
B120B	07/09/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender re: letter to board related to potential intellectual property infringement claims	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/09/14	ESC	Phone call to R. Paradiso re: comments to letter regarding potential intellectual property issues	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/09/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: recap of MCAM meeting	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/09/14	GB	Discuss MCAM issues with LS team, Guggenheim and Zolfo	1.00	855.00
B120B	07/09/14	GB	Conference with E. Chafetz re: recap of MCAM meeting	0.20	171.00
B120B	07/09/14	KAR	Conference call re: MCAM presentation with committee professionals	1.00	885.00
B120B	07/09/14	RJP	Review of patent matters	1.50	1,087.50
B120B	07/10/14	AMB	E-mails re: M-CAM issue and related issues	0.50	350.00
B120B	07/10/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: valuation of Debtor's intellectual property by MCAM	0.30	177.00
B120B	07/10/14	ESC	Review documents associated with MCAM valuation	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/11/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: recap of call with committee co-chairs regarding MCAM valuation strategy	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 21
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120B	07/11/14	GB	Call with S. Thompson (PWC) re: MCAM and offset transaction practice	0.80	684.00
B120B	07/11/14	PK	Review e-mail summary re: call with S. Thompson (PwC) re: MCAM and offset transaction experience	0.10	70.50
B120B	07/11/14	PK	Telephone conference with S. Thompson (PwC) re: MCAM and offset transaction experience	0.80	564.00
B120B	07/12/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with M. Boxer re: status of MCAM due diligence	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/12/14	RST	E-mails to LS and co-chairs re: M-CAM issues	0.40	288.00
B120B	07/14/14	KAR	Telephone conference with PriceWaterhouse Coopers re: MCAM experience	0.30	265.50
B120B	07/14/14	RJP	Review of MCAM letter and IP matters	0.80	580.00
B120B	07/15/14	ESC	Review and discuss with G. Bender letter to board re: IP issues identified by MCAM	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/15/14	GB	Communicate with Guggenheim re: status of MCAM diligence and open issues re: same	0.30	256.50
B120B	07/15/14	GB	Review and discuss with E. Chafetz letter to board re: IP issues	0.20	171.00
B120B	07/15/14	PK	Review e-mail chain from MCAM/Debtor and Guggenheim re: providing due diligence to MCAM	0.20	141.00
B120B	07/15/14	PK	Review draft letter re: potential IP issues	0.20	141.00
B120B	07/16/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with the status of MCAM's diligence	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/16/14	ESC	Revise letter to the board concerning potential intellectual property infringement to incorporate various parties comments	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/16/14	RJP	Review of Exide IP matters	2.50	1,812.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 22
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120B	07/18/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel and G. Bender re: finalizing letter to the debtor's board re: potential intellectual property issues	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/18/14	RJP	Review of MCAM matters	1.00	725.00
B120B	07/19/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with MCAM's diligence and various potential issues with debtor's United Arab Emirates operations	0.40	236.00
B120B	07/19/14	ESC	Review plea agreement entered into by Tyco re: FCPA and relevance to debtor's UAE operations	0.70	413.00
B120B	07/19/14	PK	Review several e-mails from K. Rosen re: MCAM issues and information needed for due diligence	0.30	211.50
B120B	07/20/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with UAE diligence re: MCAM investigation	0.30	177.00
B120B	07/20/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender re: drafting letter to debtor's counsel re: obtaining documents and information related to the debtor's UAE operations	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/20/14	PK	Review e-mail from M. Henkin re: UAE JV issues	0.20	141.00
B120B	07/21/14	ESC	Discuss with G. Bender and P. Kizel draft letter to debtor re: due diligence re: Mid East JVs	0.30	177.00
B120B	07/21/14	ESC	Review and revise letter to Skadden re: due diligence regarding Middle East joint venture	0.60	354.00
B120B	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel and G. Bender re: questions regarding letter to the board re: potential intellectual property infringement identified by MCAM	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/21/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to counsel for the debtor's board of directors re: potential intellectual property infringement claims	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/21/14	ESC	Review comments from Guggenheim and Zolfo to the letter to the debtor's counsel re: obtaining discovery related to the debtor's various foreign business ventures in connection with MCAM IP process	0.30	177.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 23
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120B	07/21/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to O. Nitzan re: status of obtaining documents related to UAE joint venture and counsel participation on MCAM calls	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender re: call to discuss intellectual property assets with MCAM	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: status of MCAM's diligence	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/21/14	GB	Discuss with E. Chafetz and P. Kizel draft letter to debtor re: due diligence re: Mid East JVs	0.30	256.50
B120B	07/21/14	PK	Confer with E. Chafetz re: draft due diligence request re: Middle East joint ventures	0.30	211.50
B120B	07/21/14	PK	Work on drafts of letter requesting documents and information regarding any joint business relationships in particular in Middle East in connection with MCAM IP process	1.80	1,269.00
B120B	07/21/14	PK	Discuss with G. Bender and E. Chafetz draft letter to debtor re: due diligence re: mid east JVs	0.30	211.50
B120B	07/22/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Schwartz and M. Strollo re: letter to debtor's counsel requesting documents associated with the debtor's foreign joint ventures and similar relationships	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/22/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: status of MCAM's investigation	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/22/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender and P. Kizel re: finalizing letter to debtor's counsel requesting documents associated with the debtor's foreign joint ventures and similar relationships	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/22/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: letter to debtor's counsel regarding due diligence foreign business relationships	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/22/14	ESC	Review documents and correspondence associated with the debtor's foreign joint ventures (and similar arrangements)	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/22/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to K. Ziman re: letter requesting due diligence related to debtor's foreign business relationships	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 24
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120B	07/22/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with letter to the Debtor's board regarding potential intellectual property infringement	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/22/14	GB	Discuss letter to debtor re: MCAM diligence with E. Chafetz	0.20	171.00
B120B	07/22/14	GB	E-mail exchange with E. Chafetz and P. Kizel re: finalizing letter to debtor's counsel requesting documents associated with the debtor's foreign joint ventures and similar relationships	0.10	85.50
B120B	07/22/14	KAR	Review due diligence list for MCAM process	0.40	354.00
B120B	07/22/14	PK	E-mail exchange with G. Bender and E. Chafetz re: letter to debtor's counsel requesting documents associated with the debtor's foreign joint ventures and similar relationships	0.10	70.50
B120B	07/23/14	ESC	Review document and correspondence associated with the status of the MCAM investigation	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/23/14	ESC	Conferences with E. Worenklein re: status of MCAM diligence	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/23/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: status of MCAM diligence	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/23/14	ESC	Discuss results of call re: MCAM diligence issues with P. Kizel and G. Bender	0.40	236.00
B120B	07/23/14	GB	Discuss results of call re: MCAM diligence issues with E. Chafetz (.2) and P. Kizel (.2)	0.40	342.00
B120B	07/23/14	PK	Discuss results of call re: MCAM diligence issues with E. Chafetz and G. Bender	0.40	282.00
B120B	07/24/14	EJN	Participate in discussion with MCAM re: intellectual property assets and related lien issues	0.40	192.00
B120B	07/24/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with with O. Nitzan re: call with MCAM re: liens and the FCPA issues	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/24/14	ESC	Participate in call with M-Cam, P. Laroche of Guggenheim, and P. Kizel, G. Bender and K. Rosen of Lowenstein re: information learned during diligence about debtor's middle eastern business	0.50	295.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 25
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120B	07/24/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: MCAM diligence update	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/24/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: recap of call with MCAM re: diligence status	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/24/14	ESC	Participate in MCAM update call with representatives of the debtor (Skadden and A&M) and committee (Lowenstein, Zolfo, Guggenheim)	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/24/14	ESC	Review document/information list from MCAM re: middle east due diligence	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/24/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of MCAM diligence and open issues	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/24/14	GB	Call with MCAM re: UAE issues	0.40	342.00
B120B	07/24/14	GB	Participate in call with D. Martin of M-Cam, P. Laroche of Guggenheim, and P. Kizel, E. Chafetz and K. Rosen of Lowenstein re: information learned during diligence about debtor's middle eastern business	0.50	427.50
B120B	07/24/14	KAR	Participate in call with D. Martin of M-Cam, P. Laroche of Guggenheim, and P. Kizel, G. Bender and E. Chafetz of Lowenstein re: information learned during diligence about debtor's middle eastern business	0.50	442.50
B120B	07/24/14	PK	Telephone conference with MCAM and LS team and E. Schwartz re: status of document review and issues	0.50	352.50
B120B	07/24/14	PK	Telephone conference with J. Mazza re: due diligence re: Middle East joint venture	0.30	211.50
B120B	07/24/14	PK	Telephone conference with S. Thompson re: document issues related to MCAM IP analysis	0.20	141.00
B120B	07/24/14	RJP	Review of IP matters(.3); telephone conference with MCAM (.5)	0.80	580.00
B120B	07/25/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: outstanding MCAM issues	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/25/14	GB	Review MCAM diligence request of debtor	0.20	171.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 26
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120B	07/25/14	GB	Communications with E. Schwartz re: Al Dobowi information in connection with MCAM IP process	0.20	171.00
B120B	07/25/14	PK	Phone call with E. Chafetz re: outstanding MCAM issues	0.10	70.50
B120B	07/25/14	PK	Review e-mail from Guggenheim re: information requested for IP monetization process	0.40	282.00
B120B	07/25/14	PK	Review e-mails from E. Schwartz re: mideast JV documents	0.30	211.50
B120B	07/25/14	PK	Telephone conference with S. Thompson and E. Chafetz re: mideast JV issues	0.50	352.50
B120B	07/25/14	PK	E-mail to Guggenheim (.2), Review e-mail from M. Henkin (.1), telephone call with M. Henkin (.2), telephone call with O. Niztan (.1) re: mideast joint venture documents and plan issues	0.60	423.00
B120B	07/25/14	PK	Exchange e-mails with P. LaRoach re: certain joint venture documents	0.20	141.00
B120B	07/26/14	ESC	Begin reviewing MCAM's updated diligence list	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/26/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with MCAM's diligence list and other open issues	0.20	118.00
B120B	07/28/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to team re: documents for UAE JV diligence	0.30	115.50
B120B	07/28/14	EJW	Review and summarize documents related to Exide's UAE JV	0.60	231.00
B120B	07/28/14	ESC	Review MCAM's due diligence list	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/28/14	PK	Review information re: Exide mideast JV partner	0.30	211.50
B120B	07/29/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with MCAM's diligence efforts	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/29/14	ESC	Review additional middle east distributor agreements re: MCAM due diligence	0.30	177.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 27
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B120B	07/29/14	ESC	Review update on status of MCAM's diligence	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/29/14	PK	E-mail to Guggenheim re: request to obtain certain information from MCAM and review response	0.10	70.50
B120B	07/30/14	ESC	Review letter from R. Caruso in response to Committee letter regarding intellectual property issues	0.50	295.00
B120B	07/30/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to R. Paradiso re: letter in response to intellectual property issues	0.10	59.00
B120B	07/30/14	PK	Review letter from R. Caruso in response to Committee letter re: certain IP asset issues	0.20	141.00
B120B	07/31/14	PK	Review e-mail from D. Pratt (MCAM) to C. Turner (A&M) re: documents/information needed	0.20	141.00
B120B	07/31/14	PK	Telephone conference with J. Mazza re: due diligence requested by MCAM and LS re: IP assets (.2), e-mail to J. Mazza re: IP asset documents (.2), review e-mail from J. Mazza in response (.1)	0.50	352.50
B120B	07/31/14	RJP	Review of Exide IP letter and consideration of response	1.20	870.00
B120B	07/31/14	WJ	Review KPMG fee application for information regarding Debtor's Middle East joint venture (1.2) and e-mail to P. Kizel re: same	1.40	168.00
Total B120B - IP Asset Analysis				71.90	\$51,677.00

B140 Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings

B140	07/16/14	ESC	Review motion for relief from the stay filed by D. McCall to pursue state court action	0.30	177.00
B140	07/17/14	EJW	Review McCall lift stay motion	0.20	77.00
B140	07/23/14	EJW	Conference with E. Chafetz re: status of the Wattles lift stay motion	0.10	38.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 28
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B140	07/23/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of the Wattles lift stay motion	0.10	59.00
B140	07/23/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: status of the DeLage motion to assume/reject lease agreement	0.10	59.00
B140	07/23/14	ESC	Review notice of service of discovery filed by The Wattles Company	0.10	59.00
Total B140 - Relief from Stay/Adequate Protection Proceedings				0.90	\$469.50

B150 Meetings of and Communication with Creditors

B150	07/01/14	EJW	Incorporate edits and comments to draft minutes from P. Kizel	0.40	154.00
B150	07/01/14	EJW	Confer with P. Kizel re: Committee minutes and agenda	0.40	154.00
B150	07/01/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with D. Jury re: questions about upcoming committee call on July 2, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/01/14	ESC	Review documents in preparation for July 2, 2014 committee call	0.20	118.00
B150	07/01/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with with P. Kizel re: update from T. Strang regarding environmental liabilities	0.10	59.00
B150	07/01/14	ESC	Review Zolfo/Guggenheim operation updates in advance of July 2nd Committee call	0.20	118.00
B150	07/01/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings	1.60	616.00
B150	07/02/14	EJW	Participate in weekly Committee call	1.50	577.50
B150	07/02/14	EJW	Draft minutes of Committee call	1.30	500.50
B150	07/02/14	EJW	E-mail exchange with Skadden re: Committee expense reimbursement	0.20	77.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 29
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/02/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with K. Rosen re: recap of call with committee co-chairs (A. Sole of Esopus and M. Strollo of the PBGC), M. Henkin and J. Mitchell re: recap of meeting with noteholders	0.20	118.00
B150	07/02/14	ESC	Participate in weekly committee call with committee members and their professionals and committee professionals (Lowenstein, Guggenheim, and Zolfo)	1.50	885.00
B150	07/02/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: preparation for weekly committee call	0.30	177.00
B150	07/02/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: correspondence between the Debtor and MCAM related to MCAM diligence	0.20	118.00
B150	07/02/14	GB	Review and comment on daily docket report	0.20	171.00
B150	07/02/14	GB	Meet with E. Chafetz to prepare for upcoming committee call re: pending matters	0.40	342.00
B150	07/02/14	GB	Participate on committee call re: various pending matters including MCAM, environmental, plan issues and business update	1.50	1,282.50
B150	07/02/14	JB	Attend meeting of UCC for Lead Pricing Investigation	1.00	960.00
B150	07/02/14	KAR	Review Zolfo Cooper/Guggenheim report for today's creditors committee conference call	0.60	531.00
B150	07/02/14	KAR	Review and respond to A. Sole re: disclosure of MCam report	0.30	265.50
B150	07/02/14	KAR	Telephone conference with L. Eisenberg re: MCam report	0.40	354.00
B150	07/02/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	0.60	231.00
B150	07/02/14	MJH	Participate in portion of Committee call	0.20	125.00
B150	07/02/14	PK	Review e-mails from co-chair re: court hearing today	0.20	141.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 30
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/02/14	PK	Prepare for (.3) and participate in committee call (1.5)	1.80	1,269.00
B150	07/03/14	EJW	Draft, edit and revise daily docket e-mail to committee re: substantive pleadings filed, including motion to amend the DIP and supporting exhibits	2.30	885.50
B150	07/03/14	ESC	Revise discussion in minutes related to approval of the June 9th minutes	0.10	59.00
B150	07/03/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: proposed findings and decisions for both order for abatement actions initiated by the SCAQMD	0.20	118.00
B150	07/03/14	GB	Call with co-chairs and Guggenheim re: MCAM discussions re: backup	0.20	171.00
B150	07/03/14	GB	Respond to creditor inquiries re: status of case	0.40	342.00
B150	07/03/14	PK	Attend weekly committee/debtor professionals call	1.00	705.00
B150	07/03/14	PK	E-mail to committee re: Canon Hollow inventory issue update	0.20	141.00
B150	07/03/14	PK	Review comment on daily docket report	0.20	141.00
B150	07/04/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: revisions to daily docket report	0.20	118.00
B150	07/04/14	GB	Review and comment on 7/3/14 daily docket report	0.20	171.00
B150	07/05/14	ESC	Revise, finalize and send out daily docket report	0.20	118.00
B150	07/07/14	EJW	Participate in committee co-chair call	0.60	231.00
B150	07/07/14	EJW	Draft and edit daily docket report of substantive pleadings for the Committee	0.40	154.00
B150	07/07/14	ESC	Review daily docket report	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 31
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/07/14	ESC	Participate in co-chair call with M. Strollo (PBGC) and A. Sole (Esopus) and Lowenstein, Zolfo and Guggenheim professionals re: business and legal updates	0.50	295.00
B150	07/07/14	ESC	Review various documents in preparation for co-chair (M. Strollo of the PBGC and A. Sole of Esopus) call re: DIP amendment and other issues	0.30	177.00
B150	07/07/14	GB	Call with co-chairs re: debtor's proposed DIP amendment and upcoming MCAM meeting	0.50	427.50
B150	07/07/14	PK	Attend co-chairs call	0.50	352.50
B150	07/08/14	EJW	Update Committee contact list and circulate	0.30	115.50
B150	07/08/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to team re: new committee member to be added	0.10	38.50
B150	07/08/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to team re: draft agenda for July 10th Committee call	0.10	38.50
B150	07/08/14	EJW	Phone call with P. Kizel re: Committee minutes and agenda	0.10	38.50
B150	07/08/14	EJW	Review and edit revised Committee minutes from July 2, 2014	0.20	77.00
B150	07/08/14	EJW	Draft agenda for July 10, 2014 Committee call	0.30	115.50
B150	07/08/14	EJW	Draft e-mail containing agenda to other Committee professionals	0.10	38.50
B150	07/08/14	EJW	Respond to e-mail from Zolfo re: Committee agenda	0.10	38.50
B150	07/08/14	ESC	Review proposed agenda for July 10, 2014 committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/08/14	ESC	Review proposed minutes for July 2, 2014 committee call	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 32
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/08/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with D. Jury re: proposed findings and decisions of the hearing board for both order for abatement actions initiated by the South Coast Air Quality Management District	0.20	118.00
B150	07/08/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	1.50	577.50
B150	07/08/14	PK	Attention to committee communications	1.00	705.00
B150	07/08/14	PK	Work on materials for committee call and e-mail to committee re: upcoming call	2.10	1,480.50
B150	07/09/14	EJW	Attend portion of MCAM presentation call with Committee	0.70	269.50
B150	07/09/14	EJW	Phone call with P. Kizel re: Committee agenda and minutes	0.10	38.50
B150	07/09/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee re: upcoming Committee call	0.10	38.50
B150	07/09/14	EJW	Draft and edit daily docket e-mail of substantive pleadings	0.40	154.00
B150	07/09/14	EJW	Phone call with Zolfo re: presentation materials	0.10	38.50
B150	07/09/14	EJW	Review update e-mail re: Canon Hollow overstatement issue	0.10	38.50
B150	07/09/14	ESC	Review Zolfo's materials for July 10, 2014 committee call	0.40	236.00
B150	07/09/14	ESC	Review proposed response to co-chairs questions regarding Cannon Hollow inventory issues	0.10	59.00
B150	07/09/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 8, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/09/14	ESC	Participate in call with committee co-chairs (M. Strollo and A. Sole) and Guggenheim/Zolfo professionals re: recap of MCAM meeting	1.50	885.00
B150	07/09/14	ESC	Review documents in preparation for July 10, 2014 committee call	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 33
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/09/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: supplemental materials for July 10, 2014 committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/09/14	GB	Call with co-chairs re: meeting with MCAM and strategy going forward	1.50	1,282.50
B150	07/09/14	GB	Review draft e-mail to committee re: A&M and Canon Hollow and respond to same	0.20	171.00
B150	07/09/14	PK	Review draft materials from committee professionals for upcoming committee call	0.80	564.00
B150	07/09/14	PK	Phone call with E. Worenklein re: Committee agenda and minutes	0.10	70.50
B150	07/09/14	RJP	Participatae in telephone conference with Committee	1.00	725.00
B150	07/10/14	AMB	Conferences with S. Thompson and G. Bender re: M-CAM evidence; prepare for conference call with client re: same	0.50	350.00
B150	07/10/14	EJW	Draft and revise daily docket e-mail to Committee of substantive pleadings	0.40	154.00
B150	07/10/14	EJW	Participate in weekly Committee call and take notes for minutes	1.80	693.00
B150	07/10/14	ESC	Participate in weekly committee call with various committee members and their professionals and Lowenstein, Guggenheim, and Zolfo professionals re: legal and business updates	1.80	1,062.00
B150	07/10/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel and G. Bender re: preparation for committee call (objection to DIP amendment/position on motion to appoint equity committee	0.40	236.00
B150	07/10/14	ESC	Review Guggenheim's outline for committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/10/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 9, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/10/14	GB	Call with committee professionals re: MCAM and DIP amendment and prepare for committee call	0.70	598.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 34
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/10/14	GB	Call with E. Chafetz and P. Kizel re: preparation for committee call re: various topics	0.40	342.00
B150	07/10/14	GB	Participate on creditors call re: various matters, including MCAM, lead investigation, business plan update, DIP amendment, environmental, et al. including plan issues, MCAM and DIP amendment	1.80	1,539.00
B150	07/10/14	GB	Phone call with P. Kizel and E. Chafetz re: preparation for committee call (objection to DIP amendment/position on motion to appoint equity committee)	0.40	342.00
B150	07/10/14	JB	Conference call with UCC to provide detailed update on Lead Pricing Investigation	0.60	576.00
B150	07/10/14	JB	Prepare for conference call with UCC for update on Lead Pricing Investigation	0.40	384.00
B150	07/10/14	JB	Review materials and notes to prepare for teleconference meeting of UCC	0.50	480.00
B150	07/10/14	JS	Participate in conference call with UCC re: Vernon update	1.50	960.00
B150	07/10/14	KAR	Participate in weekly conference call with creditors committee	1.50	1,327.50
B150	07/10/14	MJH	E-mail J. Blumenfeld re: preparation for Committee conference call (.2); participate in conference call with J. Blumenfeld to prepare for same (.5); participate in committee conference call (.5)	1.20	750.00
B150	07/10/14	PK	Prepare for and participate in weekly committee/debtor professionals' call	0.80	564.00
B150	07/10/14	PK	Telephone conference with G. Bender and E. Chafetz to prepare for committee call	0.30	211.50
B150	07/10/14	PK	Phone call with E. Chafetz and G. Bender re: preparation for committee call (objection to DIP amendment/position on motion to appoint equity committee)	0.40	282.00
B150	07/10/14	RJP	Telephone conference with Committee; preparation thereof	1.50	1,087.50

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 35
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/11/14	AMB	Conference call with client and others re: strategy in response to M-CAM report	1.00	700.00
B150	07/11/14	GB	Memo to co-chairs and environmental professionals and call with PWC re: MCAM	0.30	256.50
B150	07/11/14	KAR	Review e-mails from A. Sole re: other firms partnered / using MCAM	0.50	442.50
B150	07/11/14	KW	Review docket and send docket report to Committee indicating that no substantive pleadings have been filed	0.20	77.00
B150	07/11/14	KW	Review docket and send daily docket report indicating that no substantive pleadings have been filed	0.20	77.00
B150	07/13/14	PK	E-mail to committee re: request for adjournment of equity committee motion	0.10	70.50
B150	07/14/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to committee re: scheduling next Committee call	0.10	38.50
B150	07/14/14	EJW	Draft and edit minutes for July 10th Committee call	1.20	462.00
B150	07/14/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee member re: expense reimbursement approval	0.10	38.50
B150	07/14/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with with G. Bender, P. Kizel and E. Worenklein re: scheduling committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/14/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: status of next committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/14/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: proposed objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.20	118.00
B150	07/14/14	ESC	Phone call with committee co-chairs (M. Strollo and A. Sole) and Lowenstein, Guggenheim, Zolfo and MNAT professionals re: update on the MCAM diligence and lead investigation	0.60	354.00
B150	07/14/14	GB	Participate on call with committee co-chairs re: pending matters, including MCAM and environmental	0.50	427.50
B150	07/14/14	KAR	Telephone conference with A. Sole re: call from Kasen	0.20	177.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 36
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/14/14	KAR	Participate in weekly conference call with co-chairs	0.50	442.50
B150	07/14/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings to the Committee	0.60	231.00
B150	07/14/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings to Committee	0.60	231.00
B150	07/14/14	PK	Phone call with E. Chafetz re: status of next committee call	0.10	70.50
B150	07/14/14	PK	Prepare for (.2) and participate in cochair call (.5)	0.70	493.50
B150	07/14/14	PK	Draft e-mail to committee re: committee's statement in connection with requests for equity committee (.2); review and respond to e-mails re: Committee statement (.2)	0.40	282.00
B150	07/14/14	PK	Review responses from committee members re: request to adjournment equity committee motion	0.20	141.00
B150	07/15/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee re: scheduling next call	0.10	38.50
B150	07/15/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: preparation for next committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/15/14	GB	Call with A. Eaton re: possible meeting with senior noteholders and debtor and e-mail to committee advisors re: same	0.50	427.50
B150	07/15/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings to Committee	0.60	231.00
B150	07/15/14	PK	E-mail to committee re: equity committee motion status and request for adjournment	0.20	141.00
B150	07/15/14	PK	Review e-mail from committee member re: equity committee motion adjournment	0.10	70.50
B150	07/16/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to team re: scheduling next committee call	0.10	38.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 37
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/16/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 15, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/16/14	ESC	Review PBGC comments to letter to the board regarding potential intellectual property issues	0.10	59.00
B150	07/16/14	GB	Call with A. Sole re: upcoming meeting with senior notes advisors	0.20	171.00
B150	07/16/14	KAR	Participate in conference call with creditors committee re: A. Eaton meeting on Plan of Reorganization and DIP	0.50	442.50
B150	07/16/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	1.40	539.00
B150	07/17/14	ESC	Participate in weekly call with committee professionals (Guggenheim, MNAT, Lowenstein and Zolfo) re: strategy related to meeting with noteholders, objection to motion to amend DIP facilities and discovery	0.60	354.00
B150	07/17/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 16, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/17/14	KW	Draft daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	1.10	423.50
B150	07/17/14	PK	Prepare for and participate in weekly debtor/committee professionals call	0.90	634.50
B150	07/18/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 17, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/18/14	KAR	Telephone conference with A. Sole re: UAE	0.40	354.00
B150	07/18/14	KAR	Telephone conference with Ofir re: UAE	0.40	354.00
B150	07/18/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	1.20	462.00
B150	07/18/14	PK	Review e-mail from committee member re: MCAM progress and issues	0.20	141.00
B150	07/18/14	PK	Review and respond to e-mail from committee member re: DIP Amendment	0.20	141.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 38
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/19/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with A. Sole re: letter to the debtor's board re: alleged intellectual property infringement	0.10	59.00
B150	07/19/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: status of co-chair call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/20/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to co-chairs re: draft monthly fee application	0.20	77.00
B150	07/20/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel, G. Bender, K. Rosen, D. MacGreevey of Zolfo and M. Henkin and O. Nitzan of Guggenheim re: preparation for call co-chair call re: term sheet, MCAM, and lead investigation	0.30	177.00
B150	07/20/14	ESC	Participate in call with committee professionals (Lowenstein, Guggenheim, Zolfo and MNAT) re: preparation for co-chair call re: term sheet, MCAM and lead investigation	0.70	413.00
B150	07/20/14	KAR	Conference call to prepare for co-chairs call	0.80	708.00
B150	07/21/14	EJW	Draft agenda for July 23 2014 Committee call	0.30	115.50
B150	07/21/14	EJW	Confer with P. Kizel re: edits to draft Committee agenda	0.20	77.00
B150	07/21/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee co-chairs re: LS monthly fee application	0.10	38.50
B150	07/21/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee professionals re: Committee agenda	0.10	38.50
B150	07/21/14	EJW	Review and revise current version of Committee minutes	0.30	115.50
B150	07/21/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: preparation for the July 23, 2014 committee call, MCAM issues, and lead investigation status	0.30	177.00
B150	07/21/14	ESC	Review documents in preparation for the July 23, 2014 committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/21/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: strategy related to plan negotiations and related litigation	0.30	177.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 39
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/21/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to A. Sole re: letter to the board re: information related to debtor's joint ventures and similar arrangements	0.10	59.00
B150	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with M. Strollo of PBGC re: letter to debtor's board regarding potential intellectual property infringement	0.10	59.00
B150	07/21/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender and P. Kizel re: preparation for the co chair call with A. Sole and M. Strollo	0.10	59.00
B150	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: strategy related to participation of MCAM on call with committee co chairs	0.10	59.00
B150	07/21/14	ESC	Phone call with J. Blumenfeld, M. Hahn, G. Bender, P. Kizel and K. Rosen re: update on the economist's lead price manipulation investigation	0.40	236.00
B150	07/21/14	ESC	Participate in co chair (A. Sole and M. Strollo) call with G. Bender, P. Kizel and K. Rosen re: update on lead investigation and MCAM issues	0.60	354.00
B150	07/21/14	GB	Call with co-chairs and committee professionals re: MCAM and plan process	0.60	513.00
B150	07/21/14	GB	Communications with co-chairs re: senior note's plan	0.20	171.00
B150	07/21/14	GB	Phone call with P. Kizel and G. Bender re: preparation of the co chair call with A. Sole and M. Strollo	0.10	85.50
B150	07/21/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	0.80	308.00
B150	07/21/14	PK	Phone call with E. Chafetz and G. Bender re: preparation for the co chair call with A. Sole and M. Strollo	0.10	70.50
B150	07/21/14	PK	Review all responses from all committee members re: pending DIP motion	0.20	141.00
B150	07/21/14	PK	Review comment to committee call agenda from E. Bell	0.10	70.50
B150	07/21/14	PK	Review and respond to e-mail from committee member re: request for certain documents re: MCAM project	0.10	70.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 40
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/21/14	PK	Review/edit committee minutes from last call	0.20	141.00
B150	07/21/14	PK	Review/edit agenda for next committee meeting	0.20	141.00
B150	07/21/14	PK	Participate in co-chairs call with Guggenheim and Zolfo professionals	0.50	352.50
B150	07/22/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee re: reminder for call	0.10	38.50
B150	07/22/14	EJW	Revise Committee agenda to incorporate comments and edits	0.20	77.00
B150	07/22/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee containing Zolfo/Guggenheim presentation materials	0.10	38.50
B150	07/22/14	EJW	Phone call with unsecured creditor re: case status	0.20	77.00
B150	07/22/14	ESC	Review agenda for July 23, 2014 committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/22/14	ESC	Review and comment on Zolfo's materials for the July 23, 2014 committee call	0.30	177.00
B150	07/22/14	ESC	Review minutes from July 10, 2014 committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/22/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: preparation for committee call on July 23, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/22/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 21, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/22/14	ESC	Review various documents in preparation for committee call on July 23, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/22/14	GB	Call with A. Sole and K. Rosen re: plan structure issues	0.40	342.00
B150	07/22/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	2.10	808.50
B150	07/22/14	PK	Review e-mail from committee member re: plan related issue	0.10	70.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 41
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/22/14	PK	Review/comment on daily docket report	0.20	141.00
B150	07/23/14	EJW	Participate in Committee call and take notes for minutes	1.00	385.00
B150	07/23/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee re: letter to board of directors	0.20	77.00
B150	07/23/14	EJW	Prepare and review materials for Committee call	0.20	77.00
B150	07/23/14	ESC	Phone call with M. Himmel, P. Kizel and the committee co-chairs (A. Sole and M. Strollo) re: foreign corrupt practice act issues	0.40	236.00
B150	07/23/14	ESC	Revise e-mail to the committee re: letter to the debtor's board of directors re: intellectual property issues	0.20	118.00
B150	07/23/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel and E. Worenklein re: motion summaries and objection deadlines related to matters to be heard on August 22, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/23/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: valuation issues and recap of committee call	0.20	118.00
B150	07/23/14	ESC	Participate in weekly committee call with committee members and their professionals and committee professionals (Lowenstein, MCAM, Guggenheim, Zolfo) re: various legal and business updates	1.00	590.00
B150	07/23/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: preparation for committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/23/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 22, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/23/14	ESC	Review documents in preparation for weekly committee call	0.20	118.00
B150	07/23/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: preparation for committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/23/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to co-chairs re: valuing participation in rights offering	0.20	118.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 42
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/23/14	GB	Review ZC and other materials in preparation for committee call	0.40	342.00
B150	07/23/14	GB	Participate on creditors committee call and follow up re: plan term sheet process with J. Mitchell and D. MacGreevey	1.70	1,453.50
B150	07/23/14	JB	Participate in telephone meeting of UCC	0.50	480.00
B150	07/23/14	KAR	Participate in weekly call of the creditors committee	0.80	708.00
B150	07/23/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	0.50	192.50
B150	07/23/14	PK	Phone call with E. Chafetz re: valuation issues and recap of committee call	0.20	141.00
B150	07/23/14	PK	Phone call with E. Chafetz re: preparation for committee call	0.10	70.50
B150	07/23/14	PK	Prepare for and participate in committee call	1.30	916.50
B150	07/23/14	PK	Draft e-mail re: to committee member re: joint venture issue and MCAM process	0.40	282.00
B150	07/23/14	PK	Telephone conference with co-chairs re: status of MCAM status/process	0.50	352.50
B150	07/24/14	EJW	Revise e-mail to Committee re: letter sent to Board of directors	0.20	77.00
B150	07/24/14	EJW	Draft minutes for the July 23rd Committee call	1.20	462.00
B150	07/24/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: revisions to term sheet	0.20	118.00
B150	07/24/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 23, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/24/14	ESC	Review proposed e-mail to the committee re: letters to debtor's counsel and board related to intellectual property issues and obtaining documents/information in connection with foreign business operations	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 43
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/24/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: estimated values of the right to buy a specified portion of the reorganized Debtor at a range of hypothetical valuations	0.10	59.00
B150	07/24/14	ESC	Revise e-mail to committee co-chairs (A. Sole and M. Strollo) re: valuation of participation in rights offering	0.10	59.00
B150	07/24/14	ESC	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with committee professionals (Zolfo, Guggenheim and Lowenstein) re: business and legal updates including status of MCAM and plan term sheet issues	0.90	531.00
B150	07/24/14	KAR	Conference call with creditors committee	0.60	531.00
B150	07/24/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	0.60	231.00
B150	07/24/14	PK	Review/comment on letter to committee re: MCAM update	0.20	141.00
B150	07/24/14	PK	Review e-mail from committee member re: document request	0.10	70.50
B150	07/24/14	PK	Draft e-mail to committee re: Canon Hollow inventory issue	0.40	282.00
B150	07/24/14	PK	E-mail to committee members re: document request re: JV issues and MCAM	0.10	70.50
B150	07/24/14	PK	Review/comment on daily docket report	0.20	141.00
B150	07/25/14	ESC	Revise e-mail to the committee re: letters sent to Debtor's board of directors related to intellectual property and foreign business venture issues	0.10	59.00
B150	07/25/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Worenklein re: preparation for weekly committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/25/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 24, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/25/14	ESC	Review and comment on proposed e-mail to the committee re: middle east joint venture information	0.10	59.00
B150	07/25/14	GB	Review materials sent by Esopus re: Exide/JV issue	0.70	598.50

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 44
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/25/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	0.30	115.50
B150	07/25/14	PK	E-mail to committee re: 7th DIP amendment and resolution of objection to 6th amendment	0.20	141.00
B150	07/25/14	PK	Review e-mails from committee member re: mideast JV documents and related issues	0.30	211.50
B150	07/25/14	PK	Review daily docket report	0.10	70.50
B150	07/26/14	ESC	Review e-mail to the committee re: update on motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B150	07/28/14	EJW	Draft committee call reminder e-mail to the Committee	0.10	38.50
B150	07/28/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee members re: payment of expesne reimbursement	0.20	77.00
B150	07/28/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to co-chairs re: draft interim fee applications for filing	0.10	38.50
B150	07/28/14	EJW	Draft agenda for July 30, 2014 Committee call	0.30	115.50
B150	07/28/14	EJW	Revise agenda for July 30, 2014 Committee call to incorporate edits from P. Kizel	0.10	38.50
B150	07/28/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 28, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/28/14	ESC	Review proposed agenda for July 30, 2014 committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Worenklein re: preparation for committee call and agenda	0.10	59.00
B150	07/28/14	ESC	Review proposed agenda for July 30, 2014 committee call	0.10	59.00
B150	07/28/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee professionals re: valuation issues	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 45
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/28/14	GB	Call with A. Sole re: plan term sheet counter-proposal	0.40	342.00
B150	07/28/14	GB	Call with committee professionals re: plan counter proposal	0.40	342.00
B150	07/28/14	GB	Call with committee co-chairs re: various matters, including plan counter-proposal	0.70	598.50
B150	07/28/14	KAR	Participate in weekly conference call with co-chairs	0.70	619.50
B150	07/28/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	1.10	423.50
B150	07/28/14	PK	Attend co-chair call	0.80	564.00
B150	07/28/14	PK	Attention to agenda for committee call (.2) and minutes of last meeting (.2)	0.40	282.00
B150	07/29/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee re: presentation materials for the Committee call	0.10	38.50
B150	07/29/14	ESC	Begin preparing talking points for committee call re: Cannon Hollow investigation	0.90	531.00
B150	07/29/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: preparation for committee call and status of plan related research	0.30	177.00
B150	07/29/14	ESC	Phone call with committee co-chairs (A. Sole and M. Strollo) and J. Blumenfeld, P. Kizel and M. Hahn re: update on lead price manipulation investigation	1.10	649.00
B150	07/29/14	ESC	Multiple e-mails with P. Kizel, G. Bender and E. Worenklein re: information for circulation in advance of committee meeting	0.10	59.00
B150	07/29/14	ESC	Review documents in preparation for July 30, 2014 committee call	0.20	118.00
B150	07/29/14	GB	Call with P. Kizel re: prep for July 30, 2014 committee meeting	0.20	171.00
B150	07/29/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	0.30	115.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 46
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/29/14	PK	Telephone conference E. Bell re: upcoming committee call	0.20	141.00
B150	07/30/14	EJW	Begin drafting minutes for the July 30, 2014 Committee call	0.50	192.50
B150	07/30/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to team re: Committee call materials	0.10	38.50
B150	07/30/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Committee professionals re: upcoming Committee call	0.10	38.50
B150	07/30/14	EJW	Participate in Committee call and take notes for minutes; follow-up meeting to discuss Committee call	1.90	731.50
B150	07/30/14	ESC	Conferences with G. Bender re: preparation for committee call	0.20	118.00
B150	07/30/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: Cannon Hollow investigation	0.10	59.00
B150	07/30/14	ESC	Review documents in preparation for committee call	0.30	177.00
B150	07/30/14	ESC	Participate in weekly committee call with committee members and their individual professionals and committee professionals (Lowenstein, MNAT, Zolfo, and Guggenheim)	1.70	1,003.00
B150	07/30/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: Debtor's letter in response to Committee letter re: intellectual property	0.40	236.00
B150	07/30/14	ESC	Revise and finalize e-mail to the committee re: letter in response to intellectual property	0.10	59.00
B150	07/30/14	ESC	Further revisions to Cannon Hollow investigation talking points for the committee call	0.50	295.00
B150	07/30/14	ESC	Review Zolfo's comments on Cannon Hollow investigation bullet points	0.10	59.00
B150	07/30/14	ESC	Review Zolfo/Guggenheim committee call materials	0.20	118.00
B150	07/30/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 29, 2014	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 47
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/30/14	GB	Calls with P. Kizel re: prep for committee call	0.50	427.50
B150	07/30/14	GB	Participate on creditors committee call re: various matters, including business update, MCAM, lead investigation and plan term sheet	1.70	1,453.50
B150	07/30/14	JB	Call with UCC co-chairs on Lead Pricing Investigation	0.60	576.00
B150	07/30/14	JB	Call with A. Sole, UCC co-chair, on Lead Pricing Investigation	0.60	576.00
B150	07/30/14	JB	Committee call, including update on Lead Pricing Investigation	0.60	576.00
B150	07/30/14	JS	Participate in environmental discussion on conference call with committee	0.40	256.00
B150	07/30/14	KAR	Participate in portion of weekly creditor committee conference call	0.80	708.00
B150	07/30/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	2.80	1,078.00
B150	07/30/14	PK	Review e-mail from committee member re: MCAM work	0.10	70.50
B150	07/30/14	PK	Review presentation materials for tomorrow's committee call	0.50	352.50
B150	07/30/14	PK	Review/comment on daily docket report	0.20	141.00
B150	07/30/14	PK	Prepare for (.3) and participate in committee call (1.7)	2.00	1,410.00
B150	07/31/14	EJW	Complete draft of Committee minutes	0.60	231.00
B150	07/31/14	ESC	Review daily docket report for July 30, 2014	0.10	59.00
B150	07/31/14	ESC	Review correspondence from committee co-chairs re: debtor's response to letter related to potential intellectual property infringement claims	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 48
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B150	07/31/14	KW	Draft, revise and send daily docket report of substantive pleadings filed to Committee	0.60	231.00
B150	07/31/14	PK	Participate in Committee professionals call	1.00	705.00
B150	07/31/14	PK	Review/edit draft minutes from last committee call	0.30	211.50
B150	07/31/14	PK	Review/edit daily docket report	0.20	141.00
B150	07/31/14	PK	Review/comment on daily docket report	0.20	141.00
B150	07/31/14	PK	Exchange e-mails from committee members re: scheduling call in advance of meeting with other constituents	0.20	141.00
Total B150 - Meetings of and Communication with Creditors				131.80	\$81,963.50

B160 Fee/Employment Applications

B160	07/01/14	EJW	Review and comment on revised monthly fee application	0.30	115.50
B160	07/01/14	EJW	Review and comment on proposed order for fee applications and conform with fee examiner report	0.70	269.50
B160	07/01/14	EJW	Draft e-mail from Skadden re: edits to proposed interim fee order	0.10	38.50
B160	07/01/14	GCB	Revisions and edits to monthly fee application	1.60	320.00
B160	07/01/14	GCB	Numerous calls with P. Kizel re: monthly fee applications	1.00	200.00
B160	07/01/14	GCB	Numerous communications with L. Pami regarding fees and expenses in preparation of interim and monthly applications	1.10	220.00
B160	07/01/14	GCB	Review March fee application and prebill	0.90	180.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 49
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B160	07/01/14	GCB	Review monthly fee applications filed and add information to chart	1.00	200.00
B160	07/02/14	EJW	Mark-up proposed interim fee order to include committee member reimbursement	0.40	154.00
B160	07/02/14	GCB	Numerous discussions with team re: monthly fee applications and revisions to same	0.80	160.00
B160	07/02/14	GCB	Revised and edit monthly fee application	1.00	200.00
B160	07/02/14	GCB	Review and revise monthly prebill	2.50	500.00
B160	07/07/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: interim fee application deadlines	0.20	77.00
B160	07/07/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Skadden re: interim fee proposed order	0.10	38.50
B160	07/07/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: edits to proposed interim fee order	0.10	38.50
B160	07/07/14	EJW	Review and comment on exhibits to monthly fee application	1.60	616.00
B160	07/07/14	EJW	Conference with E. Chafetz re: interim fee application	0.10	38.50
B160	07/07/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: interim fee application	0.10	59.00
B160	07/07/14	ESC	Review proposed order approving interim fee applications	0.10	59.00
B160	07/08/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to team re: interim compensation order and fee examiner procedures	0.30	115.50
B160	07/08/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding May pre-bill	0.20	118.00
B160	07/08/14	GCB	Multiple discussions with P. Kizel re fee applications	0.50	100.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 50
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B160	07/08/14	PK	Work on LS 4th interim fee application outline	1.00	705.00
B160	07/09/14	EJW	Phone call with G. Buccellato re: fee examiner's recommendation and resolution	0.10	38.50
B160	07/09/14	EJW	Phone call with L. Pami re: May fee application	0.20	77.00
B160	07/09/14	EJW	Review and edit April fee application	0.30	115.50
B160	07/09/14	EJW	Phone call with G. Buccellato re: fee application	0.20	77.00
B160	07/09/14	GCB	Preparation and finalization of eleventh monthly fee application	1.50	300.00
B160	07/09/14	GCB	Review docket in connection to fee applications filed to date	0.50	100.00
B160	07/09/14	GCB	Preparation of fee application chart reflecting fee examiner reductions	1.50	300.00
B160	07/09/14	GCB	Numerous calls with E. Worenkelin in regards to fee applications and chart re fee examiner approval of fees and expenses	1.20	240.00
B160	07/09/14	GCB	Phone call with E. Worenklein re: fee application	0.20	40.00
B160	07/10/14	GCB	Confer with P. Kizel regarding outstanding fee applications	0.40	80.00
B160	07/10/14	PK	Attention to LS June monthly statement	1.20	846.00
B160	07/10/14	PK	Attention to LS May fee application	1.00	705.00
B160	07/14/14	EJW	Numerous calls with G. Buccellato and P. Kizel re: filing of monthly fee applications	0.50	192.50
B160	07/14/14	EJW	Communicate with P. Kizel re: LS April monthly fee statement, May statement and fourth interim fee application	0.20	77.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 51
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B160	07/14/14	GCB	Review numerous e-mails relating to fee applications for LS and Geosyntec to be filed	0.80	160.00
B160	07/14/14	GCB	Numerous calls with P. Kizel and E. Worenklein regarding filing of monthly fee applications	0.50	100.00
B160	07/14/14	GCB	Discussions with team in regards to fee application order granted	0.50	100.00
B160	07/14/14	GCB	Update fee application chart	1.00	200.00
B160	07/14/14	PK	Communicate with E. Worenklein re: LS April monthly fee statement, May statement and fourth interim fee application	0.20	141.00
B160	07/16/14	ESC	E-mail exchange and conference with E. Worenklein re: Lowenstein annual rate increase	0.10	59.00
B160	07/17/14	EJW	Review and edit May monthly fee application	0.60	231.00
B160	07/17/14	GCB	Preparation of monthly fee application	1.00	200.00
B160	07/18/14	EJW	Make final edits from P. Kizel to monthly fee application and proof read	0.20	77.00
B160	07/19/14	GCB	Review and edit monthly pre-bill for June, 2014	1.00	200.00
B160	07/20/14	GCB	Review and edit monthly pre-bill for June, 2014	3.00	600.00
B160	07/21/14	GCB	Attend to fourth interim fee application and discuss same with E. Worenklein and P. Kizel	0.80	160.00
B160	07/21/14	GCB	Update fee application chart for all professionals	2.10	420.00
B160	07/21/14	PK	Final review of LS May fee statement	0.20	141.00
B160	07/22/14	EJW	Review and edit draft of interim fee application	0.40	154.00
B160	07/22/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding Lowenstein May fee application	0.10	59.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 52
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B160	07/22/14	GCB	Attend to monthly fee applications filed and update chart	2.60	520.00
B160	07/22/14	GCB	Preparation of monthly fee application	1.70	340.00
B160	07/23/14	EJW	Phone call with L. Pami re: interim fee application	0.20	77.00
B160	07/23/14	GCB	Update fee application chart and review numerous fee applications filed on the docket	2.10	420.00
B160	07/24/14	EJW	Draft and edit 4th interim fee application	1.20	462.00
B160	07/24/14	EJW	Review revised interim fee application	0.20	77.00
B160	07/24/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to G. Buccellato re: final edits to interim fee application	0.10	38.50
B160	07/24/14	EJW	Phone call with P. Kizel re: fee examiner documents	0.10	38.50
B160	07/24/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to MNAT re: Lowenstein CNO to be filed	0.10	38.50
B160	07/24/14	GCB	Conference call with E. Worenklein regarding edits and modifications to fourth interim fee application	0.50	100.00
B160	07/24/14	GCB	Edit and modify fourth interim fee application	1.20	240.00
B160	07/24/14	GCB	Review docket and update fee application chart	1.20	240.00
B160	07/24/14	PK	Review and respond to e-mail re: CNO re: LS monthly fee statement	0.10	70.50
B160	07/24/14	PK	Review and edit final version of LS 4th interim fee statement (.4); communicate with E. Worenklein re: fee examiner's documents (.1)	0.50	352.50
B160	07/25/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: revised interim fee application	0.20	77.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 53
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B160	07/26/14	EJW	Review documents to be provided to the fee examiner	0.50	192.50
B160	07/28/14	EJW	Make additional edits to 4th interim fee application	0.10	38.50
B160	07/29/14	EJW	Make further edits to interim fee application to incorporate comments from P. Kizel	0.40	154.00
B160	07/29/14	EJW	Phone call with P. Kizel re: edits to interim fee application and economic consultant fee application	0.40	154.00
B160	07/30/14	EJW	Phone call with P. Kizel re: edits to interim fee application	0.10	38.50
B160	07/30/14	PK	Final review of LS 4th interim fee application	0.30	211.50
B160	07/30/14	PK	Call with E. Worenklein re: interim fee application	0.10	70.50
B160	07/31/14	GCB	Attend to fee application chart	0.30	60.00
Total B160 - Fee/Employment Applications				51.40	\$14,724.00

B165 Employment and Retention Applications - Others

B165	07/02/14	GB	Obtain LS and Geo fee information requested by A&M	0.20	171.00
B165	07/05/14	GB	Review communications from E. Chafetz to committee re: JPM engagement letter	0.30	256.50
B165	07/08/14	EJW	Conference with E. Chafetz re: questions regarding A&M's retention and related indemnity provisions	0.20	77.00
B165	07/08/14	EJW	Review A&M retention documents re: indemnification provision	0.30	115.50
B165	07/08/14	EJW	Confer with E. Chafetz re: indemnification issue and language	0.20	77.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 54
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B165	07/08/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding A&M's retention and related indemnity provisions	0.20	118.00
B165	07/09/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to team re: A&M retention application and order	0.20	77.00
B165	07/09/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: A&M retention application	0.10	38.50
B165	07/14/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to M. Boxer re: M-CAM retention documents	0.20	77.00
B165	07/18/14	AMB	Read MCAM retention documents, including motion papers and court order	0.50	350.00
B165	07/18/14	ESC	Phone call with J. Winnerman re: issues with ordinary course professional retention of Schnader Harrson	0.20	118.00
B165	07/21/14	EJW	Review and analyze Debtor's motion to retain Akin Gump	0.30	115.50
B165	07/21/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with the economist's retention re: privilege issues	0.10	59.00
B165	07/21/14	KAR	Review Akin retention papers and draft e-mail to team	0.40	354.00
B165	07/29/14	EJW	Review economist retention application and order	0.20	77.00
Total B165 - Employment and Retention Applications - Others				3.60	\$2,081.00

B175 Fee Applications and Invoices - Others

B175	07/01/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to MNAT re: economist fee application	0.20	77.00
B175	07/01/14	EJW	Phone calls with Skadden re: interim fee order	0.20	77.00
B175	07/01/14	EJW	Phone call with MNAT re: interim fee order	0.10	38.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 55
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	07/01/14	EJW	Review and comment on Geosyntec monthly fee application	0.30	115.50
B175	07/01/14	EJW	Phone call with O. Nitzan re: fee application hearing	0.10	38.50
B175	07/01/14	PK	Review A&M May monthly fee statement filed today	0.30	211.50
B175	07/02/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to G. Rubenstein re: Sierra retention order	0.10	38.50
B175	07/02/14	EJW	Draft e-mail re: economist monthly fee applications	0.10	38.50
B175	07/02/14	EJW	Phone call with Skadden re: Committee member reimbursement	0.20	77.00
B175	07/02/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Economist re: fee applications	0.10	38.50
B175	07/02/14	EJW	Phone call with Geosyntec re: edits to fee application	0.30	115.50
B175	07/02/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Laroche re: questions regarding the economic consultant's fee information	0.20	118.00
B175	07/02/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: economic consultant's fee application	0.10	59.00
B175	07/02/14	ESC	Revise e-mail to the economic consultant re: confirmation of filing of first fee applications	0.20	118.00
B175	07/03/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with the economist re: questions regarding fee application	0.10	59.00
B175	07/03/14	PK	Exchange e-mails with E. Worenklein re: need to include committee expense requests in order approving interim fees	0.20	141.00
B175	07/07/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: Geosyntec monthly fee application	0.10	38.50
B175	07/07/14	EJW	Phone call with Sierra Research re: fee application process	0.40	154.00
B175	07/07/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Sierra Research re: fee application process	0.20	77.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 56
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	07/07/14	EJW	Phone call with MNAT re: interim fee order	0.10	38.50
B175	07/07/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Skadden re: interim fee order comments	0.10	38.50
B175	07/07/14	ESC	Review information related to Schnader Harrison Segal & Lewis LLP's payments as an ordinary course professional	0.10	59.00
B175	07/07/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding Schnader Harrison special counsel fee payments	0.10	59.00
B175	07/07/14	GB	Review communications with E. Chafetz and Skadden re: Lazard fees re: DIP amendment	0.10	85.50
B175	07/08/14	EJW	Review e-mail from Skadden re: DIP fees	0.10	38.50
B175	07/08/14	EJW	Draft template for Sierra Research monthly fee application	0.80	308.00
B175	07/09/14	EJW	Phone call with P. Kizel re: interim fee applications for other professionals	0.10	38.50
B175	07/09/14	EJW	Review and comment on Sierra Research's first monthly fee application	0.30	115.50
B175	07/09/14	EJW	Draft template for economist interim fee application	0.90	346.50
B175	07/09/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: questions related to economist's fee application	0.10	59.00
B175	07/10/14	EJW	Compile exhibits for Ashurst fee application for fee examiner	0.30	115.50
B175	07/10/14	EJW	Respond to e-mail from E. Fay re: fee examiner request	0.10	38.50
B175	07/13/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to MNAT re: Ashurst fee application	0.10	38.50
B175	07/14/14	EJW	Phone call with MNAT re: Geosyntec monthly fee application	0.10	38.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 57
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	07/14/14	EJW	Draft e-mail containing interim fee order	0.10	38.50
B175	07/14/14	EJW	E-mail exchange with MNAT and P. Kizel re: fee applications for filing	0.30	115.50
B175	07/15/14	EJW	Review and summarize monthly fee application of Skadden	1.70	654.50
B175	07/15/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to Skadden re: Schander Harrison fees	0.20	77.00
B175	07/15/14	EJW	Conference with E. Chafetz re: questions re: JP Morgan (DIP agent) invoices	0.20	77.00
B175	07/15/14	ESC	Review King & Wood Mallson's invoice (foreign counsel for DIP agent, JP Morgan) from November 1, 2013 to February 10, 2014	0.10	59.00
B175	07/15/14	ESC	Review Mayer Brown's invoice for services provided in May 2014 for JP Morgan (DIP agent) related to London, Frankfurt and the Netherlands issues	0.10	59.00
B175	07/15/14	ESC	Review Richard Layton & Finger's invoice for May 2014 in relation to work as local counsel for JP Morgan (DIP agent)	0.20	118.00
B175	07/15/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding JP Morgan (DIP agent) invoices	0.20	118.00
B175	07/15/14	ESC	Revise e-mail to Debtor's counsel re: questions regarding Schnader Harrison fees	0.10	59.00
B175	07/15/14	ESC	Review invoice submitted by US counsel for DIP agent (Davis Polk) through May 31, 2014	0.10	59.00
B175	07/15/14	ESC	Review Skadden Arps' May fee application	0.90	531.00
B175	07/16/14	EJW	Phone call with Geosyntec re: fee application edits	0.20	77.00
B175	07/16/14	ESC	Finalize e-mail to G. Bender and P. Kizel re: issues with DIP agent fees	0.10	59.00
B175	07/16/14	ESC	Review fourth monthly fee application of Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A.	0.30	177.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 58
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	07/16/14	ESC	Finalize e-mail to G. Bender and P. Kizel re: issues with Schnader Harrison OCP payments	0.10	59.00
B175	07/16/14	PK	Review e-mail from E. Chafetz re: DIP agent fees	0.10	70.50
B175	07/17/14	EJW	Review, analyze and summarize monthly fee application of Lazard	0.30	115.50
B175	07/17/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to counsel for the debtor re: questions regarding Schnader Harrison fees	0.10	59.00
B175	07/17/14	ESC	Review Paul Weiss' June bill	0.10	59.00
B175	07/17/14	GB	Review Paul Weiss' June Bill	0.20	171.00
B175	07/18/14	EJW	Phone call with Sierra Research re: fee applications	0.20	77.00
B175	07/18/14	ESC	Review E. Worenklein's summary of Skadden's May fee application	0.10	59.00
B175	07/18/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: issues with the OCP retention of Schnader Harrison	0.10	59.00
B175	07/18/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with J. Winnerman re: questions regarding the Schnader Harrison ordinary course professional issues	0.10	59.00
B175	07/20/14	EJW	Review revised Sierra fee application	0.20	77.00
B175	07/20/14	ESC	Review documents associated with Schnader Harrison OCP fee issues	0.10	59.00
B175	07/21/14	EJW	Phone call with Geosyntec re: interim fee application questions	0.20	77.00
B175	07/21/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to G. Bender and P. Kizel re: issues with Schnader Harrison fees and failure to submit fee applications	0.30	177.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 59
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	07/21/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender re: comments to letter to the debtor re: obtaining discovery related to the debtor's various foreign business ventures	0.10	59.00
B175	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: questions regarding DIP agent's fees	0.10	59.00
B175	07/22/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to MNAT re: monthly fee application	0.10	38.50
B175	07/22/14	EJW	Review and comment on draft Geosyntec interim fee application	0.30	115.50
B175	07/22/14	ESC	Review monthly application for compensation for services rendered and for reimbursement of expenses of of Pachulski Stang Ziehl & Jones LLP as special conflicts counsel to the debtor	0.20	118.00
B175	07/23/14	PK	Review of KPMG April fee statement for joint venture related issues	1.20	846.00
B175	07/24/14	EJW	Mark-up and provide comments to Geosyntec fee application	0.20	77.00
B175	07/24/14	ESC	Phone call to counsel for the debtor re: questions regarding Schnader Harrison fees	0.10	59.00
B175	07/25/14	EJW	Review and summarize monthly fee application of King & Spalding	0.30	115.50
B175	07/25/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to economist re: interim fee applications	0.10	38.50
B175	07/25/14	ESC	Phone call with counsel for the debtor re: issues regarding Schnader Harrison OCP payments	0.20	118.00
B175	07/25/14	PK	Review King and Spalding monthly fee statement for June	0.20	141.00
B175	07/27/14	EJW	Respond to e-mail from economist re: interim fee application	0.10	38.50
B175	07/28/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: Sierra Research first monthly fee application	0.20	77.00
B175	07/28/14	PK	Review and respond to inquiry from M. Kenney re: Geosyntec expense item	0.10	70.50

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 60
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	07/29/14	EJW	Phone call with MNAT re: proposed economist interim fee application procedure	0.20	77.00
B175	07/29/14	EJW	Phone call with P. Kizel re: economist interim fee application	0.10	38.50
B175	07/29/14	EJW	Make edits to draft economist interim fee application	0.20	77.00
B175	07/29/14	EJW	E-mail exchange with E. Chafetz re: UST questions on Geosyntec fee application	0.20	77.00
B175	07/29/14	EJW	Review draft of Geosyntec June fee application	0.20	77.00
B175	07/29/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel and E. Worenklein re: questions regarding Geosyntec fee application raised by the US Trustee	0.10	59.00
B175	07/29/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: economist interim fee application	0.10	59.00
B175	07/29/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding Geosyntec fee application	0.10	59.00
B175	07/29/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding the economists' fee application	0.10	59.00
B175	07/29/14	ESC	E-mail exchange and phone call with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding economist fees	0.20	118.00
B175	07/30/14	EJW	Phone call with Sierra Resarch re: fee application questions	0.20	77.00
B175	07/30/14	EJW	Respond to e-mail from economist re: interim fee application	0.10	38.50
B175	07/30/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to MNAT re: additional interim fee application to be filed	0.10	38.50
B175	07/30/14	EJW	Review KPMG monthly fee application for Al Dobowi references	0.40	154.00
B175	07/30/14	EJW	Phone call with Geosyntec and E. Chafetz re: UST questions on fee application	0.20	77.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 61
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B175	07/30/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: economic consultant interim fee application	0.10	38.50
B175	07/30/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to economist re: final draft of interim fee application	0.10	38.50
B175	07/30/14	ESC	Phone calls with E. Worenklein to M. Berman of Geosyntec re: questions regarding expenses	0.20	118.00
B175	07/30/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding Geosyntec's fee application raised by the US Trustee	0.10	59.00
B175	07/30/14	ESC	Review portions of Geosyntec fee application relevant to the US trustee objection	0.10	59.00
B175	07/30/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding Geosyntec expenses raised by US Trustee	0.10	59.00
B175	07/30/14	PK	Review Newmark monthly fee statement for June	0.30	211.50
B175	07/31/14	PK	Review KPMG May fee statement	0.50	352.50
Total B175 - Fee Applications and Invoices - Others				21.40	\$10,497.00

B180 Avoidance Action Analysis

B180	07/01/14	ESC	Phone call to E. Horn re: coordinating with foreign counsel to address secured lenders, liens on certain foreign equity, foreign inventory and foreign intellectual property	0.10	59.00
B180	07/01/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Worenklein re: consulting foreign counsel to address foreign lien perfection issues	0.10	59.00
B180	07/01/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to foreign counsel re: obtaining information regarding perfection of liens on certain categories of foreign assets	0.10	59.00
B180	07/01/14	ESC	Review documents associated with the validity of the secured lenders' liens on certain foreign equity, foreign inventory and foreign intellectual property	0.30	177.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 62
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B180	07/02/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with J. Firmston of Ashurst re: information regarding noteholder's liens on foreign assets	0.10	59.00
B180	07/02/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: questions regarding noteholders' liens on foreign assets and feasibility research	0.20	118.00
B180	07/02/14	GB	Conference with E. Chafetz re: questions re: noteholder's liens on foreign assets and feasibility research	0.20	171.00
B180	07/03/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Newlands re: status of comments to stipulation with noteholders related to encumbered and unencumbered collateral	0.10	59.00
B180	07/03/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Newlands re: comments to stipulation with secured lenders	0.30	177.00
B180	07/03/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with foreign counsel re: questions regarding noteholders' liens on foreign collateral	0.10	59.00
B180	07/03/14	ESC	Review E. Newlands comments to stipulation addressing scope of secured noteholders' liens	0.30	177.00
B180	07/03/14	ESC	Prepare for and phone call with foreign counsel re: obtaining information about noteholders' purported perfection on various foreign assets	0.60	354.00
B180	07/07/14	EJW	Conference with E. Chafetz re: security agreement and UCC financing statement re: verifying noteholder's liens	0.10	38.50
B180	07/07/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: security agreement and UCC financing statement re: verifying noteholder's liens	0.10	59.00
B180	07/07/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Newlands re: questions regarding noteholders' security interests	0.10	59.00
B180	07/07/14	ESC	Review foreign counsel's analysis of lenders' security interests under English law	0.20	118.00
B180	07/07/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: status of stipulation with lenders related to encumbered and unencumbered collateral	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 63
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B180	07/07/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to foreign counsel re: scope of foreign liens to be reviewed	0.20	118.00
B180	07/08/14	EJW	Review e-mails from Ashurst re: lien investigation documents	0.20	77.00
B180	07/08/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Newlands re: documents evidencing noteholders' security interests re: relevance to complaint challenging liens and security interests	0.10	59.00
B180	07/08/14	ESC	Review documents evidencing noteholders' security interests	0.80	472.00
B180	07/08/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to foreign counsel re: documents evidencing noteholders' security interests (determining if certain assets are collateral under English, Portuguese, Spanish and German law)	0.20	118.00
B180	07/08/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Newlands re: questions regarding the security interests in the debtor's English assets	0.20	118.00
B180	07/08/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Newlands re: questions posed by foreign counsel related to perfection of lien on certain assets under English law	0.10	59.00
B180	07/08/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to foreign counsel re: additional information needed to analyze foreign security interests	0.20	118.00
B180	07/09/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with foreign counsel re: questions regarding perfection of noteholders' liens on certain English assets	0.20	118.00
B180	07/09/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Newlands re: questions regarding noteholders liens on certain English assets	0.10	59.00
B180	07/10/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with foreign counsel re: questions regarding noteholders' security interests in assets located in England, Germany and France	0.10	59.00
B180	07/10/14	ESC	Review R. Paradisio's proposed comments to letter to board related to potential intellectual property infringement	0.10	59.00
B180	07/10/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Newlands re: questions regarding noteholders' security interests in assets located in England, Germany and France	0.10	59.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 64
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B180	07/12/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Newlands re: additoinal information needed to determine scope of lenders liens on foreign intellectual property assets	0.20	118.00
B180	07/13/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to foreign counsel re: verifying whether secured lenders liens are valid in certain countries	0.20	118.00
B180	07/14/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Newlands re: additional information needed to complete analysis of noteholders' liens on foreign assets	0.10	59.00
B180	07/14/14	ESC	Review various documents and revise letter to debtor's board regarding potential intellectual property infringement claims	0.30	177.00
B180	07/14/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender and R. Paradisio re: comments to letter to the board regarding potential intellectual property infringement claims	0.10	59.00
B180	07/14/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: stipulation relating to noteholders lies on various asset classes	0.10	59.00
B180	07/14/14	ESC	Finalize e-mail to foreign counsel re: information needed to complete analysis of noteholders' liens on foreign assets	0.20	118.00
B180	07/14/14	GB	Conference with E. Chafetz re: stipulation relating to note holders lies on various asset classes	0.10	85.50
B180	07/15/14	ESC	Further revisions to letter to the board addressing potential intellectual property infringement claims	0.10	59.00
B180	07/15/14	ESC	Review documents to determine current budget to investigate noteholders' liens	0.20	118.00
B180	07/15/14	ESC	Review E. Bell of Zolfo's comments to letter to the board concerning intellectual property issues	0.10	59.00
B180	07/15/14	ESC	Review R. Paradisio's additional comments to letter to board regarding potential intellectual property infringement claims	0.10	59.00
B180	07/15/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: proposed letter to the board re: potential intellectual property infringement claims	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 65
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B180	07/16/14	EJN	Phone call with E. Chafetz and G. Bender re: finalizing stipulation with secured lenders relating to scope of liens	0.40	192.00
B180	07/16/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: stipulation related to scope of secured lenders liens	0.10	59.00
B180	07/16/14	ESC	Further revisions to stipulation with lenders regarding scope of liens	1.70	1,003.00
B180	07/16/14	ESC	Phone calls and e-mails with E. Newlands re: questions and comments regarding scope of secured lenders' liens	0.10	59.00
B180	07/16/14	ESC	Review G. Bender's comments to stipulation with noteholders regarding scope of liens	0.20	118.00
B180	07/16/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Newlands and G. Bender re: finalizing stipulation with secured lenders relating to scope of liens	0.40	236.00
B180	07/16/14	GB	Review and comment on draft stip resolving lien dispute issues (.6); discuss stip related to scope of secured lender lien with E. Chafetz (.1)	0.70	598.50
B180	07/16/14	GB	Phone call with E. Newlands and E. Chafetz re: finalizing stipulation with secured lenders relating to scope of liens	0.40	342.00
B180	07/17/14	EJW	Review and circulate current version of lien stipulation	0.40	154.00
B180	07/17/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with L. Citron re: questions regarding lenders' lien on foreign equity re: finalizing stipulation with noteholders regarding scope of noteholders' liens	0.10	59.00
B180	07/17/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein and G. Bender re: finalizing stipulation with noteholders regarding scope of liens	0.20	118.00
B180	07/18/14	ESC	Review documents associated with the scope of the lenders' liens on foreign collateral	0.20	118.00
B180	07/18/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with R. Paradisio re: status of letter to the debtor's board concerning potential intellectual property infringement	0.10	59.00
B180	07/18/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to A. Sole and M. Strollo re: letter to the debtor's board regarding potential intellectual property infringement	0.20	118.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 66
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B180	07/22/14	ESC	Review most recent version of stipulation with noteholders addressing scope of liens	0.40	236.00
B180	07/23/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to G. Bender and P. Kizel re: potential causes of action, related relevant facts and discovery requests	0.20	118.00
B180	07/23/14	ESC	Continue preparing chart of potential causes of action	0.60	354.00
B180	07/24/14	ESC	Review status of response to stipulation regarding scope of noteholders' liens	0.10	59.00
B180	07/24/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Newlands re: call to discuss noteholder lien issues	0.10	59.00
B180	07/24/14	GB	Communications with A. Eaton re: lien stip	0.10	85.50
B180	07/25/14	ESC	Begin reviewing foreign counsel's analysis of how to perfect liens on certain asset classes in England, France, Spain and Germany	0.80	472.00
B180	07/25/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Newlands re: memo regarding how to perfect liens on certain asset classes in England, France, Spain and Germany	0.10	59.00
B180	07/25/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with foreign counsel re: scope of noteholders' liens on assets in England, France, Spain and Germany	0.10	59.00
B180	07/28/14	EJW	Phone call with E. Chafetz re: status of lien complaint and stipulation	0.10	38.50
B180	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Worenklein re: status of lien complaint	0.10	59.00
B180	07/28/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to counsel for the UNC and counsel for indentured trustee re: additional information needed re: lien investigation	0.30	177.00
B180	07/28/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: term sheet and supplement	0.20	118.00
B180	07/28/14	GB	Call with Paul Weiss and Foley, et al. re: lien stip	1.00	855.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 67
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B180	07/29/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Newlands re: documents provided by noteholders' and trustee's counsel re: security interests on certain real property	0.10	59.00
B180	07/29/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Newlands re: questions regarding lien stipulation	0.10	59.00
B180	07/29/14	ESC	Continue reviewing memorandum addressing perfection of security interests in certain classes of assets in England, Germany, Spain and France	0.60	354.00
B180	07/29/14	ESC	Review documents provided by noteholders' and trustee's counsel re: security interests on certain real property	0.20	118.00
B180	07/29/14	ESC	Revise e-mail to counsel for the indentured trustee and the UNC re: information needed to finalize stipulation related to scope of liens	0.10	59.00
B180	07/30/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Newlands re: scope of noteholders' liens on certain real estate	0.10	59.00
B180	07/30/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender to the noteholders' counsel re: status of lien stipulation	0.10	59.00
B180	07/30/14	GB	Phone call with E. Chafetz to the noteholder's counsel re: status of lien stipulation	0.10	85.50
B180	07/31/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with R. Paradiso re: debtor's response to letter related to potential intellectual property infringement claims	0.10	59.00
B180	07/31/14	ESC	Phone call with with P. Kizel re: intellectual property issues	0.10	59.00
B180	07/31/14	ESC	Review documents associated with scope of noteholders' liens	0.40	236.00
B180	07/31/14	PK	Phone call with E. Chafetz re: intellectual property issues	0.10	70.50
Total B180 - Avoidance Action Analysis				19.10	\$11,761.50

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 68
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
<u>B185 Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts</u>					
B185	07/23/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to E. Chafetz re: De Lage Landen motion to compel assumption	0.10	38.50
B185	07/24/14	EJW	Phone call with E. Chafetz re: status of DeLage Langdon motion to compel assumption/rejection of lease agreement	0.10	38.50
B185	07/24/14	EJW	Phone call with Skadden re: De Lage Langden motion status	0.20	77.00
B185	07/24/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Worenklein re: status of the DeLage Langdon motion to compel assumption/rejection of lease agreement	0.10	59.00
B185	07/25/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to counsel for De Lage Landen	0.10	38.50
B185	07/25/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: issues with De Lage Landon motion to compel assumption/rejection of leases	0.10	59.00
Total B185 - Assumption/Rejection of Leases and Contracts				0.70	\$310.50

B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)

B190	07/02/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: equity committee issues	0.20	118.00
B190	07/02/14	KAR	Draft e-mail to O. Nitzan re: references of MCam	0.20	177.00
B190	07/07/14	MJH	Address Zolfo Cooper privilege issues and e-mail re: same	0.30	187.50
B190	07/08/14	EJW	Compile and review pleadings re: motion to appoint an equity committee	0.40	154.00
B190	07/08/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to team re: ad hoc group of equity holders	0.20	77.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 69
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B190	07/08/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with proposed equity committee's retention of counsel	0.10	59.00
B190	07/08/14	ESC	Review certification of counsel in support of entry of order setting briefing schedule with respect to motions for appointment of equity committee	0.20	118.00
B190	07/08/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding equity committee submissions	0.20	118.00
B190	07/09/14	EJW	Proofread and edit statement re: appointment of equity committee	0.70	269.50
B190	07/09/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel and G. Bender re: response to request to appoint an equity committee	0.10	59.00
B190	07/09/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: response to request to form equity committee	0.10	59.00
B190	07/09/14	ESC	Begin drafting response to motion to appoint equity committee	3.60	2,124.00
B190	07/09/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: equity committee issues	0.40	236.00
B190	07/09/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: response to request to form equity committee	0.20	118.00
B190	07/10/14	ESC	Review proposed equity committee's motion to file documents under seal and conduct a closed hearing on the motion	0.40	236.00
B190	07/11/14	ESC	Review and comment on response to motion to appoint an equity committee	0.60	354.00
B190	07/11/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: comments to statement in response to motion to appoint equity committee	0.20	118.00
B190	07/11/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with the status of the equity committee hearing	0.10	59.00
B190	07/11/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: questions regarding response to request for equity committee	0.10	59.00
B190	07/11/14	GB	Review draft response to request for equity committee	0.20	171.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 70
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B190	07/11/14	PK	Telephone conference with O. Nitzen re: status of equity committee motion and preparation	0.30	211.50
B190	07/11/14	PK	Work on committee's statement in response to motions for equity committee	5.00	3,525.00
B190	07/11/14	PK	Numerous telephone calls with J. Kasen, counsel for ad hoc equity group regarding their position and status of retaining advisors	0.30	211.50
B190	07/12/14	EJW	Proofread and analyze draft equity committee statement	0.30	115.50
B190	07/12/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: comments to response to motion to appoint an equity committee	0.10	59.00
B190	07/12/14	GB	Review and comment on draft response to equity committee motion (.2); communications with LS, Guggenheim and ZC re:response to equity committee (.2)	0.40	342.00
B190	07/12/14	KAR	Review draft of response to equity committee	0.60	531.00
B190	07/13/14	EJW	Incorporate edits from various professionals to equity committee statement	1.30	500.50
B190	07/13/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: statement in response to motion to appoint equity committee	0.10	59.00
B190	07/13/14	ESC	Review various comments to committee statement in response to request to appoint an equity committee	0.20	118.00
B190	07/13/14	PK	Review and respond to e-mail from M. Henkin re: statement in connection with equity committee requests	0.20	141.00
B190	07/13/14	PK	Review and respond to e-mail from E. Bell re: statement in conneciton with equity committee requests	0.10	70.50
B190	07/13/14	PK	Review e-mail from d. MacGreevy re: statement in connection with equitiy committee requests	0.10	70.50
B190	07/13/14	PK	Review e-mail from O. Nitzan re: committee statement in connection with request for equity committee	0.10	70.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 71
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B190	07/13/14	PK	Telephone conference with J. Kasen, counsel for equity holders re: request for adjournment of motion to appoint equity committee	0.10	70.50
B190	07/13/14	PK	Review e-mail from counsel for equity holders seeking adjournment of equity committee motions	0.10	70.50
B190	07/14/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to MNAT re: equity committee statement	0.10	38.50
B190	07/14/14	EJW	Phone call with MNAT re: adjourning equity committee hearing	0.10	38.50
B190	07/14/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: further revisions to statement in response to motion to form equity committee	0.20	118.00
B190	07/14/14	ESC	Review and comment on E. Worenklein's revisions to statement in response to motion to form equity committee	0.10	59.00
B190	07/14/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Worenklein re: status of equity committee formation	0.10	59.00
B190	07/14/14	ESC	Review documents associated with committee's strategy related to statement in response to proposed formation of an equity committee	0.10	59.00
B190	07/14/14	GB	Review draft response to motion to appoint equity committee	0.30	256.50
B190	07/14/14	GB	Review pleadings re: adjournment and sealing of pleadings re: equity committee motion	0.30	256.50
B190	07/14/14	KAR	Telephone conference with J. Kasen re: equity committee	0.40	354.00
B190	07/14/14	PK	Review/edit committee's statement in connection with requests for equity committee	0.80	564.00
B190	07/15/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with timing of equity committee hearing	0.10	59.00
B190	07/15/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: status of equity committee formation	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 72
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B190	07/15/14	GB	Communicate with counsel for proposed equity committee re: motion for approval	0.30	256.50
B190	07/15/14	PK	Review e-mail from J. Kasen, counsel for equity group requesting adjournment of motion to appoint equity committee	0.20	141.00
B190	07/15/14	PK	Review e-mail from J. Mazza to J. Kasen re: request to adjourn equity committee motion	0.10	70.50
B190	07/16/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with motion to appoint equity committee	0.10	59.00
B190	07/18/14	KAR	Attend meeting with UNC at A. Eaton's office	2.50	2,212.50
B190	07/19/14	KAR	Review e-mail from A. Sole re: UAE matter	0.30	265.50
B190	07/19/14	KAR	Telephone conference with M. Himmel re: UAE matter	0.40	354.00
B190	07/25/14	KAR	Conference call with professionals re: Canon Hollow	0.50	442.50
Total B190 - Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)				24.90	\$16,760.00

B195 Non-Working Travel

B195	07/02/14	PK	Travel to/from Court in Delaware	4.00	1,410.00
B195	07/07/14	GB	Travel to Charlottesville for meeting with MCAM and debtor representatives re: patent due diligence	5.00	2,137.50
B195	07/07/14	RJP	Travel to Charlottesville, VA	5.00	1,812.50
B195	07/08/14	MJH	Travel to Washington D.C. for meeting with economic consulting firm and debtor's counsel re: investigation analysis and strategy	4.90	1,531.25
B195	07/09/14	GB	Travel back to NY from Charlottesville, VA MCAM meeting	3.50	1,496.25

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 73
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B195	07/09/14	RJP	Travel from Charlottesville, VA	4.00	1,450.00
B195	07/10/14	MJH	Return travel from meetings with economist in Washington, D.C.	3.70	1,156.25
B195	07/18/14	PK	Travel to/from New York to attend meeting at Paul Weiss (UNC counsel)	2.00	705.00
B195	07/22/14	PK	Travel to/from Court in Delaware for hearing today	5.00	1,762.50
B195	07/23/14	JB	Travel to Atlanta for interviews of Exide personnel	3.80	1,824.00
B195	07/23/14	MJH	Travel to Milton, Ga. for interviews with Exide personnel	4.00	1,250.00
B195	07/25/14	JB	Travel from Atlanta to home after interviews with Exide personnel	7.20	3,456.00
B195	07/25/14	MJH	Return travel from GA	4.00	1,250.00
Total B195 - Non-Working Travel				56.10	\$21,241.25

B200 - OperationsB210 Business Operations

B210	07/01/14	ESC	Review amended agenda for July 2, 2014 omnibus hearing	0.10	59.00
B210	07/02/14	ESC	Participate in call with the committee co-chairs (A. Sole of Esopus and M. Stollo of the PBGC), M. Henkin and J. Mitchell re: recap of meeting with noteholders	0.60	354.00
B210	07/03/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: strategy related to debtor professional and committee professional calls	0.10	59.00
B210	07/03/14	ESC	Review notes and review and comment on e-mail to the committee re: Cannon Hollow update	0.30	177.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 74
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B210	07/03/14	ESC	Review notice of filing of fourth quarterly statement regarding payments to ordinary course professionals	0.10	59.00
B210	07/03/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: Cannon Hollow issues	0.10	59.00
B210	07/03/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: strategy regarding weekly committee professional call	0.10	59.00
B210	07/03/14	GB	Review and comment on draft e-mail re: status of investigation at Canon Hollow	0.20	171.00
B210	07/03/14	PK	Review and respond to e-mail from D. MacGreevy re: Canon Hollow inventory issue	0.20	141.00
B210	07/03/14	PK	Draft e-mail to Zolfo and Guggenheim re: Canon Hollow inventory issue and review responses	0.20	141.00
B210	07/04/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with Cannon Hollow inventory issues	0.20	118.00
B210	07/07/14	EJW	Review and analyze Debtor's quarterly OCP statements	0.60	231.00
B210	07/07/14	ESC	Review bi-monthly reporting required under Exide's critical vendor, materialmen, shippers, foreign vendors and customer program orders	0.30	177.00
B210	07/08/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with the Cannon Hollow inventory issue	0.20	118.00
B210	07/09/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with Cannon Hollow inventory issues and potential causes of action related to same	0.20	118.00
B210	07/10/14	ESC	Participate in call with counsel to the debtor's board of directors (Akin Gump) re: update on Cannon Hollow inventory overstatement investigation	0.40	236.00
B210	07/10/14	PK	Telephone conference with E. Ivester, company inhouse counsel, Akin attorneys and E. Schwartz for update on Canon Hollow inventory issue	0.40	282.00
B210	07/10/14	PK	Telephone call with E. Schwartz re: Canon Hollow inventory issue	0.20	141.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 75
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B210	07/16/14	EJW	Conduct research re: lien stipulations	0.60	231.00
B210	07/16/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with Cannon Hollow inventory issue	0.10	59.00
B210	07/16/14	ESC	Review debtor's response to committee's request to make adjustments to business plan	0.80	472.00
B210	07/16/14	ESC	Phone call with counsel for debtor's board, P. Kizel and certain company representatives re: update regarding Cannon Hollow inventory issues	0.20	118.00
B210	07/16/14	KAR	Conference call with professionals re: accounting issues re: inventory	0.50	442.50
B210	07/16/14	PK	Prepare for and participate in call with Akin, Skadden and Exide in-house counsel re: Canon Hollow inventory issue	0.30	211.50
B210	07/16/14	PK	Telephone conference with E. Ivester re: call re: Canon Hollow inventory	0.10	70.50
B210	07/16/14	PK	Exchange e-mails with B. Mendelsohn (Akin) re: Canon Hollow inventory	0.20	141.00
B210	07/17/14	ESC	Participate in weekly call with debtor professionals (Skadden, A&M, Lazard) and committee professionals (Lowenstein, Zolfo, Guggenheim and MNAT) re: legal and business updates	0.70	413.00
B210	07/18/14	EJW	Confer with E. Chafetz re: OCP requirements and Schander Harrison	0.20	77.00
B210	07/21/14	EJW	Office meeting with E. Chafetz re: draft letter to Debtor and other pending matters	0.20	77.00
B210	07/21/14	ESC	Phone call with O. Nitzan re: questions regarding letter to debtor's counsel re: UAE joint venture	0.20	118.00
B210	07/21/14	ESC	Review various documents and revise letter to the debtor re: discovery related to the debtor's United Arab Emirates joint venture	1.40	826.00
B210	07/21/14	ESC	Multiple phone calls with P. Kizel re: document request related to debtor's various foreign business ventures	0.30	177.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 76
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B210	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: letter to debtor re: UAE joint venture discovery	0.10	59.00
B210	07/21/14	ESC	Phone call to O. Nitzan re: discovery related to the United Arab Emirates joint venture	0.20	118.00
B210	07/21/14	ESC	Phone call to D. MacGreevy re: documents requested from debtor related to the UAE joint venture	0.20	118.00
B210	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: questions regarding the debtor's UAE joint venture	0.10	59.00
B210	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender and O. Nitzan re: call to discuss scope of noteholders' liens on intellectual property assets with MCAM	0.10	59.00
B210	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: proposed letter to the debtor regarding UAE joint venture	0.20	118.00
B210	07/21/14	ESC	Review the debtor's bi-monthly reporting required under the critical vendor, materialmen, shippers, foreign vendors, and customer programs orders and intercompany balances	0.20	118.00
B210	07/21/14	ESC	Begin drafting letter to Debtor's counsel regarding United Arab Emirates' joint venture discovery	1.40	826.00
B210	07/22/14	ESC	Review updated financial diligence list prepared by Zolfo	0.40	236.00
B210	07/23/14	ESC	Phone call with S. Thompson re: questions regarding the foreign corrupt practices act	0.20	118.00
B210	07/23/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to S. Thompson re: letter to debtor's counsel regarding foreign joint venture issues	0.20	118.00
B210	07/23/14	ESC	Phone call with D. MacGreevy re: foreign corrupt practices act issues	0.10	59.00
B210	07/23/14	ESC	Multiple e-mails with A. Sole, K. Rosen, G. Bender and P. Kizel re: call to discuss foreign corrupt practice issues	0.10	59.00
B210	07/23/14	ESC	Review update regarding Cannon Hollow inventory valuation issues	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 77
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B210	07/23/14	ESC	Review debtor's accountants records related to UAE affiliate	0.10	59.00
B210	07/23/14	ESC	Review documents associated with the assumptions underlying the debtor's business plan assumptions	0.10	59.00
B210	07/23/14	ESC	Review additional diligence requests related to foreign corrupt practices act	0.10	59.00
B210	07/24/14	EJW	Review documents re: Canon Hollow investigation report	0.30	115.50
B210	07/24/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with A. Sole re: status of supplemental document and information requests related to debtor's foreign business operations	0.10	59.00
B210	07/24/14	ESC	Review summary of findings of internal investigation related to Cannon Hollow inventory issues	0.40	236.00
B210	07/24/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with potential FCPA violations	0.10	59.00
B210	07/24/14	ESC	Review monthly operating review and reports, June 2014 balance sheet and P&L report	0.40	236.00
B210	07/24/14	GB	Review Akin e-mail presentation re: Cannon Hollow	0.20	171.00
B210	07/24/14	PK	Review materials from Akin re: Canon Hollow inventory investigation	1.20	846.00
B210	07/25/14	ESC	Review information related to Al Dobowi Ltd. and relationships with various large US companies	0.20	118.00
B210	07/25/14	ESC	Review various documents in preparation for call with FTI and Akin re: Cannon Hollow inventory issues	0.20	118.00
B210	07/25/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel and E. Schwartz re: foreign corrupt practice act and Cannon Hollow issues	0.40	236.00
B210	07/25/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: foreign joint venture (UAE) issues	0.10	59.00
B210	07/25/14	ESC	Phone call with committee professionals (Guggenheim, Zolfo, Lowenstein, MNAT) re: follow up regarding UAE joint venture, foreign corrupt practice act issues, and Cannon Hollow inventory matter	0.50	295.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 78
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B210	07/25/14	ESC	Phone call with Akin Gump, FTI and debtor/committee/noteholder professionals re: report regarding Cannon Hollow internal investigation	2.00	1,180.00
B210	07/25/14	ESC	Review correspondence from A. Sole re: obtaining information regarding debtor's FCPA procedures and other related issues	0.10	59.00
B210	07/25/14	ESC	Review documents obtained by E. Schwartz re: information regarding Exide Al Dobowi	0.30	177.00
B210	07/25/14	ESC	Conferences with E. Worenklein re: foreign business relationship issues (middle east)	0.20	118.00
B210	07/25/14	ESC	Phone call to P. Kizel and S. Thompson re: Exide UAE joint venture issues and interaction with the FCPA	0.40	236.00
B210	07/25/14	PK	Attend conference call with certain debtor, UNC and committee professionals re: Canon Hollow inventory issue	2.00	1,410.00
B210	07/25/14	PK	Phone call with E. Chafetz and E. Schwartz re: foreign corrupt practice act and Cannon Hollow issues	0.40	282.00
B210	07/28/14	ESC	Review materials related to Exide Al Dobowi re: foreign business analysis	0.30	177.00
B210	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: Cannon Hollow investigation issues	0.30	177.00
B210	07/28/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with M. Berman of Geosyntec re: ELV analysis	0.10	59.00
B210	07/29/14	ESC	Review E. Worenklein's description of documents relating to Exide Al Dobowi	0.10	59.00
B210	07/29/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: questions regarding e-mail to debtor related to business plan adjustments	0.10	59.00
B210	07/29/14	PK	Prepare summary of Canon Hollow call with Akin from last Friday, including review of notes	1.20	846.00
B210	07/29/14	PK	Review comments from E. Bell re: Canon Hollow inventory issue	0.20	141.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 79
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B210	07/29/14	PK	Review/edit summary of Akin update on Canon Hollow inventory issue	0.50	352.50
B210	07/29/14	PK	Review e-mail from e. Schwartz re: business plan adjustments issue	0.10	70.50
B210	07/29/14	PK	Review e-mail from B. Mendelson (AKIN) and attached written summary of recommendations re: inventory are Canon Hollow	0.20	141.00
B210	07/29/14	PK	Review e-mail from K. Beachum (Akin) re; status of 10-K filing	0.10	70.50
B210	07/30/14	ESC	Review updates regarding Cannon Hollow investigation strategy	0.10	59.00
B210	07/30/14	ESC	Review 3+9 reforecast and business update as of July 30, 2014	0.60	354.00
B210	07/30/14	ESC	Review various documents / correspondence associated with the status of the Cannon Hollow inventory investigation	0.10	59.00
B210	07/30/14	ESC	Review general sets of comments to letter regarding debtor's refusal to make certain business plan adjustments	0.10	59.00
B210	07/30/14	GB	Review communications from debtor and P. Kizel re: internal controls review and Canon Hollow investigation	0.30	256.50
B210	07/30/14	PK	Prepare summary of presentation give by Akin re Canon Hollow issues	1.50	1,057.50
B210	07/31/14	ESC	Continue reviewing various debtor presentations (Vernon, exit financing, business plan) in advance of professionals call	0.60	354.00
B210	07/31/14	ESC	Participate in weekly call with committee professionals (Lowenstein, MNAT, Guggenheim and Zolfo) re: legal and business updates (term sheet, MCAM, business plans	0.80	472.00
B210	07/31/14	ESC	Review debtor-in-possession monthly operating report for filing period June 1, 2014 through June 30, 2014	0.20	118.00
B210	07/31/14	ESC	Review information request provided by MCAM	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 80
 September 30, 2014

<u>Code</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
B210	07/31/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: research into determining diminution in value of collateral	0.40	236.00
B210	07/31/14	KAR	Review June Monthly Operating Report	0.40	354.00
Total B210 - Business Operations				32.10	\$20,035.50
 <u>B230 Financing/Cash Collateral</u>					
B230	07/01/14	ESC	Phone call with counsel for the Debtor re: updated DIP amendment	0.20	118.00
B230	07/01/14	KAR	Review e-mail from E. Bell re: JCI swaps	0.30	265.50
B230	07/01/14	KAR	Review updated noteholder term sheet	0.40	354.00
B230	07/02/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel and G. Bender re: DIP amendment and supplemental DIP order	0.10	59.00
B230	07/02/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to counsel for the debtor re: obtaining commitment letter, revised credit agreement and related declarations associated with DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/02/14	ESC	Review DIP amendment motion and supplemental DIP order	1.20	708.00
B230	07/02/14	GB	Review motion re: proposed DIP amendment and discuss with E. Chafetz	0.50	427.50
B230	07/02/14	GB	Review premium finance motion filed by debtor	0.30	256.50
B230	07/03/14	EJW	Confer with E. Chafetz re; motion to amend the DIP	0.40	154.00
B230	07/03/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to Guggenheim and Zolfo professionals re: DIP commitment letter and accompanying declarations	0.20	118.00
B230	07/03/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: issues surrounding DIP amendment	0.20	118.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 81
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/03/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding DIP Amendment	0.20	118.00
B230	07/03/14	ESC	Review declaration of B. Caruso in support of DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/03/14	ESC	Review declaration of D. Aronson in support of DIP amendment	0.20	118.00
B230	07/03/14	ESC	Review commitment letter associated with DIP Amendment	0.30	177.00
B230	07/03/14	ESC	Conferences with G. Bender re: additional MCAM issues, DIP amendment issues, and plan/valuation issues	0.30	177.00
B230	07/03/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding DIP amendment	0.30	177.00
B230	07/03/14	ESC	Review Guggenheim's comments to the DIP Motion/Order	0.20	118.00
B230	07/03/14	ESC	Review amendment no. 6 to the DIP credit agreement	0.50	295.00
B230	07/03/14	GB	Review proposed DIP amendment and related declarations	0.40	342.00
B230	07/03/14	GB	Review E. Newlands mark up of lien stip	0.40	342.00
B230	07/03/14	GB	Review filed motion re: DIP amendment and discuss same with E. Chafetz	0.50	427.50
B230	07/03/14	GB	Review and comment on draft memo to committee re: proposed DIP amendment	0.30	256.50
B230	07/03/14	PK	Review motion to approve certain dip amendments	0.80	564.00
B230	07/05/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to M. Henkin, O. Nitzan, J. Mitchell and D. MaGreevy re: JP Morgan engagement letter for DIP amendment	0.20	118.00
B230	07/05/14	ESC	Review JP Morgan engagement letter for DIP amendment	0.40	236.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 82
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/07/14	EJW	Review DIP order and various DIP amendments re: DIP milestones	0.40	154.00
B230	07/07/14	EJW	Confer with E. Chafetz re: DIP amendment motion and outline for objection	0.40	154.00
B230	07/07/14	EJW	Begin working on objection to DIP amendment motion	0.90	346.50
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: agent engagement letter related to proposed DIP amendment	0.20	118.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Review documents associated with DIP amendment	0.50	295.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender re: questions regarding proposed DIP amendment	0.30	177.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: issues surrounding regarding proposed DIP amendment	0.40	236.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: strategy related to objection to DIP amendment	0.40	236.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Phone call with B. Duncomb counsel for the debtor re: questions regarding amendment no. 6	0.10	59.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: questions with in connection with the DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Review documents associated with lead price investigation	0.20	118.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel and E. Worenklein re: updated case milestones included in DIP	0.10	59.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Phone call with O. Nitzan re: questions regarding DIP amendment	0.20	118.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to O. Nitzan re: recap of call with debtor regarding DIP amendment fees	0.40	236.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Review DIP Amendment Nos. 4 and 5	0.40	236.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 83
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Phone call from counsel for the debtor re: questions about DIP amendment fees	0.30	177.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel and E. Worenklein re: proposed objection to DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: questions regarding DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Review updated DIP milestones	0.10	59.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to counsel for the debtor re: DIP amendment fees	0.30	177.00
B230	07/07/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to O. Nitzan re: questions regarding amendment DIP fees	0.10	59.00
B230	07/07/14	GB	Call with E. Ivester re: European competition issues (.2) and DIP amendment #6 (.2)	0.40	342.00
B230	07/07/14	GB	Communications with E. Chafetz and O. Nitzan re: draft e-mail to debtor re: request for further information re: DIP amendment	0.20	171.00
B230	07/07/14	PK	Review/outline possible issues with regard to DIP amendment motion	0.50	352.50
B230	07/08/14	EJW	Begin drafting opposition to DIP amendment	4.70	1,809.50
B230	07/08/14	EJW	Conduct research re: objection to DIP amendment	2.70	1,039.50
B230	07/08/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with counsel for the debtor re: questions regarding DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/08/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to O. Nitzan and M. Henkin re: additional information related to DIP amendment fees	0.10	59.00
B230	07/08/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: filing of the sixth DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/08/14	ESC	Review notice of filing of 6th DIP amendment	0.30	177.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 84
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/08/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of and strategy related to objection to amended DIP	0.40	236.00
B230	07/08/14	ESC	Phone call with counsel for the debtor re: questions regarding DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/09/14	EJW	Continue to draft and edit objection to DIP amendment motion	2.40	924.00
B230	07/09/14	EJW	Office meeting with E. Chafetz re: status of DIP amendment objection and potential arguments	0.50	192.50
B230	07/09/14	EJW	Conferences with E. Chafetz re: DIP objection strategy	0.70	269.50
B230	07/09/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to counsel for the debtor re: comps relating to DIP financing fees	0.10	59.00
B230	07/09/14	ESC	Conferences with E. Worenklein re: DIP objection strategy	0.70	413.00
B230	07/09/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: objection to PSA component of DIP amendment	0.40	236.00
B230	07/10/14	EJW	Participate in professionals call re: DIP amendment, MCAM and other pending matters	0.60	231.00
B230	07/10/14	EJW	Office meetings with E. Chafetz re: strategy and edits to DIP amendment objection	0.90	346.50
B230	07/10/14	EJW	Conduct research re: sub rosa plan and PSA for DIP objection	2.10	808.50
B230	07/10/14	EJW	Continue to draft and edit objection to DIP amendment motion	4.20	1,617.00
B230	07/10/14	EJW	Edit objection to DIP motion to incorporate comments from E. Chafetz	2.10	808.50
B230	07/10/14	ESC	Begin revising objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	4.10	2,419.00
B230	07/10/14	ESC	Phone call from P. Laroche of Guggenheim re: questions about comps related to DIP financing amendment	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 85
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/10/14	ESC	Review amended DIP documents re: revisions to objection	0.90	531.00
B230	07/10/14	ESC	Phone call with O. Nitzan re: questions regarding adequate protection included in proposed DIP amendment	0.30	177.00
B230	07/10/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with counsel for the debtor re: obtaining comps for amended DIP financing fees	0.10	59.00
B230	07/10/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: status of objection to proposed DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/10/14	ESC	Office meetings with E. Worenklein re: strategy and edits to DIP amendment objection	0.90	531.00
B230	07/10/14	ESC	Continue revising objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	2.30	1,357.00
B230	07/11/14	EJW	Review, edit and comment on current version of DIP amendment objection	0.90	346.50
B230	07/11/14	EJW	Confer with E. Chafetz re: edits and comments to DIP Amendment objection	0.90	346.50
B230	07/11/14	EJW	Review and comment on updated draft of DIP objection	0.60	231.00
B230	07/11/14	EJW	Cite check case law in DIP amendment objection	0.40	154.00
B230	07/11/14	ESC	Continue drafting objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	4.20	2,478.00
B230	07/11/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to G. Bender and P. Kizel re: objection to motion to amend DIP facility	0.10	59.00
B230	07/11/14	ESC	Further revisions to motion to amend DIP facilities	4.40	2,596.00
B230	07/11/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: questions regarding objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/11/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: status of obtaining comps related to DIP amendment fees	0.40	236.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 86
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/11/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with debtor's counsel re: status of obtaining comps in connection with DIP amendment fee	0.10	59.00
B230	07/11/14	ESC	Conferences with E. Worenklein re: strategy related objection to motion to amend DIP facility	0.90	531.00
B230	07/11/14	GB	Communications with P. Kizel, Guggenheim and Zolfo re: proposed DIP amendment and likely objection	0.40	342.00
B230	07/11/14	GB	Review draft objection to DIP financing amendment	0.30	256.50
B230	07/12/14	EJW	review and provide comments to DIP objection	0.40	154.00
B230	07/12/14	ESC	Revise objection to motion to amend DIP facilities to include P. Kizel's comments	2.60	1,534.00
B230	07/12/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to committee professionals (MNAT, Guggenheim, Lazard) re: draft objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.20	118.00
B230	07/12/14	ESC	Review P. Kizel's comments to objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.20	118.00
B230	07/12/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: strategy related to objection to motion to amend DIP facility	0.10	59.00
B230	07/12/14	PK	Review draft objection to DIP amendment motion	0.80	564.00
B230	07/13/14	ESC	Review E. Schwartz's comments to objection to debtors' motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/13/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender and E. Worenklein re: questions regarding objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.30	177.00
B230	07/13/14	ESC	Review Guggenheim's comments to objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.20	118.00
B230	07/13/14	ESC	Revise objection to debtors' motion to amend DIP facilities to incorporate E. Schwartz's comments	0.10	59.00
B230	07/13/14	ESC	Review E. Bell of Zolfo's comments to objection to debtors' motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 87
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/13/14	ESC	Revise objection to debtors' motion to amend DIP facilities to incorporate E. Bell's comments	0.20	118.00
B230	07/13/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: comments to objection to debtors' motion to amend DIP facilities	0.20	118.00
B230	07/13/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: objection to debtors' motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/13/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: comments to objection to motion to amend objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/13/14	ESC	Revise objection to motion to amend DIP facilities to incorporate O. Nitzan's comments	0.60	354.00
B230	07/13/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Worenklein re: further revisions to objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.20	118.00
B230	07/14/14	EJW	Review, edit and incorporate comments to the DIP amendment objection	1.30	500.50
B230	07/14/14	EJW	Review, proofread and provide comments to revised DIP amendment objection	0.40	154.00
B230	07/14/14	EJW	Conferences with E. Chafetz re: revisions to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.70	269.50
B230	07/14/14	EJW	Phone call with E. CHafetz re: final draft of DIP amendment objection	0.20	77.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Review E. Worenklein's proposed revisions to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.20	118.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: strategy related to objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Phone call with O. Nitzan re: strategy related to objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.30	177.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: comments to objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to Guggenheim and Zolfo re: fee comps associated with DIP amendment motion	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 88
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Conferences with G. Bender re: comments to objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.30	177.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: revised objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Review and revise draft objection to proposed DIP amendment and discuss with G. Bender	1.10	649.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: comments to objection to debtors motion to amend DIP facilities	0.30	177.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Review comps provided by Lazard related to DIP amendment fees	0.10	59.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Worenklein re: questions regarding fee section of the objection to the committee's motion to amend dip facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to O. Nitzan, M. Henkin, J. Mitchell, D. MacGreevy and E. Bell re: questions regarding section of objection to motion to amend DIP facilities regarding fees	0.20	118.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Conferences with E. Worenklein re: revisions to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP Facilities	0.70	413.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: revisions to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.20	118.00
B230	07/14/14	ESC	Further revisions to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP Facilities	3.10	1,829.00
B230	07/14/14	GB	Call with M. Henkin and O. Nitzan re: objection to DIP amendment	0.20	171.00
B230	07/14/14	GB	Review and revise draft objection to proposed DIP amendment and discuss with E. Chafetz	1.10	940.50
B230	07/14/14	KAR	Review draft of response to DIP extension	0.50	442.50
B230	07/15/14	EJW	Review various fee applications received from DIP agent (.4); draft analysis e-mail to E. Chafetz	0.60	231.00
B230	07/15/14	ESC	Review and revise e-mail to G. Bender and P. Kizel re: DIP agent fees	0.40	236.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 89
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/15/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel, G. Bender and K. Rosen re: objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/15/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Laroche of Guggenheim re: status of objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/15/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: questions regarding objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.20	118.00
B230	07/15/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Schwartz and E. Fay re: filing version of objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/15/14	ESC	Further revisions to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	2.10	1,239.00
B230	07/15/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with C. Hansen of the PBGC re: proposed edits to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/15/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: finalizing objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/15/14	PK	Final review/edit of objection to DIP amendment motion	1.50	1,057.50
B230	07/15/14	PK	Review and respond to e-mail from O. Nitzan re: DIP hearing	0.10	70.50
B230	07/16/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: strategy related to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.20	118.00
B230	07/16/14	GB	Review Ziman e-mail re: DIP amendment objection	0.10	85.50
B230	07/16/14	GB	Communications with A. Eaton re: committee objection to DIP amendment	0.20	171.00
B230	07/16/14	GB	Call with Lowenstein, Guggenheim, Zolfo and E. Schwartz re: senior noteholders request for a meeting and possible resolution of DIP amendment objection	0.50	427.50
B230	07/17/14	EJW	Review and analyze Debtor's reply to DIP amendment and UNC and DIP Agent joinders	0.40	154.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 90
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/17/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to counsel for the DIP agent re: questions regarding fees	0.20	118.00
B230	07/17/14	ESC	Review joinder of JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. to debtor's reply in support of debtor's motion for entry of an order authorizing the debtor to amend the DIP facilities to obtain additional financing	0.10	59.00
B230	07/17/14	ESC	Review debtor's reply to committee's objection to motion to amend DIP facilities	0.30	177.00
B230	07/17/14	ESC	Review unofficial noteholder committee's joinder in debtor's reply in support of debtor's motion for entry of an order authorizing the debtor to amend the DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/17/14	ESC	Conferences with E. Worenklein re: strategy related to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities and plan issues	0.50	295.00
B230	07/17/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender re: status of negotiations to resolve objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.10	59.00
B230	07/18/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to team re: DIP amendments and requirements	0.30	115.50
B230	07/18/14	EJW	Conduct research re: DIP facility and amendments prior to meeting with UNC	1.10	423.50
B230	07/18/14	EJW	Office meeting with P. Kizel and E. Chafetz re: DIP amendment and reply pleadings	0.30	115.50
B230	07/18/14	ESC	Review notice of agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on July 22, 2014	0.10	59.00
B230	07/18/14	ESC	Review recommendation to committee re: DIP objection	0.10	59.00
B230	07/18/14	ESC	Review documents in preparation for meeting with noteholders and the debtor re: objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities and plan issues	0.90	531.00
B230	07/18/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with counsel for the DIP agent re: questions about fees	0.10	59.00
B230	07/18/14	GB	Review debtors and noteholders' responses to committee objection to motion to approve DIP amendment	0.40	342.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 91
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/18/14	PK	Draft e-mail to committee re: possible DIP Amendment resolution	0.50	352.50
B230	07/18/14	PK	Telephone conferences (2) and e-mails with O. Nitzan re: DIP amendment (.2)	0.40	282.00
B230	07/19/14	ESC	Review documents supporting proposed DIP amendment circulated by E. Worenklein	0.10	59.00
B230	07/19/14	GB	Communications with A. Sole and K. Rosen re: accounting and other foreign transaction's and review materials re: same	0.90	769.50
B230	07/20/14	ESC	Review documents relating to DIP agent fees	0.10	59.00
B230	07/20/14	GB	Communications re: need for discovery re: foreign transactions, including UAE	0.30	256.50
B230	07/21/14	EJW	Locate and circulate cases cited by Debtor in reply to DIP amendment motion	0.40	154.00
B230	07/21/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: DIP orders	0.20	77.00
B230	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with counsel for the DIP agent re: verifying fees charged	0.10	59.00
B230	07/21/14	ESC	Review documents associated with the proposed sixth DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/21/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender re: question regarding the DIP agents' fees	0.10	59.00
B230	07/21/14	GB	Discuss with P. Kizel resolution of issues re: upcoming hearing re: DIP financing	0.20	171.00
B230	07/21/14	GB	Discuss status of negotiations re: DIP amendment with P. Kizel	0.20	171.00
B230	07/21/14	PK	Telephone conferences with K. Ziman (2) re: DIP amendment hearing resolution (.3) and draft and review confirming e-mails (.2)	0.50	352.50
B230	07/21/14	PK	Prepare for possible contested hearing on DIP financing amendment	1.00	705.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 92
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B230	07/21/14	PK	Telephone conference with K. Ziman, E. Ivester and B. Duncomb re: motion to approve DIP amendment	0.30	211.50
B230	07/21/14	PK	E-mail to committee re: DIP financing motion	0.20	141.00
B230	07/21/14	PK	Discuss with G. Bender resolution of issues re: upcoming hearing re: DIP financing	0.20	141.00
B230	07/21/14	PK	Discuss status of negotiations re: DIP amendment with G. Bender	0.20	141.00
B230	07/22/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of the Schnader Harrison and DIP agent fee issues	0.40	236.00
B230	07/24/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with counsel for the DIP agent re: questions about fees	0.10	59.00
B230	07/24/14	GB	Call with P. Giordano re: DB signing NDA	0.30	256.50
B230	07/25/14	ESC	Review certification of counsel in support of entry of order authorizing the debtor to amend the DIP facilities to obtain additional financing	0.20	118.00
B230	07/25/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with the seventh DIP amendment	0.10	59.00
B230	07/25/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to Lowenstein team re: certification of counsel in support of entry of order authorizing the debtor to amend the DIP facilities to obtain additional financing	0.10	59.00
B230	07/25/14	PK	Review 7th DIP amendment eliminating July 31, 2014 plan filing milestone	0.20	141.00
B230	07/28/14	EJW	Conduct additional research re: rights offering issues	1.10	423.50
B230	07/29/14	ESC	Phone call with counsel for the DIP agent re: questions regarding fees	0.20	118.00
B230	07/29/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding DIP Agent fees and strategy relating to motions being heard during the September 3, 2014 omnibus hearing	0.20	118.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 93
 September 30, 2014

<u>Code</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
B230	07/29/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with counsel for the DIP Lenders re: fee questions	0.10	59.00
Total B230 - Financing/Cash Collateral				100.10	\$55,581.50
 <u>B260 Board of Directors</u>					
B260	07/23/14	PK	Review and respond to e-mail from E. Schwartz re: Canon Hollow inventory issue update	0.10	70.50
Total B260 - Board of Directors				0.10	\$70.50
 <u>B300 - Claims and Plan</u>					
 <u>B310 Claims Administration and Objections</u>					
B310	07/13/14	EJW	conduct research re: PSA lock-ups and draft e-mail summary re: same	1.60	616.00
B310	07/14/14	EJW	Conduct research re: classification of claims	0.90	346.50
B310	07/14/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Bell, D.MacGreevy and J. Mitchell re: verifying amount of unsecured claims	0.10	59.00
B310	07/15/14	EJW	Conduct additional research re: PSA agreement and lock-ups	1.10	423.50
B310	07/15/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Bell of Zolfo re: scope of general unsecured claim pool	0.10	59.00
B310	07/15/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender re: scope of the claims pool	0.10	59.00
B310	07/18/14	ESC	Review debtor's fourth notice of claims previously satisfied	0.20	118.00
B310	07/18/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with L. Chiabetta re: debtor's tenth omnibus objection to claim	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 94
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B310	07/18/14	ESC	Review debtor's tenth omnibus objection to claims	0.20	118.00
B310	07/18/14	PK	Review draft claim objection and notice of satisfaction of claims from Skadden (.2) and draft e-mail to Skadden re: questions re: same (.1)	0.30	211.50
B310	07/19/14	EJW	Review and comment on draft omnibus claims objection and notice of satisfaction of claims	0.40	154.00
B310	07/20/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: strategy related to the debtor's 10th omnibus claim objection	0.10	59.00
B310	07/21/14	GB	Review Skadden response re: 9th and 10th objection to claims	0.20	171.00
B310	07/22/14	ESC	Review further notice of claims fully satisfied	0.10	59.00
B310	07/23/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to M. Kehl re: management team admin motion	0.10	38.50
Total B310 - Claims Administration and Objections				5.60	\$2,551.00

B320 Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)

B320	07/01/14	AMB	Review Pressprich & Co. May 2014 Exide report and assess impact on valuation issues	0.50	350.00
B320	07/01/14	ESC	Meeting with committee professionals (Lowenstein, Guggenheim, Zolfo) re: recap of meeting with noteholders' professionals re: plan term sheet	0.50	295.00
B320	07/01/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender and K. Rosen re: plan term sheet issues	0.20	118.00
B320	07/01/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: recap of meeting with noteholders and omnibus hearing preparation	0.20	118.00
B320	07/01/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: research into forcing a sale in lieu of a plan of reorganization	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 95
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/01/14	ESC	Attend meeting at Paul Weiss' office with noteholders' counsel, financial advisor and investment banker re: plan term sheet and lien avoidance complaint	1.50	885.00
B320	07/01/14	ESC	Review various documents in preparation for meeting with noteholders' professionals	0.40	236.00
B320	07/01/14	GB	Meeting at Paul Weiss to discuss plan term sheets (1.2) and related follow up discussions with Lowenstein, Guggenheim and Zolfo participants (.4)	1.60	1,368.00
B320	07/01/14	KAR	Attend meeting at Paul Weiss re: Plan of Reorganization (1.5) and related follow up discussions (.5)	2.00	1,770.00
B320	07/01/14	PK	Review plan issues	4.00	2,820.00
B320	07/02/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: recap of call with committee co-chairs and meeting with noteholders	0.30	177.00
B320	07/03/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to G. Bender re: valuation opinions	0.20	77.00
B320	07/03/14	EJW	Review and comment on precedent for valuation issues	1.90	731.50
B320	07/06/14	EJW	Conduct research re: feasibility standard related issues	1.80	693.00
B320	07/06/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: research into feasibility issues associated with environmental liabilities	0.40	236.00
B320	07/07/14	EJW	Review filed DIP amendment and confirm if any changes	0.10	38.50
B320	07/07/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: research into best interest test and treatment of environmental claims	0.40	236.00
B320	07/07/14	PK	Attention to plan issues	4.00	2,820.00
B320	07/08/14	EJW	Conduct additional research re: objection to PSA	0.90	346.50
B320	07/09/14	EJW	Conference with E. Chafetz re: research into challenging rights offering	0.20	77.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 96
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/09/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: research into challenging rights offerings	0.20	118.00
B320	07/09/14	ESC	Phone with O. Nitzan re: questions regarding plan support agreement	0.20	118.00
B320	07/09/14	PK	Attention to plan issues	4.00	2,820.00
B320	07/10/14	ESC	Review correspondence addressing valuation strategy in connection with M-Cam report	0.10	59.00
B320	07/10/14	ESC	Phone call with B. Duncumb counsel for the debtor re: questions regarding PSA	0.10	59.00
B320	07/10/14	RST	Telephone conference with G. Bender re: M-CAM (.6); online research re: M-CAM, D. Martin (.3)	0.90	648.00
B320	07/11/14	AMB	E-mails with E. Chafetz and Guggenheim re: obtaining relevant documents in connection with Plan issues	0.20	140.00
B320	07/11/14	AMB	Review documents relating to M-CAM and IP issues	0.50	350.00
B320	07/11/14	ESC	Phone calls with S. Thompson re: valuation issues and MCAM report	0.20	118.00
B320	07/11/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with M. Boxer re: obtaining MCAM back up information	0.10	59.00
B320	07/12/14	AMB	E-mails re: Exide I opinion and strategy in response thereto	0.40	280.00
B320	07/14/14	AMB	Conference call with valuation team and clients re: M-CAM issues	0.60	420.00
B320	07/14/14	AMB	Conference with S. Thompson re: valuation issues; e-mails re: same and MCAM retention documents	0.50	350.00
B320	07/14/14	AMB	Review revised work plan	0.30	210.00
B320	07/14/14	AMB	Review documents re: MCAM IP process	0.40	280.00
B320	07/14/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: status of plan related discovery	0.20	118.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 97
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/14/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of research into market testing rights offerings and treatment of environmental claims in the context of a sale	0.40	236.00
B320	07/14/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with M. Savetsky re: plan discovery issues	0.10	59.00
B320	07/14/14	GB	Conference with E. Chafetz re: status of plan related discovery	0.20	171.00
B320	07/15/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with J. Mitchell, D. MacGreevy, E. Bell, O. Nitzan and M. Henkin re: information needed for plan discovery	0.20	118.00
B320	07/15/14	GB	Communicate with A. Eaton re: plan process	0.20	171.00
B320	07/15/14	PK	Review work plan re valuation/plan issues	0.50	352.50
B320	07/16/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with call from noteholders' counsel regarding objection to debtor's motion to amend dip facilities and plan negotiations	0.10	59.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	Phone call with Lowenstein, Zolfo and Guggenheim professionals re: DIP objection and plan issues	0.60	354.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with R. Li re: information needed for discovery requests (plan/environmental/business plan, etc.)	0.10	59.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: strategy related to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facility and plan negotiations	0.20	118.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	Phone call with M. Savetsky re: plan discovery issues	0.20	118.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	Review proposed discovery requests (plan/operations) prepared by Guggenheim	0.30	177.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel and G. Bender re: discovery issues (environmental / plan/business plan)	0.50	295.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: discovery issues	0.20	118.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 98
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/16/14	ESC	Review updated claims summary prepared by Zolfo	0.30	177.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Schwartz re: questions regarding discovery requests (plan, etc.)	0.10	59.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	Conferences with E. Worenklein re: objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities and plan issues	0.40	236.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	Review consolidated list of outstanding financial diligence requests and follow up questions related to the revised business plan prepared by Zolfo re: inclusion in discovery requests	0.60	354.00
B320	07/16/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: plan and valuation discovery issues	0.10	59.00
B320	07/16/14	GB	Review claim summary sent by E. Bell (Zolfo)	0.30	256.50
B320	07/16/14	PK	Review plan issues	2.00	1,410.00
B320	07/16/14	PK	Phone call with E. Chafetz re: discovery issues	0.20	141.00
B320	07/16/14	PK	Telephone conference with Guggenheim and Zolfo teams re: meeting with counsel for secured lenders re: plan and re: DIP amendment motion	0.40	282.00
B320	07/17/14	EJW	Phone call with M. Boxer re: valuation work plan	0.20	77.00
B320	07/17/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to team re: proposed plan term sheets	0.20	77.00
B320	07/17/14	EJW	Conduct research re: valuation arguments	0.80	308.00
B320	07/17/14	ESC	Begin preparing discovery request to the debtor relating to plan, environmental, business plan and operational issues	3.10	1,829.00
B320	07/17/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: plan term sheets	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 99
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/17/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: preparation for meeting with noteholders re: objection to motion to amend DIP facilities and plan issues	0.10	59.00
B320	07/17/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to A. Eaton and H. Kaplan re: proposed stipulation with noteholders relating to scope of collateral	0.10	59.00
B320	07/17/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: questions regarding document request to the debtors	0.10	59.00
B320	07/17/14	ESC	Phone call with D. MacGreevy re: questions regarding document request and business plan issues	0.10	59.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee re: plan proposal received from secured noteholders	0.40	236.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Participate in meeting at Paul Weiss with professionals representing the Debtor (Skadden, Lazard, A&M), Committee (Lowenstein, Guggenheim, Zolfo and MNAT) and Noteholders (Paul Weiss and Houlihan) professionals re: plan proposal and resolution of DIP objection	1.50	885.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Continue preparing discovery requests to the Debtor (plan/environmental/operations, etc.)	1.20	708.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel re: discovery requests directed at the Debtor (environmental, plan, operations, etc.)	0.30	177.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Review committee professionals' comments to e-mail to the committee re: proposed plan term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Confer with P. Kizel re: proposed plan term sheet	0.30	177.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Revise e-mail to the committee to incorporate various professionals proposed comments relating to plan term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: strategy related to meeting with noteholders re: DIP objection and plan issues	0.20	118.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: strategy related to objection to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.30	177.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 100
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Follow up meeting at Paul Weiss with committee professionals (Lowenstein, Guggenheim, Zolfo and MNAT) re: plan proposal and resolution of DIP objection	0.50	295.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Conference with P. Kizel and G. Bender re: go forward strategy related to plan proposal and resolution of DIP objection	0.20	118.00
B320	07/18/14	ESC	Confer with P. Kizel re: UNC plan term sheet and e-mail to committee	0.30	177.00
B320	07/18/14	GB	Prepare for meeting with noteholder and debtor advisors re: plan process	0.50	427.50
B320	07/18/14	GB	Meet with senior noteholders and debtor advisors and committee advisors re: plan process	2.00	1,710.00
B320	07/18/14	PK	Confer with E. Chafetz re: proposed plan term sheet	0.30	211.50
B320	07/18/14	PK	Attend meeting at Paul Weiss with secured noteholder reps, debtor reps and committee professionals re: plan of reorganization (1.5), meet with committee professionals after meeting for follow up discussion (.5)	2.00	1,410.00
B320	07/18/14	PK	Review and comment on e-mail to committee re: UNC term sheet proposal	0.30	211.50
B320	07/18/14	PK	Confer with E. Chafetz re: UNC plan term sheet and e-mail to committee	0.30	211.50
B320	07/20/14	ESC	Continue preparing discovery requests	0.80	472.00
B320	07/20/14	GB	Review and consider response to senior's plan term sheet	0.40	342.00
B320	07/20/14	GB	Call with Lowenstein, Guggenheim and Zolfo re: MCAM issues and plan issues and prepare for Monday co-chair call	0.80	684.00
B320	07/21/14	AMB	Read and assess financial projections and recovery framework	1.00	700.00
B320	07/21/14	EJW	Review new term sheet received from UNC and compare to previous drafts	0.40	154.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 101
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: questions regarding noteholders' term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/21/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender re: plan term sheet issues	0.20	118.00
B320	07/21/14	ESC	Compile a list of potential causes of actions for inclusion in a trust	1.20	708.00
B320	07/21/14	ESC	Review cases addressing the approval of PSAs and e-mail exchange with P. Kizel and E. Worenklein re: same	0.40	236.00
B320	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender re: various issues with discovery requests related to plan confirmation	0.20	118.00
B320	07/21/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with noteholders' term sheet proposal	0.10	59.00
B320	07/21/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: questions regarding and scope of proposed plan discovery	0.20	118.00
B320	07/21/14	GB	Discuss senior note's plan with various committee professionals	0.40	342.00
B320	07/21/14	GB	Call with O. Nitzan re: preparation of response re: plan term sheet	0.30	256.50
B320	07/22/14	EJW	Review UNC revised term sheet and create word markup version	0.80	308.00
B320	07/22/14	EJW	Review and comment on potential litigation claims for litigation trust	0.40	154.00
B320	07/22/14	EJW	Conference with E. Chafetz re: status of research into feasibility/best interest test and marketing of rights offering	0.30	115.50
B320	07/22/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of research into feasibility / best interest test and marketing of rights offering	0.30	177.00
B320	07/22/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: potential causes of action to be brought by the committee	0.20	118.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 102
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/22/14	ESC	Follow up conference wit G. Bender re: strategy related to formulating response to noteholders' proposed plan term sheet	0.20	118.00
B320	07/22/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of plan term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/22/14	ESC	Prepare for (.2) and participate in call with committee professionals (Guggenheim, Zolfo, MNAT) re: formulating response to noteholders' proposed plan term sheet (.8)	1.00	590.00
B320	07/22/14	ESC	Begin marking up term sheet circulated by the noteholders	2.30	1,357.00
B320	07/22/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: plan term sheet negotiations	0.20	118.00
B320	07/22/14	ESC	Review plan term sheet proposed by the noteholders	0.10	59.00
B320	07/22/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of plan discovery	0.10	59.00
B320	07/22/14	ESC	Continue compiling list of potential litigations to be included in a trust or brought otherwise	2.90	1,711.00
B320	07/22/14	GB	Call with committee professionals re: plan term sheet structure and issues	1.00	855.00
B320	07/22/14	GB	Review and consider term sheet for restructuring of Exide (.6) and discuss with E. Chafetz (.3)	0.90	769.50
B320	07/22/14	KAR	Conference call with team re: Plan of Reorganization counter offer	0.60	531.00
B320	07/22/14	PK	Telephone conference with LS team and Guggenheim/Zolfo and E. Schwartz re: UNC plan proposal	0.80	564.00
B320	07/22/14	PK	Review e-mail from M. Henkin re: plan related issue	0.10	70.50
B320	07/23/14	AMB	E-mails and intra-office discussions re: valuation issues and upcoming meetings with Guggenheim	0.60	420.00
B320	07/23/14	EJW	Confer with E. Chafetz re: markup of plan term sheet	0.50	192.50

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 103
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/23/14	EJW	Conduct research re: plan and DS precedent	0.60	231.00
B320	07/23/14	EJW	Review revised term sheet mark-up (.2); office meeting with E. Chafetz re: same	0.40	154.00
B320	07/23/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: status of the plan term sheet and other open issues	0.10	59.00
B320	07/23/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel and G. Bender re: mark up of noteholders' proposed plan term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/23/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: term sheet negotiations	0.20	118.00
B320	07/23/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: valuing participation in rights offering	0.10	59.00
B320	07/23/14	ESC	Continue revising plan term sheet in response to term sheet from the noteholders	2.90	1,711.00
B320	07/23/14	ESC	Review Guggenheim's analysis of participation in rights offering	0.30	177.00
B320	07/23/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: term sheet issues	0.30	177.00
B320	07/23/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Laroche of Guggenheim re: questions regarding analysis of participation in rights offering	0.10	59.00
B320	07/23/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: research related to market testing rights offerings	0.30	177.00
B320	07/23/14	GB	Conference with E. Chafetz re: term sheet negotiations	0.20	171.00
B320	07/23/14	GB	Communicate with A. Halperin re: plan term sheet	0.10	85.50
B320	07/23/14	GB	Review Guggenheim analysis of senior proposal re: equity investment	0.30	256.50
B320	07/23/14	GB	Call with P. Kizel re: plan response process	0.20	171.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 104
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/23/14	GB	Discuss plan response process with E. Chafetz	0.30	256.50
B320	07/23/14	KAR	Review Guggenheim's analysis re: plan issues	0.80	708.00
B320	07/23/14	PK	Review plan related analysis	0.20	141.00
B320	07/23/14	PK	Review e-mail from S. Thompson re: documents for joint venture	0.20	141.00
B320	07/24/14	EJW	Confer with E. Chafetz re: comments and edits to draft term sheet	0.20	77.00
B320	07/24/14	EJW	Review and comment on revised term sheet to be submitted to senior noteholders	0.40	154.00
B320	07/24/14	EJW	Draft research memo re: rights offering issues	3.60	1,386.00
B320	07/24/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to P. Kizel and G. Bender re: revised plan term sheet	0.20	118.00
B320	07/24/14	ESC	Prepare for and phone call with P. Laroche of Guggenheim re: valuing rights offering	0.40	236.00
B320	07/24/14	ESC	Revise plan term sheet to incorporate bifurcated proposal to noteholders	1.40	826.00
B320	07/24/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: MCAM issues and plan term sheet	0.20	118.00
B320	07/24/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender re: inclusion of rights offering in plan term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/24/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Laroche of Guggenheim re: valuation of rights offering	0.10	59.00
B320	07/24/14	ESC	Conferences with E. Worenklein re: plan term sheet negotiation status	0.30	177.00
B320	07/24/14	GB	Call with committee professionals re: plan term sheet and MCAM	0.60	513.00
B320	07/24/14	GB	Discuss preparation of plan term sheet with E. Chafetz	0.20	171.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 105
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/25/14	AMB	Prepare for upcoming conference calls re: valuation issues	0.50	350.00
B320	07/25/14	AMB	Update status of valuation work plan and review of relevant documents	1.50	1,050.00
B320	07/25/14	AMB	E-mails re: data room and upcoming conference calls	0.20	140.00
B320	07/25/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: plan term sheet issues	0.20	118.00
B320	07/25/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender re: status of plan term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/25/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: rights offering research	0.30	177.00
B320	07/25/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with the value of rights offering participation	0.10	59.00
B320	07/25/14	GB	Review plan counter proposal (.2) and communicate with E. Chafetz re: same (.2)	0.40	342.00
B320	07/25/14	PK	Review e-mails (2) from committee member re: plan issues	0.20	141.00
B320	07/25/14	PK	Telephone conference with P. Laroche re: plan issue	0.20	141.00
B320	07/25/14	PK	Review and comment on draft counterproposal plan term sheet	0.80	564.00
B320	07/26/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: comments to plan term sheet	0.90	531.00
B320	07/26/14	ESC	Revise term sheet to incorporate various committee members' comments	1.20	708.00
B320	07/26/14	ESC	Revise plan term sheet	2.40	1,416.00
B320	07/26/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to K. Rosen and G. Bender re: proposed plan term sheet	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 106
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/26/14	ESC	Review e-mail from M. Henkin re: A. Sole, J. Carr's and P. Kravitz's comments to term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/26/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: revised version of term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/26/14	ESC	Follow up phone call with P. Kizel re: additional revisions to plan term sheet	1.20	708.00
B320	07/26/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Chafetz re: comments to plan term sheet	0.90	531.00
B320	07/26/14	PK	Telephone conference with E. Chafetz re: plan term sheet	0.80	564.00
B320	07/26/14	PK	Review revised draft plan term sheet (.2) and series of communications with E. Chafetz re: same (.2)	0.30	211.50
B320	07/27/14	EJW	Revise research memo re: rights offering issues	0.90	346.50
B320	07/27/14	ESC	Multiple e-mails with committee professionals re: comments to plan term sheet	0.30	177.00
B320	07/27/14	ESC	Revise plan term sheet to incorporate M. Henkin's comments	0.70	413.00
B320	07/27/14	ESC	Revise plan term sheet to incorporate G. Bender's comments	0.40	236.00
B320	07/27/14	ESC	Revise plan term sheet to incorporate P. Kizel's comments	0.20	118.00
B320	07/27/14	GB	Communicate with E. Chafetz and P. Kizel re: plan term sheet response	0.40	342.00
B320	07/27/14	GB	Review and revise proposed plan counter proposal	0.40	342.00
B320	07/28/14	AMB	Prepare for conference calls, including review of pertinent documents	1.00	700.00
B320	07/28/14	AMB	Conference calls with client and professionals re: case status, valuation issues, term sheet, and forecast adjustments	2.50	1,750.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 107
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/28/14	AMB	Confer with S. Thompson re: valuation issues	0.50	350.00
B320	07/28/14	AMB	E-mails re: valuation and logistical issues	0.50	350.00
B320	07/28/14	AMB	Organization of valuation tasks to be accomplished, including meeting with F. Catalina re: index of documents	1.00	700.00
B320	07/28/14	EJW	Begin conducting research re: diminution of value standards	1.20	462.00
B320	07/28/14	EJW	Review and respond to e-mail from P. Kizel re: diminution in value research	0.20	77.00
B320	07/28/14	EJW	Phone call with P. Kizel re: diminution of value research assignment	0.10	38.50
B320	07/28/14	EJW	Revise research memo re: rights offering issues	1.60	616.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: status of the MCAM's diligence, the lead investigation, and term sheet	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Review stipulation in preparation for (.3) and phone call with counsel for indentured trustee of the senior secured notes, counsel for the UNC, G. Bender and E. Newlands re: lien stipulation (.8)	1.10	649.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call to O. Nitzan re: questions regarding term sheet	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Review preliminary research related to diminution of the value of the lender's collateral and analyzing same	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to M. Henkin, O. Nitzan, J. Mitchell and D. MacGreevey re: updated term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Multiple e-mails with committee professionals re: counter term sheet proposal	0.10	59.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Phone calls with P. Laroche of Guggenheim re: illustory recovery framework related to term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to the committee professionals re: revised plan term sheet	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 108
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Review Guggenheim's illustrative recovery framework	0.40	236.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Review memorandum received from E. Worenklein re: market testing rights offerings	0.40	236.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with committee professionals (Guggenheim, Zolfo, Lowenstein) re: plan term sheet issues	0.40	236.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with committee co-chairs (A. Sole and M. Strollo) and committee professionals (Lowenstein, Guggenheim, Zolfo, and MNAT) re: plan term sheet	0.70	413.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Schwartz re: plan term sheet	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Revise term sheet to incorporate various committee professionals' additional comments	1.30	767.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: plan term sheet issues	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Review documents associated with lead investigation	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to G. Bender and P. Kizel re: revised term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender re: plan term sheet issues	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Newlands re: call to discuss stipulation with noteholders regarding scope of liens	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan re: illustory recovery framework	0.10	59.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to committee professionals (MNAT, Guggenheim, Zolfo, Lowenstein) re: illustrative recovery framework	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Review version of Guggenheim's illustrative recovery framework for circulation to committee	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Conferences with E. Worenklein re: memo discussions of the market testing of rights offerings	0.30	177.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 109
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender and E.Newlands re: recap of call with noteholders and trustee re: scope of liens	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with valuation team re: impact of failure to run adjustments on business plan	0.50	295.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with committee professionals (Lowenstein, MCAM, Zolfo and Guggenheim) re: illustrative waterfall analysis	0.50	295.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: explanation of the illustrative waterfall analysis	0.20	118.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Further revisions to term sheet	0.40	236.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Bell of Zolfo re: information related to business plan adjustments	0.10	59.00
B320	07/28/14	ESC	Review initial request to make business plan adjustments and the debtor's response	0.70	413.00
B320	07/28/14	GB	Discuss plan term sheet counter-proposal with E. Chafetz	0.30	256.50
B320	07/28/14	GB	Review motion of equity holders to file under seal	0.50	427.50
B320	07/28/14	GB	Call with committee professionals re: illustrative waterfall	0.60	513.00
B320	07/28/14	KAR	Telephone conference with A. Sole re: E. Schwartz's e-mail on Plan of Reorganization	0.30	265.50
B320	07/28/14	KAR	Review latest update of Plan of Reorganization term sheet	0.40	354.00
B320	07/28/14	KAR	Conference call with professionals before co-chair call re: Plan of Reorganization	0.40	354.00
B320	07/28/14	KAR	Review revised draft of term sheet on Plan of Reorganization	0.50	442.50
B320	07/28/14	PK	Attention to review/comment on drafts of counter term sheet	2.50	1,762.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 110
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/28/14	PK	Phone call wit E. Chafetz re: plan term sheet issues	0.20	141.00
B320	07/28/14	PK	Participate in call with Zolfo, Guggenheim and E.Schwartz re: plan term sheet	0.50	352.50
B320	07/28/14	PK	Call with Guggenheim, Zolfo, E. Schwartz re: edited plan term sheet adn potential information requests	1.20	846.00
B320	07/28/14	PK	Review communications from Zolfo/Guggenheim to A&M re: business plan adjustments and A&M responsive data	0.80	564.00
B320	07/28/14	PK	Review background research materials regarding assessing diminution in value claims asserted by secured lenders	1.20	846.00
B320	07/28/14	PK	Draft e-mail to E. Worenklein re: diminution in collateral claims	0.30	211.50
B320	07/29/14	AMB	Review and edit proposed letters to debtor re: adjustments to financial projections	0.50	350.00
B320	07/29/14	AMB	E-mails re: proposed correspondence with debtor	0.30	210.00
B320	07/29/14	EJW	Conduct research re: diminution of value standards	3.10	1,193.50
B320	07/29/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: strategy related to plan negotiations	0.20	118.00
B320	07/29/14	ESC	Review revised memorandum addressing the market testing of rights offerings	0.20	118.00
B320	07/29/14	ESC	Review revised illustrative recovery framework (related to plan term sheet) for circulation to the committee	0.20	118.00
B320	07/29/14	GB	Call with P. Kizel re: update re: lead investigation	0.20	171.00
B320	07/29/14	GB	Conference with E. Chafetz re: strategy related to plan negotiations	0.20	171.00
B320	07/29/14	KAR	Review draft e-mail re: adjustments to business plan	0.40	354.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 111
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/29/14	PK	Work on letter to Skadden re: adjustments and business plan requests	0.80	564.00
B320	07/29/14	PK	Call with G. Bender re: update re: lead investigation	0.20	141.00
B320	07/29/14	PK	Review comments from Guggenheim re: business plan adjustments issues	0.20	141.00
B320	07/29/14	PK	Review comments from Zolfo re: business plan adjustment issues	0.10	70.50
B320	07/29/14	PK	Telephone conference with E. Bell re: business plan adjustments issues	0.20	141.00
B320	07/30/14	AMB	Review proposed edits to correspondence re: adjustments to financial projections	0.20	140.00
B320	07/30/14	EJW	Conduct research re: adequate protection and diminution of value	3.50	1,347.50
B320	07/30/14	EJW	Office meeting with E. Chafetz re: diminution of value research status	0.30	115.50
B320	07/30/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: research into the diminution of value of collateral in the adequate protection context	0.30	177.00
B320	07/30/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: preparation for committee call and plan term sheet strategy	0.30	177.00
B320	07/30/14	ESC	Review Exide financing update from the debtor	0.20	118.00
B320	07/30/14	ESC	Follow up conference with G. Bender, P. Kizel, K. Rosen and E. Worenklein re: term sheet strategy	0.20	118.00
B320	07/30/14	GB	Follow up discussion with K. Rosen and P. Kizel re: committee call re: plan process	0.30	256.50
B320	07/30/14	GB	Review debtor's exclusivity extension motion	0.10	85.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 112
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/30/14	PK	Telephone conference with G. Bender re: draft communication to Skadden re: business plan adjustments issue (.1) and review G. Bender comments to same (.1)	0.20	141.00
B320	07/30/14	PK	Review law re: diminution of value claims by secured lenders	3.00	2,115.00
B320	07/30/14	PK	Review comments from E. Bell re: business plan adjustments issue	0.20	141.00
B320	07/30/14	PK	Review Debtor's draft motion (.2) and filed motion (.2) to extend exclusivity	0.40	282.00
B320	07/31/14	EJW	Review Debtor's motion to extend exclusivity	0.20	77.00
B320	07/31/14	EJW	Conduct research re: adequate protection and diminution of value standards	5.90	2,271.50
B320	07/31/14	EJW	Office meetings with E. Chafetz re: diminution of value research updates	0.40	154.00
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: environmental issues, term sheet, lien stipulation and other open issues	0.20	118.00
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Review debtor's third motion to extend exclusivity	0.30	177.00
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: plan term sheet negotiations	0.20	118.00
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Schwartz re: decks provided by company relating to Vernon, exit financing, business plan, etc.	0.10	59.00
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: plan term sheet issues	0.10	59.00
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender to counsel for the noteholders re: lien stipulation	0.10	59.00
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Bender and P. Kizel re: term sheet and call with debtor's counsel re: exit financing, Vernon, and business plan	0.10	59.00
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding motion to extend exclusivity	0.10	59.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 113
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: research into determining diminution in value of collateral	0.40	236.00
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with scheduling meeting with noteholders regarding term sheet	0.10	59.00
B320	07/31/14	ESC	Office meetings with E. Worenklein re: diminution of value research updates	0.40	236.00
B320	07/31/14	GB	Call with committee professionals re: MCAM and plan process	0.60	513.00
B320	07/31/14	GB	Calls with A. Eaton re: scheduling principals meeting re: plan	0.20	171.00
B320	07/31/14	PK	Preliminary review of documents forwarded by Skadden re: revised FY 2015 plan and Vernon issues	0.80	564.00
B320	07/31/14	PK	Finalize e-mail to Skadden re: business plan adjustments issues	0.30	211.50
Total B320 - Plan and Disclosure Statement (including Business Plan)				159.60	\$98,850.50

B400 - Bankruptcy-Related Advice

B430A Court Hearings

B430A	07/01/14	ESC	Phone call with G. Buccellato re: setting up court call for July 2, 2014 omnibus hearing	0.10	59.00
B430A	07/01/14	PK	Prepare for omnibus hearing tomorrow	0.50	352.50
B430A	07/02/14	ESC	Participate telephonically in omnibus hearing	1.00	590.00
B430A	07/02/14	GB	Participate by phone to court hearing re: omnibus matters, including equity committee, fee apps and Wattles discovery	1.00	855.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 114
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B430A	07/02/14	PK	Attend omnibus hearing	0.90	634.50
B430A	07/21/14	EJW	Phone call with G. Buccellato re: arranging courtcall for July 22, 2014 omnibus hearing	0.10	38.50
B430A	07/21/14	GCB	Attend to courtcall reservation for team	1.00	200.00
B430A	07/22/14	ESC	Review amended notice of agenda of matters scheduled for hearing on July 22, 2014	0.10	59.00
B430A	07/22/14	ESC	Participate telephonically on hearing related to debtor's motion to amend DIP facilities	0.30	177.00
B430A	07/22/14	PK	Appear in court on DIP financing amendment motion	0.30	211.50
B430A	07/29/14	PK	Review transcript of last court hearing	0.20	141.00
Total B430A - Court Hearings				5.50	\$3,318.00

B450 Valuation

B450	07/02/14	AMB	Conference with A. Sondhi re: valuation-related tasks to be accomplished; compile relevant documents for review	0.20	140.00
B450	07/02/14	ESC	Review P. Kizel's recap of portion of omnibus hearing related to valuation issues	0.10	59.00
B450	07/02/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with MCAM's diligence status	0.20	118.00
B450	07/03/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein and G. Bender re: Genco valuation dispute re: relevance to potential valuation dispute	0.10	59.00
B450	07/03/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: valuation research	0.30	177.00
B450	07/04/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with the Genco valuation dispute re: relevance to potential valuation dispute	0.80	472.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 115
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B450	07/07/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to M. Henkin and O. Nitzan re: interview transcript from prior CEO related to value of the debtor's European operations	0.10	59.00
B450	07/07/14	ESC	Review outline prepared by MNAT related to valuation	0.30	177.00
B450	07/07/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with O. Nitzan of Guggenheim re: board minute information	0.10	59.00
B450	07/07/14	ESC	Review Guggenheim's analysis of the debtor's board meeting minutes re: relevance to valuation issues	0.60	354.00
B450	07/08/14	ESC	Review documents associated with plan valuation preparation	0.40	236.00
B450	07/08/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to G. Bender re: valuation preparation and distribution of assignments	0.10	59.00
B450	07/09/14	AMB	Review D. Teklits memorandum re: valuation issues; review related correspondence	0.40	280.00
B450	07/09/14	ESC	Conference with G. Bender re: valuation issues	0.20	118.00
B450	07/09/14	ESC	Review documents addressing various valuation issues	0.20	118.00
B450	07/10/14	AMB	Update valuation work plan and assign responsibilities, based in part on Guggenheim findings to date	4.00	2,800.00
B450	07/10/14	ESC	Phone call with O. Nitzan re: questions regarding valuation	0.20	118.00
B450	07/10/14	KAR	Review e-mails from A. Sole re: Detroit art valuation	0.30	265.50
B450	07/11/14	ESC	Participate in valuation call regarding utility of MCAM report to plan confirmation valuation analysis with the co-chairs (M. Strollo and A. Sole), S. Thompson, E. Schwartz and O. Nitzan	1.00	590.00
B450	07/11/14	RST	Review M-CAM information; telephone conference with A. Sole, M. Strollo et al re: M-CAM	1.00	720.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 116
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B450	07/14/14	ESC	Review and revise valuation workplan	0.30	177.00
B450	07/14/14	RST	Review Carey decisions; telephone conference A. Sole, M. Strollo et al re: MCAM; conference with M. Boxer	1.30	936.00
B450	07/14/14	RST	E-mail team with work plan	0.60	432.00
B450	07/15/14	AMB	Review bankruptcy team's proposed changes to valuation work plan and make edits accordingly	0.50	350.00
B450	07/15/14	AMB	E-mails re: Detroit art valuation issues and valuation work plan	0.40	280.00
B450	07/15/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with status of valuation preparation	0.10	59.00
B450	07/15/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Worenklein re: valuation preparation	0.20	118.00
B450	07/15/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with M. Boxer, S. Thompson and G. Bender re: revised valuation work plan	0.20	118.00
B450	07/15/14	GB	Review materials sent by MNAT re: valuation issues	0.50	427.50
B450	07/16/14	AMB	Discussions concerning and revisions to valuation work plan, based on suggestions from Morris Nichols law firm and co-counsel	1.50	1,050.00
B450	07/16/14	AMB	E-mails with E. Schwartz re: valuation work plan and related issues	0.30	210.00
B450	07/16/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with the revised valuation workplan	0.30	177.00
B450	07/16/14	ESC	Review MNAT's comments to valuation workplan	0.10	59.00
B450	07/17/14	AMB	Finalize valuation work plan and correspond with client and co-counsel re: same	1.00	700.00
B450	07/17/14	AMB	Conferences with S. Thompson and E. Worenklein re: retention of expert witnesses and structure of Exide bankruptcy as asset sale	0.80	560.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 117
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B450	07/17/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel, S. Thompson and M. Boxer re: valuation issues related to business plan adjustments	0.10	59.00
B450	07/17/14	ESC	Review updated version of the work plan for valuation	0.20	118.00
B450	07/17/14	ESC	Phone call with M. Boxer re: research issues related to valuation	0.10	59.00
B450	07/17/14	GB	Communications with P. Kizel and E. Chafetz re: valuation issues raised by Guggenheim and Zolfo	0.30	256.50
B450	07/17/14	RST	Telephone conference with D. Teklits; review notes of meeting; e-mail G. Bender et al re: experts; conferences with M. Boxer	1.30	936.00
B450	07/17/14	RST	E-mails valuation team re: work plan, schedule	0.20	144.00
B450	07/18/14	AMB	E-mails re: valuation issues and MCAM retention documents	0.30	210.00
B450	07/18/14	AMB	Research re: valuation approaches in bankruptcy, particularly in Delaware cases	1.50	1,050.00
B450	07/18/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with whether an industry expert should be retained for plan valuation purposes	0.10	59.00
B450	07/18/14	GB	Communications with S. Thompson re: valuation process	0.20	171.00
B450	07/18/14	RST	Review MCAM retention documents; MCAM report; online research re: MCAM; e-mails to M. Boxer re: same	1.60	1,152.00
B450	07/19/14	ESC	Review earnings call transcripts from 2010 and 2011 re: relevance to valuation issues	0.70	413.00
B450	07/21/14	RST	E-mails D. Teklitz	0.30	216.00
B450	07/21/14	RST	Online research re: Ch. 22	1.60	1,152.00
B450	07/22/14	AMB	E-mails re: valuation-related issues	0.30	210.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 118
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B450	07/22/14	EJW	Conduct research re: duty to market test assets to maximize value	5.70	2,194.50
B450	07/22/14	KAR	Telephone conference with A. Sole re: \$5.0 million valuation	0.40	354.00
B450	07/22/14	RST	Telephone conference with D. Teklits	0.20	144.00
B450	07/22/14	RST	Review Ch. 22 articles	1.30	936.00
B450	07/22/14	RST	E-mails re: meeting with Guggenheim	0.30	216.00
B450	07/23/14	EJW	Office meeting with E. Chafetz re: research on duty to market test	0.20	77.00
B450	07/23/14	ESC	Multiple e-mails with K. Rosen, G. Bender and P. Kizel re: call to discuss valuation issues	0.10	59.00
B450	07/23/14	ESC	Multiple e-mails with committee valuation team members re: call to discuss status of valuation work	0.20	118.00
B450	07/23/14	RST	Telephone conference with E. Chafetz re: FCPA; research FCPA database re: books and records; review books and records cases; e-mails E. Chafetz	2.50	1,800.00
B450	07/24/14	AMB	E-mails re: valuation work plan and upcoming conference calls	0.20	140.00
B450	07/24/14	ESC	Review correspondence associated with status of completing tasks on valuation work plan	0.10	59.00
B450	07/24/14	GB	Address request by co-chairs for status update re: valuation efforts	0.20	171.00
B450	07/24/14	RST	Research re: FCPA; telephone conferences, e-mails re: same	1.70	1,224.00
B450	07/25/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with M. Boxer re: valuation work plan	0.10	59.00
B450	07/25/14	FTMC	Discuss case and upcoming tasks with S. Thompson	0.40	190.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 119
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B450	07/25/14	RST	Telephone conference with P. Kizel re: FCPA issues	0.30	216.00
B450	07/25/14	RST	Research cases re: books and records	1.20	864.00
B450	07/25/14	RST	Conference with F. Catalina; review data	1.00	720.00
B450	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: valuation issues	0.10	59.00
B450	07/28/14	ESC	Review updated information related to valuation	0.10	59.00
B450	07/28/14	FTMC	Review work plan, valuation cases, and pleadings to prepare for work on case	2.90	1,377.50
B450	07/28/14	FTMC	Meet with M. Boxer to discuss tasks to perform in coming weeks	0.20	95.00
B450	07/28/14	GB	Call with committee professionals re: valuation issues re: confirmation	0.50	427.50
B450	07/28/14	RST	Prepare for telephone conference with committee chairs; telephone conference with committee chairs; telephone conference with Guggenheim et al re: operations expert; telephone conference with D. Teklits; telephone conference with Guggenheim et al re: proposal, debtor deficiencies; conference with F.Catalina re: document inventory; research operations experts	5.60	4,032.00
B450	07/30/14	RST	Review data room inventory; e-mails F. Catalina re: documents needed, inventory	0.70	504.00
B450	07/31/14	EJW	Phone call with F. Catalina re: dataroom and valuation materials	0.20	77.00
B450	07/31/14	FTMC	Call with E. Worenklein re: access to data room and documents in our possession	0.30	142.50
B450	07/31/14	FTMC	Review financial projection documents; various financial presentations; and other documents provided by E. Worenklein	2.40	1,140.00
B450	07/31/14	FTMC	Set up access to online data room portal to begin indexing contents	0.30	142.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 120
 September 30, 2014

<u>Code</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Total B450 - Valuation				56.90	\$36,435.00
<u>B460 Other - Insurance Matters</u>					
B460	07/01/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to counsel for the debtor re: comments to the debtor's AFCO insurance premium finance motion	0.20	118.00
B460	07/01/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: comments to the AFCO insurance premium finance motion	0.10	59.00
B460	07/01/14	ESC	Phone call with B. Ducumb counsel for the debtor re: questions/comments regarding debtor's AFCO insurance premium finance motion	0.20	118.00
B460	07/01/14	ESC	Further comments to debtor's motion to enter into premium finance agreement with AFCO	0.20	118.00
B460	07/01/14	ESC	Multiple e-mails with E. Worenklein and G. Bender re: comments to debtor's second AFCO premium financing motion	0.20	118.00
B460	07/01/14	GB	Review afco premium financing motion	0.20	171.00
B460	07/21/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to counsel for the Debtor re: questions regarding general liability coverage cash out	0.10	59.00
Total B460 - Other - Insurance Matters				1.20	\$761.00

B460B Other - Environmental Issues

B460B	07/01/14	EJW	Conduct research re: successor liability of environmental claims	4.20	1,617.00
B460B	07/01/14	EJW	Conduct research re: classification and priority of environmental claims	3.10	1,193.50
B460B	07/01/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein research into environmental legacy liability claims	0.30	177.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 121
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/01/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to G. Bender re: questions regarding environmental legacy liabilities in section 363 sale context	0.50	295.00
B460B	07/01/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with G. Bender re: environmental issues related to potential sale process	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/01/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: research into scope of legacy environmental cleanup costs that are administrative claims	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/01/14	ESC	Review documents associated with Exide's revised Vernon mitigation plan	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/01/14	ESC	Prepare for (.2) and phone call with J. Stewart re: questions regarding treatment of legacy environmental liabilities in the section 363 sale context (.3)	0.50	295.00
B460B	07/01/14	GB	Discuss legacy environmental claim issues with E. Chafetz	0.30	256.50
B460B	07/01/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.7); summarize review (0.1)	1.80	747.00
B460B	07/02/14	EJW	Draft summary of research re: classification of environmental claims	3.60	1,386.00
B460B	07/02/14	ESC	Participate in environmental update call with T. Strang and professionals from A&M, Lowenstein, Zolfo, and Geosyntec	1.40	826.00
B460B	07/02/14	ESC	Review E. Worenklein's memo regarding treatment of environmental claims	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/02/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Worenklein re: research into treatment of environmental legacy costs	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/02/14	ESC	Review E. Worenklein's preliminary research results related to environmental legacy costs	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/02/14	ESC	Conferences with E. Worenklein re: research into treatment of environmental legacy costs	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/02/14	JS	Conference call with T. Strang, J. Leed, Zolfo Cooper et al. re: status of environmental issues at Vernon, Muncie and Canon Hollow	1.50	960.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 122
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/02/14	JS	Conference call with Unsecured Creditors' Committee re: environmental issues	1.50	960.00
B460B	07/02/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.3); summarize review (0.1)	1.40	581.00
B460B	07/03/14	EJW	Conduct additional research re: treatment of environmental claims	0.60	231.00
B460B	07/03/14	EJW	Draft e-mail to G. Rubinstein re: NDA to be executed	0.10	38.50
B460B	07/03/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: questions regarding the Vernon settlement agreement and DIP amendment	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/03/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with J. Mazza re: timing for providing comprehensive list of NOVs	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/03/14	ESC	Review debtor's presentation to the EPA	0.50	295.00
B460B	07/03/14	ESC	Review debtor's response to environmental discovery requests	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/03/14	ESC	Review findings and decision associated with the SCAQMD v. Exide Technologies' actions	0.60	354.00
B460B	07/03/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with J. Mazza re: timing for providing documents in response to environmental discovery requests	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/03/14	JS	Participate in conference call with Exide professionals re: environmental updates on Vernon and Muncie	1.00	640.00
B460B	07/03/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts and monitoring Exide-related websites (0.8); summarize review (0.1)	0.90	373.50
B460B	07/03/14	PK	Exchange e-mails with E. Chafetz re: followup with Skadden re: certain information requests re: enviro	0.10	70.50

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 123
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/03/14	PK	Review final versions of settlement of 2 order of abatement proceedings commenced by SCAQMD to be posted by SCAQMD today	0.30	211.50
B460B	07/03/14	PK	Review letter request from Exide's counsel to EPA to extend deadline to respond to certain info requests	0.10	70.50
B460B	07/04/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel and G. Bender re: open environmental discovery issues	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/04/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with order of abatement settlements	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/04/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts and monitoring Exide-related websites (0.6); summarize review (0.2)	0.80	332.00
B460B	07/05/14	NAW	Review e-mail alerts re: Exide's Vernon, California facility	0.20	83.00
B460B	07/06/14	NAW	Review e-mail alerts re: Exide's Vernon, California facility	0.20	83.00
B460B	07/07/14	ESC	Prepare for and phone call to P. Kizel re: questions regarding environmental discovery	0.40	236.00
B460B	07/07/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to counsel for the Debtor re: ERM documents related to environmental diligence	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/07/14	MDL	Review SCAQMD's 2013 Annual Report on AB 2588 Air Toxics Hot Spot Program; review SCAQMD Final Orders for Exide	1.20	864.00
B460B	07/07/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.8); summarize review (0.3)	2.10	871.50
B460B	07/08/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Bell re: requests from D. Jury related to Vernon diligence	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/08/14	ESC	Phone call and e-mail with P. Kizel re: Vernon environmental issues	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/08/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Bell of Zolfo re: questions regarding Vernon environmental issues	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 124
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/08/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to E. Worenklein re: status of the proposed findings and decisions of the hearing board for both order for abatement actions initiated by the South Coast Air Quality Management District	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/08/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with J. Stewart and N. Winningham re: D. Jury's questions regarding the proposed findings and decisions of the hearing board for both order for abatement actions initiated by the South Coast Air Quality Management District (Vernon)	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/08/14	ESC	Phone call with J. Stewart re: questions regarding Vernon environmental issues	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/08/14	JS	Review proposed settlement documents for SCAQMD and Exide at Vernon	1.00	640.00
B460B	07/08/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (2.1); summarize review (0.1)	2.20	913.00
B460B	07/09/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Bell of Zolfo re: summaries of Vernon orders of abatement and other related issues	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/09/14	ESC	Review various documents associated with recent developments at the Vernon facility	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/09/14	ESC	Review section of Colliers section addressing treatment of environmental claims	0.40	236.00
B460B	07/09/14	ESC	Review summary of Vernon orders of abatement	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/09/14	ESC	Review article from the LA Times addressing Vernon settlement	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/09/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: research into treatment of environmental liabilities in the sale context	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/09/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to J. Mazza re: questions regarding environmental due diligence	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/09/14	GB	Review E. Bell e-mail summarizing debtors settlement with AQMD	0.20	171.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 125
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/09/14	JS	Communicate with E. Bell re: environmental issues at Vernon	1.00	640.00
B460B	07/09/14	JS	Review draft summaries of environmental issues at Vernon and comment to E. Bell	0.60	384.00
B460B	07/09/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (2.2); summarize review (0.2)	2.40	996.00
B460B	07/09/14	NAW	Review materials loaded to the data room since last review for information related to environmental issues at Exide facilities	0.40	166.00
B460B	07/10/14	ESC	Review correspondence from the Debtor re: approval of stipulated orders for abatement	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/10/14	JS	Communicate with L. Malone re: Cannon Hollow landfill issues	0.40	256.00
B460B	07/10/14	JS	Participate in conference call with debtor professionals	0.50	320.00
B460B	07/10/14	MDL	Review Vernon list of SCAQMD violation 2003-present	0.60	432.00
B460B	07/10/14	NAW	Revise list of NOV's issued to Exide by SCAQMD to include to identify whether each NOV was included in the civil penalties complaint	1.10	456.50
B460B	07/10/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.7); summarize review (0.2)	1.90	788.50
B460B	07/11/14	ESC	Review SCAQMD's press release related to notice of abatement settlement related to the Vernon facility	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/11/14	GB	Communications with J. Stewart re: legacy issues and Canon Hollow environmental issues	0.30	256.50
B460B	07/11/14	GB	Review SCAQMD response re: Exide	0.20	171.00
B460B	07/11/14	JS	Communicate with P. Kizel, G. Bender and N. Winningham re: Cannon Hollow summary of landfill issues	0.40	256.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 126
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/11/14	JS	Review settlement agreement between GNB and NL and communicate with J. Winnerman re: Exide rights against NL	0.30	192.00
B460B	07/11/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.2); summarize review (0.1)	1.30	539.50
B460B	07/11/14	PK	Review e-mail from J. Stewart to Skadden re: NL agreement and impact on Vernon and review response	0.10	70.50
B460B	07/11/14	PK	Review e-mail from J. Stewart re: update re: landfill issue at Canon Hollow	0.20	141.00
B460B	07/12/14	NAW	Review e-mail alerts re: Exide's Vernon, California facility	0.20	83.00
B460B	07/13/14	NAW	Review e-mail alerts re: Exide's Vernon, California facility	0.20	83.00
B460B	07/14/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with counsel for the debtor re: status of responses to environmental discovery	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/14/14	ESC	Review documents associated with final orders of abatement	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/14/14	ESC	Phone call with J. Mazza and J. Winnerman re: status of environmental discovery	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/14/14	ESC	Phone call to M. Savetsky re: discovery requests (environmental/plan related)	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/14/14	JS	Communicate with L. Malone re: landfill issues at Cannon Hollow	0.40	256.00
B460B	07/14/14	JS	E-mail to P. Kizel, G. Bender, E. Bell and N. Winningham re: landfill issues at Cannon Hollow	0.30	192.00
B460B	07/14/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.0); summarize review (0.1)	1.10	456.50
B460B	07/15/14	ESC	Review DTSC work plan approval letter	0.10	59.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 127
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/15/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Bell of Zolfo re: status of obtaining environmental scorecard	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/15/14	ESC	Phone calls with counsel for the debtor re: status of response to environmental discovery request	0.50	295.00
B460B	07/15/14	ESC	Review documents associated with Cannon Hollow inventory investigation	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/15/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.6); summarize review (0.1)	1.70	705.50
B460B	07/15/14	PK	Review e-mail from J. Winerman and letter from DTSC approving work plan for off site remediation of two homes	0.20	141.00
B460B	07/16/14	ESC	Review list of discovery requests prepared by E. Bell regarding environmental issues	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/16/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to J. Stewart and N. Winningham additional re: additional environmental discovery requests	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/16/14	ESC	Review Exide's extension request to DTSC for the MAC HEPAs and RTO	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/16/14	ESC	Phone call with M. Berman of Geosyntec re: analysis of legacy environmental liabilities	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/16/14	ESC	Phone call with counsel for the Debtor re: environmental discovery requests	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/16/14	ESC	Review SCAQMD' s motion for leave to file a first amended complaint in the civil penalty action	0.60	354.00
B460B	07/16/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to M. Berman of Geosyntec re: status of production of ERM documents	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/16/14	GB	Review correspondence from debtor and J. Stewart re: DTSC approval of work plan extension	0.20	171.00
B460B	07/16/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (2.6); summarize review (0.3)	2.90	1,203.50

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 128
 September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/16/14	NAW	Review materials loaded to the data rooms since last review for information related to environmental issues at Exide facilities	0.40	166.00
B460B	07/17/14	ESC	Review DTSC's response to Exide's request for an extension to submit a revised Part A and Part B Application	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/17/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with N. Winningham re: environmental discovery issues	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/17/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with J. Winnerman re: updated NOV list	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/17/14	ESC	Review technical work plan off-site properties Exide Technologies Vernon, California	0.60	354.00
B460B	07/17/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: questions relating to Geosyntec's environmental liability analysis	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/17/14	ESC	Review updated NOV list prepared by the Debtor	0.40	236.00
B460B	07/17/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with M. Berman of Geosyntec re: status of the ELV analysis	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/17/14	ESC	Review conformed copy of the request for dismissal of rule challenge signed by the clerk	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/17/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (2.1); summarize review (0.3)	2.40	996.00
B460B	07/17/14	PK	Review DTSC approval of extension of various deadlines for debtor to complete/respond to third notice of deficiency	0.30	211.50
B460B	07/18/14	ESC	Review Judge Walrath's memorandum decision in the Ormet case addressing successor liability re: relevance to potential sale of the debtor's assets free and clear of environmental liabilities	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/18/14	ESC	Review update regarding meeting with the EPA in connection with the Muncie violations	0.10	59.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 129
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/18/14	ESC	Review transcript of proceedings approving orders of abatement re: Vernon facility	0.40	236.00
B460B	07/18/14	GB	E-mail to J. Blumenfeld and M. Hahn re: discussion at meeting with debtor and noteholder reps re: lead investigation	0.20	171.00
B460B	07/18/14	JS	Review documents re: environmental negotiations at Frisco and forward to N. Winningham for distribution	0.40	256.00
B460B	07/18/14	MDL	Review updates for activities at Vernon and Frisco	0.80	576.00
B460B	07/18/14	MDL	Review Exide/DTSC correspondence re: Vernon NOD	0.40	288.00
B460B	07/18/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.2); summarize review (0.4)	1.60	664.00
B460B	07/18/14	PK	Review transcripts of AQMD hearing received today	0.40	282.00
B460B	07/18/14	PK	E-mail to K. Ziman re: follow up discussion re: Muncie enviro issue and review response and e-mail to wider group requesting call	0.20	141.00
B460B	07/18/14	PK	Review and respond to e-mail from E. Bell re: Muncie/EPA update	0.20	141.00
B460B	07/19/14	NAW	Review e-mail alerts re: Exide's Vernon, California facility	0.20	83.00
B460B	07/20/14	ESC	Review documents associated with Geosyntec's environmental legacy analysis	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/20/14	NAW	Review e-mail alerts re: Exide's Vernon, California facility	0.20	83.00
B460B	07/21/14	GB	Call with P. Kizel, J. Blumenfeld and M. Hahn re: status and strategy re: lead investigation	0.50	427.50
B460B	07/21/14	JS	Conference call with Exide Munci counsel re: basis for EPA settlement demand and debtor strategy for negotiations	1.00	640.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 130
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/21/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.3); summarize review (0.3)	1.60	664.00
B460B	07/21/14	PK	Participate in call with Exide's counsel re: Muncie EPA issue	0.80	564.00
B460B	07/21/14	PK	Exchange e-mails with E. Bell re: call to R. Visser re: update on Vernon issues	0.10	70.50
B460B	07/22/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with E. Bell of Zolfo re: environmental scorecard and Vernon update	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/22/14	ESC	Review J. Stewart's response to certain of D. Jury's environmental questions	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/22/14	ESC	Review environmental scorecard and Vernon update	0.40	236.00
B460B	07/22/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with N. Winningham and J. Stewart re: responses to certain of D. Jury's environmental questions	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/22/14	ESC	Phone calls to and from P. Kizel re: Geosyntec ELV analysis and preparing flow chart relating to outstanding environmental issues	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/22/14	MDL	Review information regarding recent communications between DTSC and Exide	0.80	576.00
B460B	07/22/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.6); summarize review (0.3)	1.90	788.50
B460B	07/22/14	NAW	Respond to client questions re: legal impact of Exide's settlement with SCAQMD	0.90	373.50
B460B	07/23/14	ESC	Review debtor's letter to the EPA requesting extension to respond to document/information request	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/23/14	ESC	Review case management order related AQMD versus Exide (civil penalty action)	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/23/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: MCAM issues, questions regarding the Geosyntec ELV analysis, avis Polk fee issue, Schnader Harrison, environmental scorecard, and various discovery issues	0.20	118.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 131
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/23/14	ESC	Review environmental updates associated with the Vernon and Muncie facilities	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/23/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.2); summarize review (0.2)	1.40	581.00
B460B	07/24/14	EJW	Review and analyze draft settlement proposal re: Frisco	0.20	77.00
B460B	07/24/14	ESC	Phone call to M. Berman re: status of ELV analysis	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/24/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Bell re: obtaining detailed environmental scorecard	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/24/14	ESC	Phone call and e-mail exchange with E. Bell re: Frisco settlement documents	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/24/14	ESC	Phone calls to and from G. Rubinstein re: independent monitor for South Coast AQMD	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/24/14	ESC	Conference with E. Worenklein re: status of research into market testing of rights offering and scope of environmental liabilities	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/24/14	ESC	Review proposed Frisco settlement documents	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/24/14	ESC	Review letter from the debtor to the EPA re: request for extension to perform NESHAP performance test	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/24/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with P. Kizel re: issues with appointing independent monitor for South Coast AQMD	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/24/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: recap of call with G. Rubinstein re: appointing independent monitor	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/24/14	GB	Review settlement proposal re: Frisco environmental	0.30	256.50
B460B	07/24/14	MDL	Brief review of selected portions of transcript of SCAQMD hearing	1.80	1,296.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 132
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/24/14	NAW	Review materials loaded to the data rooms since last review for information related to environmental issues at Exide facilities	0.40	166.00
B460B	07/24/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related website; summarize review	2.10	871.50
B460B	07/24/14	PK	Review e-mail from G. Rubenstein re; AQMD independent observer issue (.1) and e-mail to LS group re: same (.1)	0.20	141.00
B460B	07/25/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to M. Berman and J. Leeds of Geosyntec re: proposed Frisco property settlement	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/25/14	ESC	Review correspondence (and attachments) from G. Rubenstein re: becoming independent observer for the Vernon facility	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/25/14	ESC	E-mail exchanges with G. Bender and P. Kizel re: settlement proposal related to the Frisco property	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/25/14	ESC	Review variance petition seeking an extension of time to conduct a required source test under rule 1420.1(k)(13)	0.40	236.00
B460B	07/25/14	ESC	Review debtor's response to certain categories in June 20, 2014 request for information under Section 114(a) of the Clean Air Act	0.60	354.00
B460B	07/25/14	ESC	Draft e-mail to M. Berman re: status of environmental liabilities analysis	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/25/14	ESC	Review documents from Geosyntec re: details and scope of ELV analysis	0.90	531.00
B460B	07/25/14	JS	Communicate with M. McKibben re: NL indemnity, lead speciation and other Vernon issues	0.40	256.00
B460B	07/25/14	MDL	Review DTSC's comments on Exide's IMWP for Vernon	0.40	288.00
B460B	07/25/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.6); summarize review (.3)	1.90	788.50

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 133
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/26/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with M. Berman of Geosyntec re: ELV analysis	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/26/14	NAW	Review e-mail alerts re: Exide's Vernon, California facility	0.20	83.00
B460B	07/27/14	NAW	Review e-mail alerts re: Exide's Vernon, California facility	0.20	83.00
B460B	07/28/14	ESC	Phone call with M. Berman re: ELV analysis	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/28/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (2.0); summarize review (0.1)	2.10	871.50
B460B	07/28/14	PK	Telephone call to R. Visser re: AQMD observer request	0.10	70.50
B460B	07/29/14	ESC	Review results of ERM's environmental liability evaluation analysis	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/29/14	ESC	Review DTSC's response to Exide's request for an extension to submit its interim measures work plan revision	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/29/14	ESC	Review letter from Exide to the DTSC re: Exide's containment building leak detection system	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/29/14	ESC	Review recap of call with T. Strang and accompanying correspondence re: updates regarding the Vernon facility	0.30	177.00
B460B	07/29/14	GB	Review and comment on draft letter to debtor re: business case adjustment requests	0.30	256.50
B460B	07/29/14	JS	Communicate with M. McKibben re: Vernon environmental issues	0.30	192.00
B460B	07/29/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.6); summarize review (0.1)	1.70	705.50

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 134
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/29/14	PK	Review e-mail and attachment from J. Winerman re: letter from Exide to DTSC re; leak detection system issue at Vernon (.2) and e-mail from E. Bell to Winerman re: same (.1)	0.30	211.50
B460B	07/29/14	PK	Review e-mail from E. Bell re: various Vernon issues/updates	0.20	141.00
B460B	07/30/14	ESC	Phone call with P. Kizel re: ELV analysis	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/30/14	ESC	Review boundary suggestions for offsite soil clean up area at Vernon	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/30/14	ESC	Review take of potential clean-up costs for various clean up levels / areas / and % of homes affected	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/30/14	ESC	Review Vernon Recycling facility update as of July 30, 2014	0.40	236.00
B460B	07/30/14	GB	Review e-mail from K. Ziman (Skadden) re: financing and Vernon update	0.30	256.50
B460B	07/30/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.5); summarize review (0.1)	1.60	664.00
B460B	07/30/14	NAW	Review materials loaded to the data rooms since last review for information related to environmental issues at Exide facilities	0.40	166.00
B460B	07/30/14	PK	Review e-mail from G. Rubenstein regarding AQMD observer position	0.10	70.50
B460B	07/31/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with J. Stewart re: various Vernon updates	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/31/14	ESC	E-mail exchange with N. Adame Winningham re: Vernon issues	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/31/14	ESC	Review letter from the debtor to the DTSC re: dispute resolution issues	0.10	59.00
B460B	07/31/14	ESC	Phone call with J. Stewart re: various environmental issues (Vernon)	0.20	118.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 135
September 30, 2014

Code	Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
B460B	07/31/14	ESC	Phone call with E. Bell re: updated environmental scorecard chart and other environmental issues	0.20	118.00
B460B	07/31/14	GB	Call with debtor's professionals re: legal, environmental and business update	0.40	342.00
B460B	07/31/14	GB	Review McKibbon e-mail re: DTSC Vernon update	0.20	171.00
B460B	07/31/14	JS	Participate in call with Exide professionals re: status of environmental issues	0.50	320.00
B460B	07/31/14	JS	Review summary of outstanding environmental issues at Vernon and prepare for conference call	0.70	448.00
B460B	07/31/14	MDL	Review various Vernon related updates	0.70	504.00
B460B	07/31/14	NAW	Review Vernon-related updates provided by Exide and Geosyntec's comments re: same	0.80	332.00
B460B	07/31/14	NAW	Continue to monitor environmental activities and events at Exide's Vernon, California facility by reviewing e-mail alerts, conducting internet searches, and monitoring Exide-related websites (1.8); summarize review (0.1)	1.90	788.50
B460B	07/31/14	PK	Review e-mail from J. Winerman re:letter to DTSC and review letter (.2)and respond to e-mail and revised letter (.1)	0.30	211.50
B460B	07/31/14	PK	Review e-mail from J. Winerman and attachment re: Exide dispute resolution letter to DTSC (.1) and respond (.1) and review revised letter (.1)	0.30	211.50
B460B	07/31/14	PK	Review e-mail from Geosyntec re: thoughts on various Vernon issues	0.30	211.50
Total B460B - Other - Environmental Issues				109.70	\$57,065.50

EXHIBIT ‘B’

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632

Page 137
September 30, 2014

EXHIBIT B**Actual and necessary disbursements incurred by Lowenstein Sandler LLP****II. Summary of Disbursement Charges**

Messenger and delivery charges	\$22.96
Computerized legal research	2,556.02
Searches	90.74
Telecommunications	2,263.37
Travel	8,245.47
Photocopies 866 pages at \$0.10 per page	86.60
Total Disbursements	\$13,265.16

The above charges are based upon time and expense records available on or about the date of the attached letter. Such records are believed in good faith to be accurate and substantially up to date, but there may be fees and expenses that have not been processed as of such date which Lowenstein Sandler LLP may submit in the future. Lowenstein Sandler LLP reserves the right to amend this monthly statement at a later date.

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632

Page 138
September 30, 2014

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 139
 September 30, 2014

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/02/14	Searches VENDOR: BNA; INVOICE#: 50898740; DATE: 7/2/2014	\$42.59
07/07/14	Searches VENDOR: Bloomberg L. P.; INVOICE#: 5602494587; DATE: 7/7/2014	48.15
07/11/14	Other Telecommunications Charges VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: 072814; DATE: 7/28/2014 Courtcall - telephonic court appearance	47.08
07/11/14	Other Telecommunications Charges VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: 072814; DATE: 7/28/2014 Courtcall - telephonic court appearance	47.08
06/02/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	0.17
06/02/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	4.71
06/02/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	3.00
06/02/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	1.45
06/03/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	86.58
06/06/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	10.84
06/08/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	0.04
06/08/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	5.13
06/08/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	11.22
06/09/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	1.11
06/09/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	3.67
06/09/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	10.58
06/09/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - CAN	37.71
06/09/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	192.92
06/09/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	8.81

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 140
 September 30, 2014

06/10/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	0.56
06/10/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	4.33
06/10/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	0.04
06/10/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	4.91
06/11/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	22.47
06/11/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	8.38
06/12/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	22.89
06/12/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	75.99
06/13/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	18.16
06/14/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	3.00
06/14/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	1.56
06/14/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	4.15
06/14/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	0.14
06/14/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	21.22
06/16/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	42.69
06/16/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	5.85
06/17/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	5.83
06/17/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	4.15
06/17/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	0.14
06/17/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	97.09

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 141
 September 30, 2014

	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/18/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	7.40
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/18/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	35.23
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/18/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	4.15
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	
06/18/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	0.14
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/18/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	3.64
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	
06/18/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	0.78
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/18/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	4.02
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	
06/18/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	0.29
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/19/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	33.83
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/20/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	5.10
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/23/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	20.18
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/23/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	5.48
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/24/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	8.20
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/24/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	17.61
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/24/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	3.64
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	
06/24/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	0.76
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/25/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	23.49
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/25/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	20.05
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/26/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	51.31
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014	

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 142
 September 30, 2014

	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
06/26/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	4.15
06/26/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	0.14
06/26/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	4.19
06/26/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	0.10
06/26/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	99.10
06/30/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	27.68
06/30/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16433444 DATE: 6/30/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	11.11
07/01/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	1.54
07/01/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	3.14
07/02/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	144.29
07/03/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	62.71
07/07/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	20.05
07/07/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	4.15
07/07/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	0.14
07/09/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	56.72
07/09/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	3.51
07/09/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	0.91
07/10/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	24.14
07/10/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	28.36

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 143
 September 30, 2014

07/10/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	145.48
07/10/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	4.15
07/10/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	0.14
07/11/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	29.02
07/11/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	0.94
07/11/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	3.82
07/14/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	26.10
07/14/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	10.07
07/15/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	1.33
07/15/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	3.39
07/16/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	12.75
07/16/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	6.76
07/17/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	39.04
07/21/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	18.80
07/21/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	31.09
07/21/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	7.40
07/21/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	2.91
07/21/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	1.58
07/21/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014 GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	4.15
07/21/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	0.14

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 144
 September 30, 2014

	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/22/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	16.77
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/23/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	4.11
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	
07/23/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	0.20
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/23/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	1.07
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	
07/23/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	3.76
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/23/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	7.62
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/23/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	69.42
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/25/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	1.24
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	
07/25/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	3.59
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/25/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	9.19
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/28/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	39.97
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/28/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	26.49
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/28/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	9.01
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/29/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	22.87
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/29/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	3.00
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Call Minimum Shortfall	
07/29/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	1.50
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/30/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	13.19
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/30/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	116.55
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	
	GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA	
07/31/14	Long distance telephone - External VENDOR: Premiere	7.68
	Global Services INVOICE#: 16795489 DATE: 7/31/2014	

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 145
September 30, 2014

GlobalMeet® Audio NA - Toll Free - USA

07/07/14	Travel - Accommodations VENDOR: Bender, Gerald C.; INVOICE#: 070914; DATE: 7/9/2014 Hotel in Charlottesville 2 nights	509.76
07/08/14	Travel - Accommodations VENDOR: Paradiso, Robert J.; INVOICE#: 072514-2; DATE: 7/25/2014 Travel to/from Charlottesville VA, Meeting with MCAM	275.96
07/09/14	Travel - Accommodations VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: 072814; DATE: 7/28/2014 Charlottesville - Bender's Hotel for MCAM meeting	243.75
07/09/14	Travel - Accommodations VENDOR: American Express; INVOICE#: 072814; DATE: 7/28/2014 Charlottesville - Paradiso's Hotel for MCAM meeting	243.75
07/23/14	Travel - Accommodations VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Lodging at Hilton Hotel	239.93
07/23/14	Travel - Accommodations VENDOR: Hahn, Michael J.; INVOICE#: 090414; DATE: 9/4/2014 Attend meeting with debtor and economic consulting firm in Alpharetta GA	359.34
07/24/14	Travel - Accommodations VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Hyatt Hotel in GA	465.87
07/07/14	Travel - Airfare VENDOR: Bender, Gerald C.; INVOICE#: 070914; DATE: 7/9/2014 R/T Airfare Charlottesville, VA for M-CAM presentation	872.00
07/08/14	Travel - Airfare VENDOR: Paradiso, Robert J.; INVOICE#: 072514-2; DATE: 7/25/2014 Travel to/from Charlottesville VA- Meeting with MCAM	1,067.00
07/08/14	Travel - Airfare VENDOR: American Express/Trv. INVOICE#: 072814 DATE: 7/28/2014 Ticket #: 7463602907; Route: CHO LGA; Date: 07/09/2014; LTS #: 133157	578.00
07/08/14	Travel - Airfare VENDOR: American Express/Trv. INVOICE#: 072814 DATE: 7/28/2014 Ticket #: 0622865374; Route: ; Date: ; LTS #: 133157	39.00
07/25/14	Travel - Airfare VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Coach airfare from Newark-ATL- DC	1,179.65
07/01/14	Amtrak Rail travel VENDOR: American Express/Trv. INVOICE#: 072814 DATE: 7/28/2014 Ticket #: 4070115421; Route: NWK WIL NWK; Date: 07/02/2014; LTS #: 132714	224.00
07/01/14	Amtrak Rail travel VENDOR: American Express/Trv. INVOICE#: 072814 DATE: 7/28/2014 Ticket #: 0622666335; Route: ; Date: ; LTS #: 132714	39.00
07/21/14	Amtrak Rail travel VENDOR: American Express/Trv. INVOICE#: 072814 DATE: 7/28/2014 Ticket #: 4072115232; Route: NWK WIL NWK; Date: 07/22/2014; LTS #: 134229	277.00
07/21/14	Amtrak Rail travel VENDOR: American Express/Trv. INVOICE#: 072814 DATE: 7/28/2014 Ticket #: 0623340960; Route: ; Date: ; LTS #: 134229	39.00
07/07/14	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc...) VENDOR: Bender, Gerald C.; INVOICE#: 070914; DATE: 7/9/2014 Cab fare to office with bag for trip to Charlottesville VA	15.00
07/07/14	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc...) VENDOR: Bender, Gerald C.; INVOICE#: 070914; DATE: 7/9/2014 Cab fare from airport to hotel in Charlottesville	40.00

ALL DETAILED INFORMATION IS CONSIDERED TO BE PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL.

Exide Creditors Committee
 Invoice No.: 706632

Page 146
 September 30, 2014

07/08/14	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc...) VENDOR: Hahn, Michael J.; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Attend meetings in DC	31.86
07/08/14	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc...) VENDOR: Hahn, Michael J.; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Drove to Trenton Station to DC/ Attend meetings with economists	230.80
07/08/14	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc...) VENDOR: Paradiso, Robert J.; INVOICE#: 072514-2; DATE: 7/25/2014 Travel to/from Charlottesville VA- Meeting with MCAM	130.16
07/23/14	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc...) VENDOR: Hahn, Michael J.; INVOICE#: 090414; DATE: 9/4/2014 Attend meeting with debtor and economic consulting firm in Alpharetta GA	12.62
07/23/14	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc...) VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Car service from NYC to Newark airport	88.80
07/24/14	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc...) VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Car service to dinner for LS team and economists	16.00
07/25/14	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc...) VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Train to airport	5.00
07/25/14	Out of town ground travel (mileage, taxi, tolls etc...) VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Parking at airport	110.00
07/08/14	Meals (out of town travel) VENDOR: Paradiso, Robert J.; INVOICE#: 072514-2; DATE: 7/25/2014 Travel to/from Charlottesville VA- Meeting with MCAM	26.13
07/08/14	Meals (out of town travel) VENDOR: Hahn, Michael J.; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Attend meetings in DC	24.67
07/08/14	Meals (out of town travel) VENDOR: Bender, Gerald C.; INVOICE#: 070914; DATE: 7/9/2014 Lunch for G. Bender, D. MacGreevey, O. Nitzan, E. Schwarts and R. Paradiso during M-Cam presentation	95.09
07/23/14	Meals (out of town travel) VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014	26.01
07/23/14	Meals (out of town travel) VENDOR: Hahn, Michael J.; INVOICE#: 090414; DATE: 9/4/2014 Attend meeting with debtor and economic consulting firm in Alpharetta GA	26.54
07/24/14	Meals (out of town travel) VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Dinner for Blumenfeld, M. Hahn, W. Waszmer and K. Kuhn (King & Spalding)	116.30
07/25/14	Meals (out of town travel) VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014 Breakfast with M. Hahn and K. Kuhn (economic consultant)	78.92
07/25/14	Meals (out of town travel) VENDOR: Blumenfeld, Jeffrey; INVOICE#: 072514; DATE: 7/25/2014	6.57
07/01/14	Local Travel VENDOR: Rosen, Kenneth A.; INVOICE#: 072114; DATE: 7/21/2014 Park in NYC for meeting with Paul Weiss	17.00
07/07/14	Local Travel VENDOR: Bender, Gerald C.; INVOICE#: 080614; DATE: 8/6/2014 Cab fare to office with bags for trip out of town	12.00

Exide Creditors Committee
Invoice No.: 706632Page 147
September 30, 2014

07/15/14	Local Travel VENDOR: MTG Group, Inc.; INVOICE#: 40000021; DATE: 7/15/2014 - From: LAG Airport / To: EWR Airport / Travel Date: 7/9/2014	202.00
07/15/14	Local Travel VENDOR: Sunny's Worldwide Chauffeured Transporta; INVOICE#: 133732; DATE: 7/15/2014 - From: LS - NY Office / To: LGA Airport / Travel Date: 7/7/2014	87.69
07/15/14	Local Travel VENDOR: Sunny's Worldwide Chauffeured Transporta; INVOICE#: 133732; DATE: 7/15/2014 - From: LGA Airport / To: 130 Jane Street, NY / Travel Date: 7/9/2014	78.26
07/15/14	Local Travel VENDOR: Sunny's Worldwide Chauffeured Transporta; INVOICE#: 133732; DATE: 7/15/2014 - From: LS - NY Office / To: 1154 East 31st Street, NY / Travel Date: 7/10/2014	88.04
07/22/14	Local Travel VENDOR: Kizel, Paul; INVOICE#: 080114; DATE: 8/1/2014 Travel to/from DE for hearing	27.00
	Federal Express	22.96
06/30/14	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: LS2942-Q22014 DATE: 7/29/2014 Date range: 04/01/2014-06/30/2014	\$110.50
06/30/14	Computerized legal research: Pacer: VENDOR: Pacer Service Center INVOICE#: LS2941-Q22014 DATE: 7/29/2014 Date range: 04/01/2014-06/30/2014	299.30
07/01/14	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: WORENKLEIN,ELIE / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 7 / Docs/Lines: 1	167.98
07/02/14	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: WORENKLEIN,ELIE / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 7 / Docs/Lines: 3	167.98
07/08/14	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: WORENKLEIN,ELIE / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 4 / Docs/Lines: 0	589.94
07/10/14	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: WORENKLEIN,ELIE / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 6 / Docs/Lines: 1	162.98
07/22/14	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: WORENKLEIN,ELIE / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 10 / Docs/Lines: 1	367.96
07/28/14	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: TAGGART,KATHY / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 1 / Docs/Lines: 0	98.99
07/24/14	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: WORENKLEIN,ELIE / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 5 / Docs/Lines: 1	162.98
07/28/14	Computerized legal research: Westlaw: User Name: WORENKLEIN,ELIE / Duration of Search: 00:00 / Transaction: 15 / Docs/Lines: 0	389.96
07/28/14	Computerized legal research: Lexis: User: WORENKLEIN, ELIE; Service: LEXIS LEGAL SERVICES; Charge Type: DOCUMENT PRINTING-1.00; SINGLE DOCUMENT RETRIEVAL-1.00;;	37.45
	Internal photocopies: 866 pages at \$0.10 per page	86.60
	Total Disbursements	<u>\$13,265.16</u>

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

EXIDE TECHNOLOGIES,¹

Debtor.

Chapter 11

Case No. 13-11482 (KJC)

**Objections Due: November 4, 2014 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)
Hearing Date: Only if objections are filed**

**NOTICE OF FOURTEENTH MONTHLY APPLICATION OF LOWENSTEIN
SANDLER LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED AS COUNSEL TO THE
OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD
JULY 1, 2014 THROUGH JULY 31, 2014**

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that, on October 14, 2014, Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP as co-counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "Committee") in the above-captioned case, filed the attached **Fourteenth Monthly Application Of Lowenstein Sandler LLP For Compensation For Services Rendered And Reimbursement Of Expenses Incurred As Counsel To The Official Committee Of Unsecured Creditors For The Period July 1, 2014 Through July 31, 2014** (the "Application").

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application, must: (a) filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court, 824 North Market Street, 3rd Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, by **November 4, 2014 at 4:00 p.m. (Eastern Time)** (the "Objection Deadline"); and (b) be served so as to be received on or before the Objection Deadline by:

(i) the Applicant: Lowenstein Sandler LLP, 65 Livingston Avenue, Roseland, NJ 07068, Attn: Kenneth A. Rosen, Sharon L. Levine, and Paul Kizel and 1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, NY 10020, Attn: Gerald C. Bender;

(ii) the Debtors: c/o Exide Technologies, 13000 Deerfield Parkway, Building 200, Milton, GA 30004, Attn: Phillip A. Damaska;

(iii) counsel for the Debtors: Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP, Four Times Square, New York, NY 10036, Attn: Kenneth S. Ziman and J. Eric Ivester and Rodney Square, 1100 North Market Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Anthony W. Clark and 155 N. Wacker Drive, Chicago, IL 60606-1720, Attn: James J. Mazza, Jr.;

(iv) the Office of the United States Trustee: 844 North King Street, Room 2207, Lockbox 35, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Mark S. Kenney, Esq.;

¹ The last four digits of the Debtor's taxpayer identification number are 2730. The Debtor's corporate headquarters are located at 13000 Deerfield Parkway, Building 200, Milton, Georgia 30004.

(v) co-counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors: Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, 1201 N. Market Street, Suite 1600, Wilmington, DE 19801 Attn: Eric D. Schwartz, Esq. and Erin R. Fay;

(vi) counsel to the agent under the debtor in possession financing: Davis, Polk & Wardwell LLP, 450 Lexington Avenue, New York, NY 10017, Attn: Damian S. Schaible and Richards, Layton & Finger, P.A., One Rodney Square, 920 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Mark D. Collins;

(vii) counsel to the agent for the Debtor's prepetition secured lenders: Greenberg Traurig, LLP, 3333 Piedmont Road NE, Suite 2500, Atlanta, GA 30305, Attn: David B. Kurzweil and 1007 N. Orange Street, Suite 1200, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Dennis A. Meloro;

(viii) the indenture trustee for the Debtor's secured bond issuances and its counsel: Wells Fargo Bank, N.A., 150 East 42nd Street, 40th Floor, New York, NY 10017, Attn: James R. Lewis and Foley & Lardner LLP, 321 North Clark Street, Suite 2800, Chicago, IL 60654, Attn: Mark F. Hebbeln;

(ix) the indenture trustee for the Debtor's unsecured bond issuances and its counsel: U.S. Bank National Association, Global Corporate Trust Services, 60 Livingston Avenue, EP-MN-WSID, St. Paul, MN 55107, Attn: Cindy Woodward and Arent Fox LLP, 1675 Broadway, New York, NY 10019, Attn: Andrew Silfen;

(x) counsel to the unofficial committee of senior secured noteholders: Paul, Weiss, Rifking, Wharton & Garrison LLP, 1285 Avenue of the Americas, New York, NY 10019, Attn: Alice Belisle Eaton and Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Pauline K. Morgan; and

(xi) the fee examiner and his counsel: Bernstein Shur, 100 Middle Street, P.O. Box 9729, Portland, ME 04104-5029, Attn: Robert J. Keach, Michael Fagone, and Sam Anderson.

A HEARING ON THE APPLICATION, IF NECESSARY, WILL BE HELD AT THE CONVENIENCE OF THE COURT AND NOTICE OF ANY SUCH HEARING WILL BE GIVEN ONLY TO THE OBJECTING PARTY OR PARTIES.

IF YOU FAIL TO RESPOND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS NOTICE, THE COURT MAY GRANT THE RELIEF REQUESTED BY THE APPLICATION WITHOUT FURTHER NOTICE OR HEARING.

Dated: October 14, 2014
Wilmington, Delaware

MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP

/s/ Christopher M. Hayes

Robert J. Dehney (No. 3578)
Eric D. Schwartz (No. 3134)
Erin R. Fay (No. 5268)
Christopher M. Hayes (No. 5902)
1201 North Market Street
P. O. Box 1347
Wilmington, DE 19899
Telephone: (302) 658-9200
Facsimile: (302) 658-3989
Email: rdehney@mnat.com
eschwartz@mnat.com
efay@mnat.com
chayes@mnat.com

-and-

LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP

Kenneth A. Rosen, Esq.
Sharon L. Levine, Esq.
Paul Kizel, Esq.
65 Livingston Avenue
Roseland, NJ 07068
Telephone: (973) 597-2500
Facsimile: (973) 597-2400

-and-

Gerald C. Bender, Esq.
1251 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10020
Telephone: (212) 262-6700
Facsimile: (212) 262-7402

Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

7495901.13

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, Christopher M. Hayes, certify that I am not less than 18 years of age, and that service of the foregoing **Fourteenth Monthly Application Of Lowenstein Sandler LLP For Compensation For Services Rendered And Reimbursement Of Expenses Incurred As Counsel To The Official Committee Of Unsecured Creditors For The Period July 1, 2014 Through July 31, 2014** was caused to be made on October 14, 2014, in the manner indicated, upon the entities identified below.

Date: October 14, 2014

/s/ Christopher M. Hayes
Christopher M. Hayes (No. 5902)

BY HAND DELIVERY

Mark S. Kenney
Office of the United States Trustee
for the District of Delaware
J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building
Room 2207, Lockbox 35
844 North King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801

Pauline K. Morgan
Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor LLP
Rodney Square
1000 King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801

Anthony W. Clark
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher &
Flom LLP
One Rodney Square
920 N. King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801

Dennis A. Meloro
Greenberg Traurig, LLP
1007 N. Orange Street, Suite 1200
Wilmington, DE 19801

Mark D. Collins
Richards, Layton & Finger, P.A.
One Rodney Square
920 North King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801

BY FIRST CLASS MAIL

James J. Mazza, Jr.
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher &
Flom LLP
155 N. Wacker Drive
Chicago, IL 60606-1720

Alice Belisle Eaton
Paul, Weiss, Rifking, Wharton &
Garrison LLP
1285 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10019

Kenneth S. Ziman
J. Eric Ivester
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher &
Flom LLP
Four Times Square
New York, NY 10036

BY FIRST CLASS MAIL

Exide Technologies
13000 Deerfield Parkway
Building 200
Milton, GA 30004
Attn: Phillip A. Damaska

Damian S. Schaible
Davis, Polk & Wardwell LLP
450 Lexington Avenue
New York, NY 10017

David B. Kurzweil
Greenberg Traurig, LLP
3333 Piedmont Road NE
Suite 2500
Atlanta, GA 30305

Wells Fargo Bank, N.A.
150 East 42nd Street, 40th Floor
New York, NY 10017
Attn: James R. Lewis

Mark F. Hebbeln
Foley & Lardner LLP
321 North Clark Street, Suite 2800
Chicago, IL 60654

U.S. Bank National Association
Global Corporate Trust Services
60 Livingston Avenue, EP-MN-WSID
St. Paul, MN 55107
Attn: Cindy Woodward

Andrew Silfen
Arent Fox LLP
1675 Broadway
New York, NY 10019

Kenneth A. Rosen, Esq.
Sharon L. Levine, Esq.
Paul Kizel, Esq.
Lowenstein Sandler LLP
65 Livingston Avenue
Roseland, NJ 07068

Gerald C. Bender, Esq.
Lowenstein Sandler LLP
1251 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10020

Robert J. Keach
Michael Fagone
Sam Anderson
Bernstein Shur
100 Middle Street
P.O. Box 9729
Portland, ME 04104-5029