

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

EXIDE TECHNOLOGIES,¹

Debtor.

Chapter 11

Case No. 13-11482 (KJC)

Objections Due: May 19, 2015 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

TWENTY-SECOND MONTHLY APPLICATION OF MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP, AS CO-COUNSEL FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS, FOR ALLOWANCE OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND FOR INTERIM REIMBURSEMENT OF ALL ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2015 THROUGH MARCH 27, 2015

Name of Applicant: MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP

Authorized to Provide Professional Services to: Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

Date of Retention: August 6, 2013 nunc pro tunc to June 18, 2013

Period for which compensation and reimbursement is sought: March 1, 2015 through and including March 27, 2015

Amount of compensation sought as actual, reasonable and necessary: \$139,928.00

Amount of reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable and necessary: \$12,314.37

This is an x interim ___ final application

The total time expended to prepare this application was approximately 4.0 hours and the corresponding compensation requested will be approximately \$1,310.00.²

¹ The last four digits of the Debtor's taxpayer identification number are 2730. The Debtor's corporate headquarters are located at 13000 Deerfield Parkway, Building 200, Milton, Georgia 30004.

² Allowance for compensation for such time will be sought in subsequent fee applications.

If this is not the first application filed, disclose the following for each prior application:

| DATE FILED | PERIOD COVERED | REQUESTED FEES/EXPENSES | APPROVED FEES/EXPENSES |
|-------------------|---|--------------------------------|---------------------------------------|
| 9/17/13 | 6/18/13 – 6/30/13 | \$62,474.50/1,492.35 | \$49,979.60/1,492.35 |
| 9/17/13 | 7/1/13 – 7/31/13 | \$190,754.00/7,446.19 | \$152,603.20/7,446.19 |
| 10/7/13 | 8/1/13 – 8/31/13 | \$144,785.75/5,068.63 | \$144,785.75/5,068.63 |
| 10/17/13 | 6/18/13 – 8/31/13 (Quarterly Period) | \$398,014.25/\$14,007.17 | \$384,581.25/\$13,332.82 ³ |
| 11/4/13 | 9/1/13 – 9/30/13 | \$88,356.00/\$2,699.53 | \$70,684.80/\$2,699.53 |
| 11/26/13 | 10/1/13 – 10/31/13 | \$87,292.25/\$6,131.08 | \$69,833.80/\$6,131.08 |
| 1/8/14 | 11/1/13 – 11/30/13 | \$89,159.50/\$6,016.31 | \$71,327.60/\$6,016.31 |
| 1/14/14 | 9/1/13-11/30/14 (Quarterly Period) | \$264,807.75/ \$14,846.92 | \$256,506.80/\$14,600.42 ⁴ |
| 2/12/14 | 12/1/13 – 12/31/13 | \$55,584.50/\$3,144.66 | \$44,467.60/\$3,144.66 |
| 3/18/14 | 1/1/14 – 1/31/14 | \$87,083.50/\$6,322.10 | \$69,666.80/\$6,322.10 |
| 4/9/14 | 2/1/14 – 2/28/14 | \$68,968.75/\$1,783.05 | \$55,175.00/\$1,783.05 |
| 4/29/14 | 12/1/13 – 2/28/14 (Quarterly Period) | \$210,636.75/\$42,127.35 | \$210,636.75/\$42,127.35 ⁵ |

³ This amount includes Morris Nichols' agreed upon voluntary reduction of its requested fees and costs in the aggregate amount of \$14,107.35 for the quarterly period.

⁴ This amount includes Morris Nichols' agreed upon voluntary reduction of its requested fees and costs in the aggregate amount of \$8,547.45 for the quarterly period.

⁵ This amount includes Morris Nichols' agreed upon voluntary reduction of its requested fees and costs in the aggregate amount of \$1,482.45 for the quarterly period.

| | | | |
|----------|--|--------------------------|---------------------------------------|
| 6/3/14 | 3/1/14 – 3/31/14 | \$72,569.50/\$2,708.25 | \$58,055.60/\$2,708.25 |
| 6/26/14 | 4/1/14 – 4/30/14 | \$87,245.75/\$7,337.94 | \$69,796.60/\$7,337.94 |
| 7/18/14 | 5/1/14 – 5/31/14 | \$91,908.25/\$3,830.72 | \$73,526.60/\$3,830.72 |
| 7/30/14 | 3/1/14 – 5/31/14 (Quarterly Period) | \$251,723.50/\$13,876.91 | \$250,158.40/\$13,446.94 ⁶ |
| 9/2/14 | 6/1/14 – 6/30/14 | \$129,895.00/\$7,347.89 | \$103,916.00/\$7,347.89 |
| 9/19/14 | 7/1/14 – 7/31/14 | \$127,567.75/\$6,755.55 | \$102,054.20/\$6,755.55 |
| 10/6/14 | 8/1/14 – 8/31/14 | \$83,888.50/\$1,236.27 | \$67,110.80/\$1,236.27 |
| 10/27/14 | 6/1/14 – 8/31/14 (Quarterly Period) | \$341,351.25/\$15,339.71 | \$331,652.65/\$15,339.71 ⁷ |
| 11/6/14 | 9/1/14 – 9/30/14 | \$107,059.50/\$2,547.41 | \$85,647.60/\$2,547.41 |
| 12/18/14 | 10/1/14 – 10/31/14 | \$245,464.25/\$26,846.84 | \$196,371.40/\$26,846.84 |
| 1/26/15 | 11/1/14-11/30/14 | \$164,296.75/\$4,101.30 | \$131,437.40/\$4,101.30 |
| 1/29/15 | 9/1/14-11/30/14 (Quarterly Period) | \$516,820.50/\$33,495.55 | Pending |
| 2/12/15 | 12/1/14-12/31/14 | \$181,992.00/\$11,478.11 | \$145,593.60/\$11,478.11 |
| 3/16/15 | 1/1/15-1/31/15 | \$247,347.25/\$13,775.53 | \$197,877.80/\$13,775.53 |
| 4/8/15 | 2/1/15-2/28/15 | \$176,204.00/\$6,154.03 | Pending |

⁶ This amount includes Morris Nichols' agreed upon voluntary reduction of its requested fees and costs in the aggregate amount of \$1,995.07 for the quarterly period.

⁷ This amount includes Morris Nichols' agreed upon voluntary reduction of its requested fees and costs in the aggregate amount of \$9,698.60 for the quarterly period.

COMPENSATION BY PROFESSIONAL
Exide Technologies
(Case No. 13-11482 (KJC))
March 1, 2015 through March 27, 2015

| Name of Professional Person | Position of the Applicant and Area of Expertise | Year of Bar Admission/ Licensure | Hourly Billing Rate (including changes) | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation |
|---|--|---|--|---------------------------|---------------------------|
| Robert J. Dehney | Partner/ Bankruptcy/16 years/ prior experience as a bankruptcy associate | 1990 (Connecticut) 1995 (New York) 1997 (Delaware) 1997 (Pennsylvania) | \$ 910.00 | 7.0 | \$ 6,370.00 |
| Donald E. Reid | Partner/Corporate/28 years/prior experience as a corporate associate | 1979 (Pennsylvania) 1980 (Delaware) | 750.00 | 10.4 | 7,800.00 |
| Donna L. Culver | Partner/Bankruptcy/14 years/prior experience as a bankruptcy associate | 1991 (Delaware) | 655.00 | .2 | 131.00 |
| Eric D. Schwartz | Partner/Bankruptcy/13 years/prior experience as a bankruptcy associate | 1992 (Delaware) 1993 (Pennsylvania) | 655.00 | 110.2 | 72,181.00 |
| Gregory W. Werkheiser | Partner/Bankruptcy/9 years/ prior experience as a bankruptcy associate | 1996 (Delaware) | 640.00 | .2 | 128.00 |
| Curtis Miller | Partner/Bankruptcy/2 years/prior experience as a bankruptcy associate | 2004 (Delaware) | 585.00 | 2.6 | 1,521.00 |
| Andrew Remming | Associate/ Bankruptcy/7 years | 2008 (Delaware) | 500.00 | .5 | 250.00 |
| Erin Fay | Associate/ Bankruptcy/6 years | 2009 (Delaware) 2009 (Wisconsin) | 485.00 | 88.4 | 42,874.00 |
| Angela R. Conway | Paralegal/ Bankruptcy/14 years | N/A | 260.00 | 30.4 | 7,904.00 |
| Rena M. Fusco | Paralegal/ Bankruptcy/20 years | N/A | 260.00 | .1 | 26.00 |
| Marisa Maddox | Paralegal/Bankruptcy/4 years/ prior experience as a bankruptcy paralegal | N/A | 260.00 | 1.3 | 338.00 |
| Theresa M. Naimoli | Case Clerk/13 years | N/A | 150.00 | 2.7 | 405.00 |
| Total | | | | 254.00 | \$139,928.00 |
| TOTAL: \$139,928.00 | | | | | |
| BLENDED RATE: \$550.90 | | | | | |
| TOTAL ATTORNEY ONLY BLENDED RATE: \$597.97 | | | | | |

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Exide Technologies
(Case No. 13-11482 (KJC))

March 1, 2015 through March 27, 2015

| Project Category | Total Hours | Total Fees |
|--|--------------------|---------------------|
| Case Administration | .8 | \$230.50 |
| Automatic Stay Matters | .1 | 48.50 |
| Creditor Communications and Meetings | 16.7 | 9,918.50 |
| Fee Applications (MNAT – Filings) | 10.8 | 4,231.00 |
| Fee Applications (Others – Filings) | 16.9 | 6,901.00 |
| Fee Applications (MNAT – Objections) | 1.4 | 643.00 |
| Fee Applications (Others – Objections) | 3.0 | 982.50 |
| Avoidance Actions Matters | .3 | 145.50 |
| Executory Contracts/Unexpired Leases | .8 | 507.00 |
| Other Contested Matters | .2 | 139.50 |
| Environmental Matters | 3.0 | 1,812.00 |
| Financing Matters/Cash Collateral | .9 | 657.50 |
| Court Hearings | 24.9 | 11,085.50 |
| Claims Objections and Administration | 1.5 | 727.50 |
| Plan and Disclosure Statement | 77.6 | 46,201.50 |
| Litigation/Adversary Proceedings | .5 | 75.00 |
| Professional Retention (Others - Filing) | 26.2 | 13,915.00 |
| Professional Retention (Others - Objections) | 1.0 | 302.50 |
| Schedules/ SOFA/U.S. Trustee Reports | .2 | 131.00 |
| Lead Investigation | 67.2 | 41,273.50 |
| TOTAL | 254.00 | \$139,928.00 |

EXPENSE SUMMARY

Exide Technologies
(Case No. 13-11482 (KJC))

March 1, 2015 through March 27, 2015

| Expense Category | Service Provider (if applicable) | Total Expenses |
|-----------------------------|---|-----------------------|
| Transcripts | | \$72.00 |
| Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating | | 9,711.15 |
| Meals | | 310.80 |
| Messenger Service | | 85.00 |
| Courier/Delivery Service | | 671.89 |
| Computer Research | Westlaw | 109.76 |
| In-House Duplicating | | 1,264.80 |
| Postage | | 85.94 |
| Conference Calls | | 3.03 |
| Grand Total Expenses | | \$12,314.37 |

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

EXIDE TECHNOLOGIES,¹

Debtor.

Chapter 11

Case No. 13-11482 (KJC)

Objections Due: May 19, 2015 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

**TWENTY-SECOND MONTHLY APPLICATION OF MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT &
TUNNELL LLP, AS CO-COUNSEL FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
UNSECURED CREDITORS, FOR ALLOWANCE OF INTERIM COMPENSATION AND
FOR INTERIM REIMBURSEMENT OF ALL ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES
INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 1, 2015 THROUGH MARCH 27, 2015**

Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP (“Morris Nichols”), co-counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Committee”) of Exide Technologies, debtor and debtor in possession (the “Debtor”) in the above-captioned case, submits this application (the “Application”) for interim allowance of compensation for professional services rendered by Morris Nichols to the Committee for the period March 1, 2015 through March 27, 2015 (the “Application Period”) and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred by Morris Nichols during the Application Period under sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the “Bankruptcy Code”), Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules”), Rule 2016-2 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure for the United States Bankruptcy Court of the District of Delaware (the “Local Rules”), the United States Trustee’s Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses filed under 11 U.S.C. § 330, effective January 30, 1996 (the “U.S. Trustee

¹ The last four digits of the Debtor’s taxpayer identification number are 2730. The Debtor’s corporate headquarters are located at 13000 Deerfield Parkway, Building 200, Milton, Georgia 30004.

Guidelines”) and the Order Pursuant To Bankruptcy Code Sections 105(a) and 331, Bankruptcy Rule 2016, And Local Bankruptcy Rule 2016-2 Establishing Interim Compensation Procedures (D.I. 330) (the “Interim Compensation Procedures Order”).² In support of this Application, Morris Nichols represents as follows:

JURISDICTION

1. This Court has jurisdiction over this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue in this district is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

BACKGROUND

2. On June 10, 2013 (the “Petition Date”), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for relief under Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code. The Debtor continues to operate its business and its affairs as debtor and debtor in possession pursuant to sections 1107 and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code.

3. On June 18, 2013, the Office of the United States Trustee for the District of Delaware appointed an official committee of unsecured creditors (the “Committee”).

4. On January 18, 2014, the Court entered an Order Appointing Fee Examiner and Establishing Related Procedures for the Review of Professional Claims (D.I. 1283). On June 6, 2014, the Court entered the First Amended Order Appointing Fee Examiner and Establishing Related Procedures for the Review of Professional Claims (D.I. 1877).

² Capitalized terms not defined herein are defined in the Interim Compensation Procedures Order.

MORRIS NICHOLS'S RETENTION

5. The Committee has selected Morris Nichols as co-counsel to the Committee in connection with this bankruptcy case. On August 6, 2013, this Court entered the Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 328(a), 504, and 1103(a), Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2014, 2016 and 5002; and Del. Bankr. L.R. 2014-1 Authorizing Retention and Employment of Morris Nichols Arsht & Tunnell LLP as Co-Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors *Nunc Pro Tunc* to June 18, 2013 (D.I. 482) (the "Retention Order").

FEE PROCEDURES ORDER

6. On July 11, 2013, the Court entered the Interim Compensation Procedures Order, which sets forth the procedures for interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses for all professionals in this case.

7. In particular, the Interim Compensation Procedures Order provides that a Professional may file and serve a Monthly Fee Application on or after the twenty-fifth (25th) day of each month following the month for which compensation is sought, for interim approval and allowance of compensation for services rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred during the immediately preceding month. Provided that there are no objections to the Monthly Fee Application filed within twenty-one (21) days after the service of a Monthly Fee Application, the Professional may file a certificate of no objection with the Court, after which the Debtor is authorized to pay such Professional 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses requested in such Monthly Fee Application. If an objection is filed to the Monthly Fee Application, then the Debtor is authorized to pay 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses, not subject to an objection.

RELIEF REQUESTED

8. Morris Nichols submits this Application (a) for allowance of reasonable compensation for the actual, reasonable and necessary professional services that it rendered as co-counsel for the Committee in this case for the period from March 1, 2015 through March 27, 2015 and (b) for reimbursement of actual, reasonable and necessary expenses incurred in representing the Committee during that same period.

9. During the period covered by this Application, Morris Nichols incurred actual fees in the amount of \$139,928.00. For the same period, Morris Nichols incurred actual, reasonable and necessary expenses totaling \$12,314.37. As of the date of this Application, Morris Nichols has received no payment for the fees and expenses requested herein.

10. Set forth on the foregoing “Compensation by Project Category” is a summary by subject matter categories of the time expended by timekeepers billing time to this case.

11. During the Application Period, Morris Nichols assisted the Committee in, among other things, (a) reviewing and filing of documents with the Court on behalf of the Committee; (b) reviewing relevant pleadings in the bankruptcy case of the Debtor; (c) acting as liaison between the Committee and the Debtor, other creditors and interested parties in the bankruptcy case; (d) representing the Committee at hearings in this case; (e) participating in meetings between Committee and Debtor professionals; (f) participating in Committee meetings; (g) assisting the Committee regarding certain environmental issues; (h) assisting the Committee with respect to certain document discovery; (i) assisting the Committee with lead investigation matters; (j) assisting the Committee with respect to certain creditor litigation matters; (k) researching plan and related issues; and (l) assisting Lowenstein Sandler LLP with addressing numerous other matters on behalf of the Committee.

12. **Exhibit A** hereto contains logs, sorted by case project category, which show the time recorded by professionals, paraprofessionals and other support staff and descriptions of the services provided.

13. **Exhibit B** hereto contains a breakdown of disbursements incurred by Morris Nichols during the Application Period.

14. Morris Nichols charges \$.10 or less per page for photocopying.

15. Morris Nichols charges \$1.00 per page for outgoing domestic facsimiles and does not charge for incoming facsimiles.

16. In accordance with Local Rule 2016-2, Morris Nichols has reduced its request for compensation for non-working travel, if any, to 50% of its normal rate.

17. Morris Nichols has endeavored to represent the Committee in the most expeditious and economical manner possible. Tasks have been assigned to attorneys, paralegals, and other support staff at Morris Nichols so that work has been performed by those most familiar with the particular matter or task and, where attorney or paralegal involvement was required, by the lowest hourly rate professional appropriate for a particular matter. Morris Nichols believes that it has been successful in this regard.

18. In addition, Morris Nichols has coordinated with the Committee's other professionals to avoid duplication of efforts.

19. The terms and conditions of Morris Nichols' employment by the Committee are set forth in the Retention Order and the engagement letter between the Committee and Morris Nichols. The compensation requested is based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in non-bankruptcy cases.

20. The Committee co-chairs have been provided an opportunity to review this application and approved the requested fees and expenses.

21. No agreement or understanding exists between Morris Nichols and any other person for the sharing of compensation received or to be received for services rendered in or in connection with this case. All compensation received by Morris Nichols related to this case has been received from the Debtor's estate.

22. The undersigned has reviewed the requirements of Local Rule 2016-2 and certifies to the best of his or her information, knowledge and belief that this Application complies with that Rule.

[Remainder of page intentionally left blank]

WHEREFORE, Morris Nichols respectfully requests that this Court: (a) allow Morris Nichols (i) interim compensation in the amount of \$139,928.00 for actual, reasonable and necessary professional services rendered on behalf of the Debtor during the period March 1, 2015 through March 27, 2015, and (ii) interim reimbursement in the amount of \$12,314.37 for actual, reasonable and necessary expenses incurred during the same period; (b) authorize and direct the Debtor to pay to Morris Nichols the amount of \$124,256.77, which is equal to the sum of 80% of Morris Nichols allowed interim compensation for the period (\$111,942.40), and 100% of Morris Nichols allowed expense reimbursement for the period (\$12,314.37); and (c) grant such other and further relief as is just and proper.

Dated: April 28, 2015
Wilmington, Delaware.

MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP

/s/ Erin R. Fay

Robert J. Dehney (No. 3578)
Eric D. Schwartz (No. 3134)
Erin R. Fay (No. 5268)
1201 North Market Street
P. O. Box 1347
Wilmington, DE 19899
Telephone: (302) 658-9200
Facsimile: (302) 658-3989
Email: rdehney@mnat.com
eschwartz@mnat.com
efay@mnat.com

*Co-Counsel for Official Committee of
Unsecured Creditors*

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE DISTRICT OF DELAWARE**

In re:

EXIDE TECHNOLOGIES,¹

Debtor.

Chapter 11

Case No. 13-11482 (KJC)

Objections Due: May 19, 2015 at 4:00 p.m. (ET)

**NOTICE OF TWENTY-SECOND MONTHLY APPLICATION OF MORRIS,
NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP, AS CO-COUNSEL FOR THE OFFICIAL
COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS, FOR ALLOWANCE OF
INTERIM COMPENSATION AND FOR INTERIM REIMBURSEMENT OF ALL
ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED FOR THE PERIOD
MARCH 1, 2015 THROUGH MARCH 27, 2015**

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that, on April 28, 2015, Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP as co-counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "Committee") in the above-captioned case, filed the attached **Twenty-Second Monthly Application Of Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, As Co-Counsel For The Official Committee Of Unsecured Creditors, For Allowance Of Interim Compensation And For Interim Reimbursement Of All Actual And Necessary Expenses Incurred For The Period March 1, 2015 Through March 27, 2015** (the "Application").

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections, if any, to the Application, must: (a) filed with the Clerk of the Bankruptcy Court, 824 North Market Street, 3rd Floor, Wilmington, Delaware 19801, by **May 19, 2015 at 4:00 p.m. (Eastern Time)** (the "Objection Deadline"); and (b) be served so as to be received on or before the Objection Deadline by:

(i) the Applicant: Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, 1201 N. Market Street, Suite 1600, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Robert J. Dehney and Eric D. Schwartz, Esq.;

(ii) the Debtors: c/o Exide Technologies, 13000 Deerfield Parkway, Building 200, Milton, GA 30004, Attn: Phillip A. Damaska;

(iii) counsel for the Debtors: Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP, Four Times Square, New York, NY 10036, Attn: Kenneth S. Ziman and J. Eric Ivester and Rodney Square, 1100 North Market Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Anthony W. Clark and 155 N. Wacker Drive, Chicago, IL 60606-1720, Attn: James J. Mazza, Jr.;

(iv) the Office of the United States Trustee: 844 North King Street, Room 2207, Lockbox 35, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Mark S. Kenney, Esq.;

¹ The last four digits of the Debtor's taxpayer identification number are 2730. The Debtor's corporate headquarters are located at 13000 Deerfield Parkway, Building 200, Milton, Georgia 30004.

(v) co-counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors: Lowenstein Sandler LLP, 65 Livingston Avenue, Roseland, NJ 07068, Attn: Kenneth A. Rosen, Sharon L. Levine, and Paul Kizel and 1251 Avenue of the Americas, New York, NY 10020, Attn: Gerald C. Bender;

(vi) counsel to the agent under the debtor in possession financing: Davis, Polk & Wardwell LLP, 450 Lexington Avenue, New York, NY 10017, Attn: Damian S. Schaible and Richards, Layton & Finger, P.A., One Rodney Square, 920 North King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Mark D. Collins;

(vii) counsel to the agent for the Debtor's prepetition secured lenders: Greenberg Traurig, LLP, 3333 Piedmont Road NE, Suite 2500, Atlanta, GA 30305, Attn: David B. Kurzweil and 1007 N. Orange Street, Suite 1200, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Dennis A. Meloro;

(viii) the indenture trustee for the Debtor's secured bond issuances and its counsel: Wells Fargo Bank, N.A., 150 East 42nd Street, 40th Floor, New York, NY 10017, Attn: James R. Lewis and Foley & Lardner LLP, 321 North Clark Street, Suite 2800, Chicago, IL 60654, Attn: Mark F. Hebbeln;

(ix) the indenture trustee for the Debtor's unsecured bond issuances and its counsel: U.S. Bank National Association, Global Corporate Trust Services, 60 Livingston Avenue, EP-MN-WSID, St. Paul, MN 55107, Attn: Cindy Woodward and Arent Fox LLP, 1675 Broadway, New York, NY 10019, Attn: Andrew Silfen;

(x) counsel to the unofficial committee of senior secured noteholders: Paul, Weiss, Rifking, Wharton & Garrison LLP, 1285 Avenue of the Americas, New York, NY 10019, Attn: Alice Belisle Eaton and Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor LLP, Rodney Square, 1000 King Street, Wilmington, DE 19801, Attn: Pauline K. Morgan; and

(xi) the fee examiner and his counsel: Bernstein Shur, 100 Middle Street, P.O. Box 9729, Portland, ME 04104-5029, Attn: Robert J. Keach, Michael Fagone, and Sam Anderson.

A HEARING ON THE APPLICATION, IF NECESSARY, WILL BE HELD AT THE CONVENIENCE OF THE COURT AND NOTICE OF ANY SUCH HEARING WILL BE GIVEN ONLY TO THE OBJECTING PARTY OR PARTIES.

IF YOU FAIL TO RESPOND IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS NOTICE, THE COURT MAY GRANT THE RELIEF REQUESTED BY THE APPLICATION WITHOUT FURTHER NOTICE OR HEARING.

Dated: April 28, 2015
Wilmington, Delaware

MORRIS, NICHOLS, ARSHT & TUNNELL LLP

/s/ Erin R. Fay

Robert J. Dehney (No. 3578)
Eric D. Schwartz (No. 3134)
Erin R. Fay (No. 5268)
1201 North Market Street
P. O. Box 1347
Wilmington, DE 19899
Telephone: (302) 658-9200
Facsimile: (302) 658-3989
Email: rdehney@mnat.com
eschwartz@mnat.com
acordo@mnat.com
efay@mnat.com

-and-

LOWENSTEIN SANDLER LLP

Kenneth A. Rosen, Esq.
Sharon L. Levine, Esq.
Paul Kizel, Esq.
65 Livingston Avenue
Roseland, NJ 07068
Telephone: (973) 597-2500
Facsimile: (973) 597-2400

-and-

Gerald C. Bender, Esq.
1251 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10020
Telephone: (212) 262-6700
Facsimile: (212) 262-7402

Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

EXHIBIT A**COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY**

**Exide Technologies
(Case No. 13-11482 (KJC))**

March 1, 2015 through March 27, 2015

| Project Category | Total Hours | Total Fees |
|--|--------------------|---------------------|
| Case Administration | .8 | \$230.50 |
| Automatic Stay Matters | .1 | 48.50 |
| Creditor Communications and Meetings | 16.7 | 9,918.50 |
| Fee Applications (MNAT – Filings) | 10.8 | 4,231.00 |
| Fee Applications (Others – Filings) | 16.9 | 6,901.00 |
| Fee Applications (MNAT – Objections) | 1.4 | 643.00 |
| Fee Applications (Others – Objections) | 3.0 | 982.50 |
| Avoidance Actions Matters | .3 | 145.50 |
| Executory Contracts/Unexpired Leases | .8 | 507.00 |
| Other Contested Matters | .2 | 139.50 |
| Environmental Matters | 3.0 | 1,812.00 |
| Financing Matters/Cash Collateral | .9 | 657.50 |
| Court Hearings | 24.9 | 11,085.50 |
| Claims Objections and Administration | 1.5 | 727.50 |
| Plan and Disclosure Statement | 77.6 | 46,201.50 |
| Litigation/Adversary Proceedings | .5 | 75.00 |
| Professional Retention (Others - Filing) | 26.2 | 13,915.00 |
| Professional Retention (Others - Objections) | 1.0 | 302.50 |
| Schedules/ SOFA/U.S. Trustee Reports | .2 | 131.00 |
| Lead Investigation | 67.2 | 41,273.50 |
| TOTAL | 254.00 | \$139,928.00 |

TIME ENTRIES

| INDEX | ID | LAST NAME | DATE | STAT | TASK | BILLED HOURS | BILLED AMOUNT | DESCRIPTION |
|--------------------------------------|-----|-----------|----------|------|------|--------------|---------------|---|
| Case Administration | | | | | | | | |
| 3488303 | 594 | Conway | 03/02/15 | B | B110 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Discuss potential filing on shorten notice w/E. Fay |
| 3494543 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B110 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Review docket re notices of appearance and withdrawal and extract (.2); update 2002 (.1) |
| 3500145 | 594 | Conway | 03/19/15 | B | B110 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review docket re various notices of appearances and email to L. Gast re updating 2002 |
| 3504477 | 594 | Conway | 03/26/15 | B | B110 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review docket re notices of appearance and forward to L. Gast re updates to 2002 |
| 3501402 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B110 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review vm of potential creditor re service issue and call with A Conway re same |
| Total Task: B110 | | | | | | 0.80 | 230.50 | |
| Automatic Stay Matters | | | | | | | | |
| 3504656 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B140 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review Tesla motion for stay relief |
| Total Task: B140 | | | | | | 0.10 | 48.50 | |
| Creditor Communications and Meetings | | | | | | | | |
| 3488046 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B150 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Participate in Committee Co-Chair call (w\ G. Bender, P. Kizel, et. al.) re: Vernon, LME investigation, MCAM, Plan process, GUC Trust |
| 3493945 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member email re: plan |
| 3493986 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 2, 2015 |
| 3494644 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email re: Update of calls with Debtor |
| 3494646 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email re: Update re: call with Debtor |
| 3494647 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 3, 2015 |
| 3494839 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email re: Daily Docket Report for March 4, 2015 |
| 3491787 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B150 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: preferences and lead investigation Debtor document production |
| 3491788 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: preferences |
| 3493767 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B150 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Participate in Committee professionals call (w\ G. Bender, O. Natzin, et. al.) re: plan, Vernon, MCam |
| 3494961 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Bell email re: Vernon Update |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|----------|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3495764 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 6, 2015 |
| 3495697 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: committee call |
| 3495830 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 9, 2015 |
| 3493577 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B150 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Participate in Committee Co-Chair call (w\ G. Bender, P. Kizel, et. al.) re: Vernon, MCAM, plan \ sale process, lead investigation |
| 3496061 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 10, 2015 |
| 3496102 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: 3/12 Committee call |
| 3496103 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review agenda for 3/12 committee call |
| 3496109 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Feb. 10th Committee meeting minutes |
| 3496111 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Feb. 20th Committee meeting minutes |
| 3496117 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Bell email re: Vernon environmental settlements |
| 3496123 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: 3/12 Committee call |
| 3496124 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review Guggenheim \ Zolfo 3/12 Committee meeting presentation |
| 3496125 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 11, 2015 |
| 3496172 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B150 | 0.70 | 458.50 | Participate in Committee call (w\ G. Bender, E. Bell, et. al.) re: Vernon, plan process, LME claims, GUC Trust |
| 3503344 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 12 , 2015 |
| 3496201 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Bell email w\ attachment re: Vernon |
| 3496028 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B150 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Participate in weekly Committee professionals call (w\ G. Bender, M. Henkin, et. al.) re: Vernon, Plan Process, Exit Financing, Confirmation Hearing |
| 3503354 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member emails re: DOJ Press release |
| 3503381 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 13, 2015 |
| 3503389 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/15/15 | B | B150 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: GUC Trust and Oversight Board |
| 3502054 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B150 | 0.70 | 458.50 | Participate in Committee Co-Chair call (w\ G. Bender, M. Henkin, et. al.) re: Vernon, MCAm, Lead Investigation, Plan \ confirmation process, confirmation discovery |
| 3502070 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Review March 16, 2015 |
| 3503405 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachment re: Daily Docket Report for March 17, 2015 |
| 3503410 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re; Committee meeting of 3/18 |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|----------|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3503429 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email re: 3/18 Committee meeting |
| 3503438 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review 3/12 Committee meeting minutes |
| 3503439 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review and respond to E. Fay email re: 3/18 committee meeting |
| 3503443 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member email re: inquire from third party provider |
| 3503451 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review K. Nikoornensh email re: Exide environmental issue |
| 3503459 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 18, 2015 |
| 3502129 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.90 | 589.50 | Participate in Committee call (w\ G. Bender, M. Henkin, et. al) re: confirmation discovery and hearing, Vernon, Operations, GUC Trust |
| 3502144 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B150 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Participate in Debtor \ Committee representative call (w\ G. Bender, J. Mazza) re: confirmation discovery and hearing, Vernon, Operations |
| 3503550 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 19, 2015 |
| 3504406 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket Report for March 20, 2015 |
| 3504418 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/21/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Kizel email w\ attachment re: privileged \ confidential document |
| 3504419 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/21/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Bell email re: Vernon |
| 3504420 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/21/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review O. Natzin and Committee member emails re: Vernon |
| 3506898 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily Docket for 3/23 |
| 3502085 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B150 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Participate in Committee Co-Chair call (w\ G. Bender, M. Henkin, et. al.) re: Confirmation discovery and hearing, MCAm, Lead |
| 3507807 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein and E. Winston emails re: committee meeting of 3/26 |
| 3507818 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: confirmation |
| 3507823 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: 3/26 committee meeting |
| 3507825 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review 3/26 committee meeting agenda |
| 3507826 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review minutes of 3/18 committee meeting |
| 3507833 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily docket for March 26, 2015 |
| 3507855 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Worenklein email w\ attachments re: Daily docket for March 26, 2015 |
| 3504327 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B150 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Participate in Committee call (w\ G. Bender, M. Henkin, et. al.) re: confirmation hearing, Vernon, Lead |
| 3489311 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re 3.2 docket report |
| 3488633 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B150 | 0.60 | 291.00 | Call with committee co chairs, E Schwartz, G Bender, P Kizel, E Winston re plan issues |
| 3491199 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B150 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Call with creditor re plan |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3501391 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re 3.3 docket report |
| 3492560 | 959 | Fay | 03/05/15 | B | B150 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Attend professionals call re Vernon, plan and operations issues |
| 3492564 | 959 | Fay | 03/05/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re 3.5 docket report |
| 3492569 | 959 | Fay | 03/05/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Schwartz re professionals call |
| 3493011 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re 3.6 docket report |
| 3492914 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re committee call |
| 3494064 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B150 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review creditor email re plan documents and email E Chafetz re same (.1). Emails with R Dehney re same (.1) |
| 3494084 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re 3.9 docket report |
| 3501399 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re 3.9 docket report |
| 3495068 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re 3/10 docket report |
| 3495931 | 959 | Fay | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re committee call materials |
| 3495932 | 959 | Fay | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re 3/11 docket report |
| 3495728 | 959 | Fay | 03/11/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re committee call |
| 3496494 | 959 | Fay | 03/12/15 | B | B150 | 0.70 | 339.50 | Attend committee call with committee members and other professionals (E Schwartz, G Bender, etc.) re Vernon, plan update and liquidity update |
| 3496496 | 959 | Fay | 03/12/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review presentation re Vernon and liquidity update for committee call |
| 3500275 | 959 | Fay | 03/12/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E. Worenklein email re 3/12 docket report |
| 3500888 | 959 | Fay | 03/13/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E. Chafetz email re 3/13 docket report |
| 3498912 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E. Worenklein email re 3/16 docket report |
| 3499829 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Further call with E Worenklein re committee call |
| 3499837 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Worenklein re committee call |
| 3499844 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.90 | 436.50 | Attend committee call with E Schwartz, G Bender, et al re plan discovery, lead investigation, litigation trust |
| 3500282 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E. Worenklein email re 3/18 docket report |
| 3500622 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re 3.19 docket report |
| 3501366 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re 3/20 docket report |
| 3503837 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review committee member email re ZC fee app |
| 3503838 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re 3.24 docket report |
| 3504015 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re committee call |
| 3504152 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re 2.25 docket report |
| 3504665 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B150 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Attend committee call with P Kizel, E Schwartz, other professionals re plan matters. |

| | | | | | | | | |
|----------------------------------|-----|----------|----------|---|------|-------|----------|--|
| 3504701 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B150 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re 3.26 docket report |
| Total Task: B150 | | | | | | 16.70 | 9,918.50 | |
| Fee Applications (MNAT - Filing) | | | | | | | | |
| 3502765 | 209 | Dehney | 03/24/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Review email from E. Schwartz to Skadden re payment of MNAT fee application. |
| 3493987 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review T. Simon email re: MNAT fees |
| 3491795 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to T. Simon re: fees |
| 3493765 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B160 | 1.50 | 982.50 | Review MNAT January fee application |
| 3495807 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: MNAT January fee application |
| 3503539 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: MNAT January fee application |
| 3489370 | 594 | Conway | 03/02/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review email from E. Schwartz re professional fees and costs |
| 3489371 | 594 | Conway | 03/03/15 | B | B160 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review proforma's and email to E. Schwartz re MNAT's professional fees and costs for January, Feb. and March |
| 3491762 | 594 | Conway | 03/04/15 | B | B160 | 0.40 | 104.00 | Review and respond to emails of E. Schwartz and E. Fay re Jan. 2015 proforma (.1); emails and calls w/H. Knight re same (.2); review and email proforma to E. Schwartz for review (.1) |
| 3494557 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B160 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review email from E. Schwartz re time matters re MNAT monthly fee app (.1); research billed amounts and follow up email to E. Schwartz (.1) |
| 3498131 | 594 | Conway | 03/16/15 | B | B160 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Prep for efilng and efile MNAT Jan. 2015 monthly fee app |
| 3498132 | 594 | Conway | 03/16/15 | B | B160 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Email to and from L. Gast re assistance w/service preparation re MNAT's Jan. 2015 monthly fee app (.1); serve (.2) |
| 3498134 | 594 | Conway | 03/16/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 26.00 | T/c from H. Knight re excel spreadsheet re MNAT's Jan. monthly fee app |
| 3497515 | 594 | Conway | 03/16/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review and respond to email of E. Fay re MNAT's Jan monthly fee app |
| 3497516 | 594 | Conway | 03/16/15 | B | B160 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review and revise Jan. monthly fee app of MNAT |
| 3497517 | 594 | Conway | 03/16/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review and revise cos re Jan. Monthly fee app of MNAT |
| 3497518 | 594 | Conway | 03/16/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review and revise notice re Jan. Monthly fee app of MNAT |
| 3497764 | 594 | Conway | 03/16/15 | B | B160 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Review and respond to further email from E. Fay re Jan. monthly fee app (.1); combine application and forward pdf to E. Fay for review (.2) |
| 3499013 | 594 | Conway | 03/17/15 | B | B160 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review emails from L. Gast and H. Knight re status of excel spreadsheets re MNAT's Jan. monthly fee app |
| 3499023 | 594 | Conway | 03/17/15 | B | B160 | 0.80 | 208.00 | Review back up documentation re MNAT Jan. and monthly fee app (.6); discuss same w/D. Breeding (.1); email to E. Fay for review (.1) |
| 3499623 | 594 | Conway | 03/18/15 | B | B160 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review cost detail and excel spreadsheet for submittal to examiner re MNAT's Jan. 2015 monthly fee app and forward docs to E. Fay for final review and comment |
| 3500146 | 594 | Conway | 03/19/15 | B | B160 | 0.20 | 52.00 | T/c from D. Breeding re cost detail (.1); email to C. Hare re additional documentation with regard to MNAT Jan. 2015 expenses (.1) |

| | | | | | | | | |
|------------------|-----|--------|----------|---|------|-------|----------|---|
| 3500156 | 594 | Conway | 03/19/15 | B | B160 | 0.50 | 130.00 | Further emails and/or discussions w/E. Fay, D. Breeding and C. Hare re additional documentation with respect to MNAT's Jan. monthly fee app costs for submittal to examiner (.3); review various documents and forward same to E. Fay for further review (.2) |
| 3500109 | 594 | Conway | 03/19/15 | B | B160 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Review email from E. Fay re backup detail w/regard to MNAT Jan. monthly fee app for submittal to examiner (.1); review docket in support of costs and follow up email to E. Fay re findings (.1); email to D. Breeding re additional updates (.1) |
| 3502280 | 594 | Conway | 03/23/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review and respond to email of E. Fay re status of payment of fees and costs |
| 3502282 | 594 | Conway | 03/23/15 | B | B160 | 0.40 | 104.00 | Review docket and extract omnibus fee order (.1); review order, filed CNOs and ledger re payment of MNAT fees and costs (.2); follow up email to E. Fay re status of payment (.1) |
| 3503733 | 594 | Conway | 03/25/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review email of E. Schwartz re MNAT's Feb. monthly fee app |
| 3503734 | 594 | Conway | 03/25/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review email of E. Fay re status of MNAT Feb. monthly fee app |
| 3503737 | 594 | Conway | 03/25/15 | B | B160 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review email of E. Schwartz from Exide accounting team re reconciliation of fees and costs for Feb. and March 2015 (.1); email to and from M. Hall re assistance w/same (.1) |
| 3504425 | 594 | Conway | 03/26/15 | B | B160 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Calls w/E. Schwartz re estimated and actual fees and costs re MNAT's Feb. and March monthly fee apps |
| 3504335 | 594 | Conway | 03/26/15 | B | B160 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Review proformas re fees and costs incurred for the periods Feb thru March 2015 (.2); email findings to E. Schwartz (.1) |
| 3504980 | 594 | Conway | 03/27/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Email from and to D. Breeding re MNAT expense |
| 3492027 | 959 | Fay | 03/04/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Schwartz re MNAT January fee app |
| 3492566 | 959 | Fay | 03/05/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Schwartz re mnat fee app |
| 3492934 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email D Teklits re mnat fee application |
| 3492925 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to D Davidson email re mnat January fee app |
| 3494053 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to E Schwartz email re MNAT fee app |
| 3494066 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B160 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Email E Schwartz re mnat January fee app (.1), email co-chairs re same (.2) |
| 3494062 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B160 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Email committee chairs re MNAT January fee app |
| 3494072 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B160 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review and revise mnat January fee applicaiton |
| 3498929 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B160 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Email A. Conway re MNAT Jan fee app (.1); email co-chairs re same (.1); final review of fee, notice and COS (.2) |
| 3499900 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B160 | 0.50 | 242.50 | Review backup detail re mnat January fee app for Fee Examiner (.4) and email A Conway re same (.1) |
| 3500379 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B160 | 0.50 | 242.50 | Finalize back up re mnat January application (.3) and email fee examiner re same (.1), emails with A Conway re same (.1) |
| 3503824 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B160 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with A Conway and E Schwartz re mnat fee app |
| Total Task: B160 | | | | | | 10.80 | 4,231.00 | |

Fee Applications (Others - Filing)

| Case No. | Debtor No. | Name | Date | Class | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|------------|----------|----------|-------|------|------|--------|---|
| 3515371 | 209 | Dehney | 03/24/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Emails with R. Fusco re Pachulski fee app. |
| 3494764 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston and E. Worenklein emails re: Economist fee's |
| 3495808 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review Fee Examiner's Consolidated Final Report Pertaining to the Interim Fee Applications of Certain Retained Professionals for the Period From June 1, 2014 Through August 31, 2014 |
| 3495802 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston and E. Fay emails w\ attachment re: fee application |
| 3495645 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Monthly Application of Akin Gump Strauss Hauer & Feld LLP for the period December 1, 2014 to December 31, 2014 |
| 3495636 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Monthly Application of Sitrick and Company for the period December 1, 2014 to December 31, 2014 |
| 3495637 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B165 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review Monthly Application of Sheppard, Mullin for the period December 1, 2014 to December 31, 2014 |
| 3495638 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Final Application for Compensation of Kirby McInerney LLP and David E. Kovel for the period December 27, 2014 to January 31, 2015 |
| 3495620 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B165 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Review Monthly Application of Alvarez & Marsal North America, LLC for the period December 1, 2014 to December 31, 2014 |
| 3495657 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B165 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Review Monthly Application of Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom LLP for the period December 1, 2014 to December 31, 2014 |
| 3502067 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston, et. al., emails re: fee application issue |
| 3502072 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review MCam January Fee Application |
| 3503398 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review A. Stewart and E. Fay emails w\ attachment re: fee order |
| 3507820 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay emails re: Stewart fee application |
| 3507804 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: Stewart law fee application |
| 3502970 | 546 | Fusco | 03/24/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Email from/to R Dehney re Pachuslki fee app |
| 3491920 | 594 | Conway | 03/04/15 | B | B165 | 0.50 | 130.00 | Prep for efilng and efile Sierra Research Jan. 2015 monthly fee app (.2); email to L. Gast re svc assistance (.1); serve (.2) |
| 3491921 | 594 | Conway | 03/04/15 | B | B165 | 0.40 | 104.00 | Prep for efilng and efile Geosyntec's Jan. 2015 monthly fee app (.2); serve (.2) |
| 3491804 | 594 | Conway | 03/04/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re drafting notices and cos' re professionals monthly fee apps |
| 3491805 | 594 | Conway | 03/04/15 | B | B165 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Draft notice re Sierra Research Jan. 2015 monthly fee app (.1); draft cos and email docs to E. Fay for review (.1) |
| 3491806 | 594 | Conway | 03/04/15 | B | B165 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Draft notice re Geosyntec's Jan. 2015 monthly fee app (.1); draft cos and email docs to E. Fay for review (.1) |
| 3492422 | 594 | Conway | 03/06/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Duplicate and calendar obj period with regard to Sierra Research's Jan. monthly fee app |
| 3492423 | 594 | Conway | 03/06/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Duplicate and calendar obj period with regard to Geosyntec's Jan. monthly fee app |

| Case No. | Debtor No. | Debtor Name | Date | Time | Category | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|------------|-------------|----------|------|----------|------|--------|---|
| 3494249 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B165 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review and submit seal compensation application of economic consultant to chambers |
| 3495275 | 594 | Conway | 03/11/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Duplicate and calendar obj period re Lowenstein's Jan. monthly fee app |
| 3495277 | 594 | Conway | 03/11/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review, duplicate and calendar obj. period re Quinn Emanuel's Jan. monthly application |
| 3496861 | 594 | Conway | 03/13/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Efile cno re Lowenstein's Dec. monthly fee app |
| 3499535 | 594 | Conway | 03/18/15 | B | B165 | 0.70 | 182.00 | Review email w/attached documents from E. Fay re filing and service Zolfo Cooper's Jan. 2015 monthly fee app (.1); prep documents for efilng (.1); efile w/the court (.2); email to L. Gast re assistance preparation of svc of app (.1); serve (.2) |
| 3500116 | 594 | Conway | 03/19/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review and respond to email of E. Fay re drafting first fee app of Stewarts LLP |
| 3502269 | 594 | Conway | 03/23/15 | B | B165 | 0.80 | 208.00 | Review retention app of Stewarts LLP (.1); review retention order (.1) prepare initial draft monthly fee app (.6) |
| 3503128 | 594 | Conway | 03/24/15 | B | B165 | 0.60 | 156.00 | Review and revise draft first fee app of Stewarts Law (.5); email to E. Fay for review (.1) |
| 3503809 | 594 | Conway | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review and respond to email of E. Fay re filing and serving Guggenheim's Feb. 2015 monthly fee app |
| 3503813 | 594 | Conway | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.50 | 130.00 | Prep for efilng and efile Guggenheim's Feb. monthly fee app (.2); email to L. Gast re assistance w/svc (.1); serve (.2) |
| 3504929 | 594 | Conway | 03/27/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Extract and calendar obj period re Zolfo Cooper's Feb. monthly fee app |
| 3494127 | 605 | Naimoli | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.30 | 45.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing and service of fee application (.1); Prepare & efile Twentieth Monthly Application of Lowenstein Sandler LLP for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred as Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period January 1, 2015 through January 31, 2015 (.2) |
| 3504645 | 605 | Naimoli | 03/26/15 | B | B165 | 0.40 | 60.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing and service of fee application (.1); Prepare & efile Twentieth Monthly Application of Zolfo Cooper, LLC for the Period February 1, 2015 through February 28, 2015 (.3) |
| 3505363 | 605 | Naimoli | 03/27/15 | B | B165 | 0.30 | 45.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing and service of fee application (.1); Prepare & efile Twenty-First Monthly Application of Lowenstein Sandler LLP for the Period February 1, 2015 through February 28, 2015 (.2) |
| 3505364 | 605 | Naimoli | 03/27/15 | B | B165 | 0.30 | 45.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing and service of fee application (.1); Prepare & efile Ninth Monthly Application of Sierra Research, Inc. for the Period February 1, 2015 through February 28, 2015 (.2) |
| 3493794 | 684 | Maddox | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.80 | 208.00 | File and serve QE Jan fee app (.6); emails with E Fay re same (.1) |
| 3492034 | 959 | Fay | 03/04/15 | B | B165 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Review and compile Geosyntec fee app for filing (.3), review notice/cos re same and email A Conway re filing same (.1) |
| 3492040 | 959 | Fay | 03/04/15 | B | B165 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Review and compile Sierra fee app for filing (.2), review notice/cos re same and email A Conway re filing same (.1) |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3492041 | 959 | Fay | 03/04/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Worenklein re fee applications |
| 3492919 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B165 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review Lowenstein fee application |
| 3492920 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re LS fee app |
| 3494081 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Draft notice and COS re LS fee app |
| 3494083 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Finalize LS fee app for filing and email T Naimoli re same (.1), emails with E Worenklein re same (.1) |
| 3494058 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Review and finalize QE fee app for filing (.2), draft COS re same and email R Fusco re filing same (.1) |
| 3494070 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Finalize economist fee app for filing (.2), draft cos and notice re same and email R Fusco re filing same (.1) |
| 3501411 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Additional emails with E Winston re Quinn fee app |
| 3501397 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Additional emails with T Naimoli re service of LS fee app |
| 3501407 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review committee co chair emails re LS fee app |
| 3500885 | 959 | Fay | 03/13/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E. Bell email re ZC fee statement |
| 3498921 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E. Bell email re ZC fee app |
| 3499250 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Bell email re ZC fee app |
| 3499231 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B165 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review omnibus fee order/exhibit (.1) and email E Schwartz and R Dehney re same (.1) |
| 3499831 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to B Kessel email re fee application |
| 3499843 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B165 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Review ZC fee app (.3), draft notice/ cos re same and email A Conway re same (.1) |
| 3499899 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email A Conway re Stewarts fee app |
| 3499858 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B165 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review E Bell emails re fee app |
| 3499853 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review email re economist fee app |
| 3501326 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to E Worenklein email re final fee apps |
| 3502454 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B165 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review Guggenheim fee app (.1) and email co chairs re same (.1) |
| 3503284 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review A Conway email re Stewarts fee app |
| 3503852 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email S Campbell re fee application |
| 3503840 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Further emails with E Bell re ZC fee app |
| 3503846 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.80 | 388.00 | Review ZC fee app re Feb (.7) and email E Bell re same (.1) |
| 3503829 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Draft notice/ cos re Guggenheim fee app (.1) and email A Conway re filing same (.1) |
| 3503831 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to J Shovlin email re Guggenheim fee app |
| 3503822 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.70 | 339.50 | Review and revise Stewarts fee application |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3504151 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re February fee app |
| 3504658 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B165 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Draft notice and cos re ZC fee app (.1), review fee app and email T Naimoli re filing same (.1) |
| 3504660 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B165 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to E Bell email re ZC fee app |
| 3505307 | 959 | Fay | 03/27/15 | B | B165 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Finalize Sierra fee app for filing (.1), draft notice/cos re same (.1), emails with E Worenklein and T Naimoli re same (.1) |
| 3505303 | 959 | Fay | 03/27/15 | B | B165 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Review and finalize LS fee app for filing (.1), draft notice/cos re same (.1) and emails with T Naimoli and E Worenklein re same (.1) |

Total Task: B165 16.90 6,901.00

Fee Applications (MNAT - Objections)

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|----------|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3515362 | 209 | Dehney | 03/04/15 | B | B170 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Email from E. Fay re fee examiner's interim report/compromise - MNAT fee app. |
| 3494770 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B170 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review S. Anderson and E. Fay emails re: fee examiner settlement of MNAT fees |
| 3495679 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B170 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review B. Colwell and E. Fay emails re: fee examiner settlement |
| 3494950 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B170 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Efile cno re MNAT's Dec. monthly fee app |
| 3494792 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B170 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Review docket re objs to MNAT Dec monthly fee app (.1); draft cno and email to E. Fay for review (.2) |
| 3494915 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B170 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Revise MNAT's CNO re Dec. monthly fee app and forward to E. Fay for review |
| 3492038 | 959 | Fay | 03/04/15 | B | B170 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Review fee examiner email re MNAT interim report compromise and email E Schwartz and R Dehney re same. |
| 3492913 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B170 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review fee examiner email re MNAT proposal and email R Dehney and E Schwartz re same. |
| 3494088 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B170 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review fee examiner report |
| 3502429 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B170 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with A Conway re mnat fee app CNO |

Total Task: B170 1.40 643.00

Fee Applications (Other - Objections)

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|--------|----------|---|------|------|-------|---|
| 3494793 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B175 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Review docket re objs to Guggenheim Dec monthly fee app (.1); draft cno and email to E. Fay for review (.2) |
| 3494951 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B175 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Efile CNO re Guggenheim's Dec. monthly fee app |
| 3496243 | 594 | Conway | 03/12/15 | B | B175 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review docket re objs to Zolfo Cooper's Dec. monthly fee app (.1); email to E. Fay re drafting CNO (.1) |
| 3496292 | 594 | Conway | 03/12/15 | B | B175 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review email from E. Fay (.1); draft cno re Zolfo Cooper's Dec. monthly fee app and email to E. Fay for review (.1) |
| 3496299 | 594 | Conway | 03/12/15 | B | B175 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Prep for efilng and efile CNO re Zolfo Cooper's Dec. monthly fee app |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|--------|----------|---|------|------|-------|---|
| 3496745 | 594 | Conway | 03/13/15 | B | B175 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review and respond to emails from E. Fay re draft CNO re 19th monthly fee app of Lowenstein (.1); review docket re objs (.1) |
| 3496746 | 594 | Conway | 03/13/15 | B | B175 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Review Lowenstein's and economics consultants monthly fee apps (.1); draft cno re Lowenstein's Dec. monthly fee app and email to E. Fay for review (.2) |
| 3501675 | 594 | Conway | 03/20/15 | B | B175 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review docket re objs to Guggenheim's Jan. monthly fee app and email to E. Fay re drafting CNO re same |
| 3501678 | 594 | Conway | 03/20/15 | B | B175 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Draft cno re Guggenheim's Jan. monthly fee app and email to E. Fay for review |
| 3501679 | 594 | Conway | 03/20/15 | B | B175 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Efile cno re Guggenheim's Jan. monthly fee app |
| 3505221 | 594 | Conway | 03/27/15 | B | B175 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review docket re objs to Geosyntec's Jan. monthly fee app (.1); draft cno and email to E. Fay for review (.1) |
| 3505222 | 594 | Conway | 03/27/15 | B | B175 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review docket re objs to Sierra Research's Jan. monthly fee app (.1); draft cno and email to E. Fay for review (.1) |
| 3495045 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B175 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review CNO re Guggenheim fee app and docket re same (.1), emails with Guggenheim re same (.1) |
| 3495070 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B175 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with A Conway re fee app CNO filings |
| 3496492 | 959 | Fay | 03/12/15 | B | B175 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with A Conway and E Bell re ZC December fee application |
| 3496493 | 959 | Fay | 03/12/15 | B | B175 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review docket re ZC fee app CNO and review CNO |
| 3500883 | 959 | Fay | 03/13/15 | B | B175 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review and respond to E. Worenklein email re LS fee app CNO (.1); email w/A. Conway re same and review CNO re same (.1) |
| 3501333 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B175 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review CNO and docket re Guggenheim fee app |
| 3501335 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B175 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to A Conway email re Guggenheim fee app CNO and email J Shovlin re same |

Total Task: B175 3.00 982.50

Avoidance Actions

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3501394 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B180 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Review R Li email re preferences and respond (.1) and review preference analysis (.2) |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|

Total Task: B180 0.30 145.50

Executory Contracts/Unexpired Leases

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|----------|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3503347 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B185 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review LIMITED OBJECTION OF SYNTERRA CORPORATION TO PROPOSED CURE AMOUNT |
| 3502073 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B185 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Objection of Conway Freight re assumption |
| 3503407 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B185 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Ferro reservation of rights |
| 3503460 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B185 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Oracle Objection to Assumption |
| 3506901 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B185 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Reservation of Rights of Impanti |
| 3507832 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B185 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review AT&T limited objection to assumption |

3488003 959 Fay 03/01/15 B B185 0.10 48.50 Review E Worenklein email re lease issue

Total Task: B185 0.80 507.00

Other Contested Matters

3515461 209 Dehney 03/18/15 B B190 0.10 91.00 Emails with C. Miller re subpoenas.

3492924 959 Fay 03/06/15 B B190 0.10 48.50 Review E Winston email re debtor information requests

Total Task: B190 0.20 139.50

Environmental Matters

3496202 221 Schwartz 03/12/15 B B210 0.10 65.50 Review DTSC press release re: Vernon

3496191 221 Schwartz 03/12/15 B B210 0.10 65.50 Review Committee member email re: Vernon

3496192 221 Schwartz 03/12/15 B B210 0.10 65.50 Review article re: closing of Vernon

3503348 221 Schwartz 03/12/15 B B210 0.10 65.50 Review Motion to Shorten re: DOJ Settlement Motion

3503343 221 Schwartz 03/12/15 B B210 0.10 65.50 Review E. Bell and Committee member emails re: DOJ Press Release

3503350 221 Schwartz 03/12/15 B B210 0.50 327.50 Review DOJ Settlement motion

3503351 221 Schwartz 03/12/15 B B210 0.20 131.00 Review Motion to Close Vernon Facility

3503352 221 Schwartz 03/12/15 B B210 0.10 65.50 Review Caruso Declaration re: Motion to Close Vernon Facility

3503353 221 Schwartz 03/12/15 B B210 0.40 262.00 Review Motion to Amend DTSC Stipulation

3503355 221 Schwartz 03/13/15 B B210 0.10 65.50 Review article re: DOJ settlement

3503356 221 Schwartz 03/13/15 B B210 0.10 65.50 Review further Committee member email re: DOJ settlement

3503357 221 Schwartz 03/13/15 B B210 0.10 65.50 Review further email re: DOJ settlement

3506900 221 Schwartz 03/24/15 B B210 0.10 65.50 Review AGMD response to Motion to Close Vernon

3492563 959 Fay 03/05/15 B B210 0.10 48.50 Review E Bell email re Vernon issues

3493012 959 Fay 03/06/15 B B210 0.10 48.50 Review motion re Muncie consent decree

3495729 959 Fay 03/11/15 B B210 0.10 48.50 Review E Bell email re Vernon update

3500272 959 Fay 03/12/15 B B210 0.10 48.50 Review E. Bell email re Vernon issues

3500273 959 Fay 03/12/15 B B210 0.10 48.50 Review Committee member re Vernon issues

3496498 959 Fay 03/12/15 B B210 0.10 48.50 Review E Bell email re Vernon closure

3500880 959 Fay 03/13/15 B B210 0.20 97.00 Review multiple Committee member emails re Vernon

3501644 959 Fay 03/21/15 B B210 0.10 48.50 Review E Bell email re Vernon closure

Total Task: B210 3.00 1,812.00

Financing Matters/Cash Collateral

| | | | | | | | | |
|------------------|-----|----------|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3502674 | 209 | Dehney | 03/23/15 | B | B230 | 0.40 | 364.00 | Email from E. Chafetz with DIP amendment request; review. |
| 3504448 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B230 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: DIP amendment |
| 3506624 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B230 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review Debtor DIP amendment presentation |
| 3502434 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B230 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re DIP amendment |
| 3502445 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B230 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review committee member email re DIP extension |
| Total Task: B230 | | | | | | 0.90 | 657.50 | |
| Court Hearings | | | | | | | | |
| 3502074 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review amended agenda for 3/18 hearing |
| 3502136 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B300 | 1.10 | 720.50 | Participate in Court hearing of 3/18 |
| 3494248 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review email from E. Fay re omnibus hearings (.1); review docket and follow up email to E. Fay re findings (.1) |
| 3497759 | 594 | Conway | 03/16/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review docket and extract March 18th agenda (.1); review agenda and email to E. Fay re binder of documents (.1) |
| 3498415 | 594 | Conway | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.60 | 156.00 | Pull additional documents for hearing (.3); prepare hearing binder of matters scheduled for March 18th (.3) |
| 3498775 | 594 | Conway | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review prior hearing matters and update binders |
| 3498378 | 594 | Conway | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.70 | 182.00 | Review docket and extract amended agenda (.1); review and extract agenda pleadings from docket (.6) |
| 3503760 | 594 | Conway | 03/25/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review docket and extract and review March 27th agenda (.1); email same to E. Fay for review (.1) |
| 3504561 | 594 | Conway | 03/26/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Further discussion w/media center re status of hearing binder re March 27th hearing |
| 3504577 | 594 | Conway | 03/26/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Email to T. Naimoli re amended agenda and extraction of additional pleadings re March 27th hearing |
| 3504578 | 594 | Conway | 03/26/15 | B | B300 | 0.60 | 156.00 | Review docket and extract second amended agenda (.1); extract additional agenda items for March 27th (.3); update hearing binders (.2) |
| 3504930 | 594 | Conway | 03/26/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review and respond to email from T. Naimoli re second amended agenda |
| 3504193 | 594 | Conway | 03/26/15 | B | B300 | 3.00 | 780.00 | Review docket and extract pleadings re March 27th hearing (2.5); prepare hearing binders (.4); discuss assistance with additional set w/media center (.1) |
| 3504821 | 594 | Conway | 03/27/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review docket re additional agenda items (.1); email to and from E. Fay re updating binders (.1) |
| 3495137 | 826 | Miller | 03/10/15 | B | B300 | 0.50 | 292.50 | Review materials for March hearing |
| 3495792 | 826 | Miller | 03/11/15 | B | B300 | 0.60 | 351.00 | Review materials for hearing |
| 3499312 | 826 | Miller | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.40 | 234.00 | Confer with E. Fay re hearing |
| 3499313 | 826 | Miller | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 117.00 | Email E. Schwartz re hearing |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|--------|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3499985 | 826 | Miller | 03/18/15 | B | B300 | 0.30 | 175.50 | Confer with E. Fay re hearing and emails re same |
| 3493419 | 959 | Fay | 03/07/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re teleconference |
| 3494079 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Schwartz re hearing |
| 3495050 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review and respond to E Schwartz email re hearing (.1) and email C Miller re same (.1) |
| 3498922 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to B. Springart email re hearing |
| 3498930 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails w/C. Miller re hearing |
| 3498924 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails w/A. Conway re hearing/binder |
| 3498925 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review/respond to E. Schwartz email re hearing |
| 3498913 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review agenda |
| 3498914 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review amended agenda |
| 3498917 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Emails w/J. Shovlin and O. Nitzan re hearing |
| 3498918 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email M. Hall re S. Campbell CourtCall reservation |
| 3499253 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with C Miller re hearing |
| 3499233 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Worenklein re transcript |
| 3499221 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Meet with C Miller re hearing |
| 3499228 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review notice of rescheduled hearing |
| 3499242 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Emails with S Campbell re Court Call reservation/hearing |
| 3499245 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B300 | 0.50 | 242.50 | Prepare for hearing re discovery, retention application. |
| 3499833 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email N Hunt re Court Call |
| 3499845 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review committee member email re court call |
| 3500284 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to E. Worenklein email re transcripts |
| 3500373 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email E Worenklein re transcript |
| 3500378 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re hearing |
| 3501334 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Email committee chairs re hearing transcript |
| 3503827 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review agenda |
| 3503848 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B300 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Call with E Schwartz, G Bender and E Chafetz re hearings |
| 3503841 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Schwartz and E Winston re hearing |
| 3504702 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review amended agenda |
| 3504655 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B300 | 1.00 | 485.00 | Attend status conference re confirmation hearing |
| 3504659 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with A Conway re binders for hearing |

| | | | | | | | | |
|------------------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|-------|-----------|--|
| 3504668 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B300 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Discuss hearing with E Schwartz |
| 3505305 | 959 | Fay | 03/27/15 | B | B300 | 9.00 | 4,365.00 | Attend confirmation hearing (6.5), working lunch with co counsel and clients re same (2.5) |
| 3505302 | 959 | Fay | 03/27/15 | B | B300 | 1.30 | 630.50 | Prepare for hearing - review orders/certifications, print same |
| Total Task: B300 | | | | | | 24.90 | 11,085.50 | |

Claims Objections and Administration

| | | | | | | | | |
|------------------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3501648 | 959 | Fay | 03/22/15 | B | B310 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re claim objection |
| 3502437 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B310 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Call with E Chafetz re claim objection |
| 3502438 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B310 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Worenklein email re claims |
| 3502449 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B310 | 0.90 | 436.50 | Review claim objection |
| 3502453 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B310 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review proofs of claim re claim objection |
| Total Task: B310 | | | | | | 1.50 | 727.50 | |

Plan and Disclosure Statement

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|--------|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3488377 | 172 | Reid | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails E. Schwartz & E. Chafetz re Trust Agreement |
| 3488389 | 172 | Reid | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 225.00 | E-mails E. Winston, E. Fay & E. Schwartz re LME parties |
| 3498392 | 172 | Reid | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 300.00 | E-mails E. Winston & E. Schwartz (.1) & review QE memo on plan trust claims (.3) |
| 3501927 | 172 | Reid | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 75.00 | E-mails E. Schwartz & P. Kizel re plan depositions |
| 3508932 | 203 | Culver | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Conf w/E. Fay re retained actions |
| 3490005 | 209 | Dehney | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Office conference with E. Schwartz re GUC Trust. |
| 3491499 | 209 | Dehney | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.60 | 546.00 | Email from E. Chafetz with further revised draft of Exide GUC Trust Agreement (.1); review (.4); email to E. Schwartz re same (.1). |
| 3491578 | 209 | Dehney | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 273.00 | Additional office conference with E. Schwartz re GUC trust issues. |
| 3489922 | 209 | Dehney | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 182.00 | Office conference with E. Schwartz re plan process and GUC Trust matters. |
| 3515283 | 209 | Dehney | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Email to E. Schwartz with attachment re oversight committee. |
| 3491832 | 209 | Dehney | 03/04/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 182.00 | Office conference with E. Schwartz re: GUC Trust. |
| 3502696 | 209 | Dehney | 03/04/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 273.00 | Office conference with E. Schwartz re GUC trust issues. |
| 3515364 | 209 | Dehney | 03/09/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Emails with E. Fay re plan documents. |
| 3493817 | 209 | Dehney | 03/09/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Office conference with E. Schwartz re: status of plan/Vernon. |
| 3528633 | 209 | Dehney | 03/10/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 182.00 | Review XL Specialty Insurance Company, et al. objection to confirmation of plan. |
| 3528634 | 209 | Dehney | 03/11/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 273.00 | Review Smith and Nelson objections to confirmation of plan. |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Time | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|------|------|------|--------|---|
| 3528636 | 209 Dehney | 03/11/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 273.00 | Review Ad Hoc Group of Exide Tort Claimants objection to confirmation of plan. |
| 3497652 | 209 Dehney | 03/15/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 364.00 | Email from E. Chafetz with info re board fees and revised GUC trust agreement; review. |
| 3497901 | 209 Dehney | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 182.00 | Review emails from E. Schwartz and E. Winston re assigning European claims to litigation trust. |
| 3502769 | 209 Dehney | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Email from C. McCloskey with City of Frisco, Texas objection to second amended plan. |
| 3515368 | 209 Dehney | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Email from E. Schwartz re confirmation discovery. |
| 3502768 | 209 Dehney | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Email from C. McCloskey with City of Frisco, Texas notice of deposition - Robert Carusso; review. |
| 3502720 | 209 Dehney | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 273.00 | Email from committee member re Caruso deposition; email to E. Schwartz re same; emails with committee member re same. |
| 3502729 | 209 Dehney | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Review email from E. Schwartz re depositions. |
| 3502087 | 209 Dehney | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 364.00 | Office conference with E. Schwartz re upcoming confirmation hearing discovery. |
| 3502763 | 209 Dehney | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Review emails from E. Schwartz to Lowenstein re committee/effective date. |
| 3487731 | 221 Schwartz | 03/01/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Chafetz re: GUC Trust |
| 3487732 | 221 Schwartz | 03/01/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Chafetz re: Plan Supplement |
| 3487733 | 221 Schwartz | 03/01/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review and respond to further E. Chafetz email re: plan supplement |
| 3487734 | 221 Schwartz | 03/01/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Chafetz email re: GUC trust |
| 3488264 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Conf. w\ G. Werkheiser re: plan supplement issues |
| 3488267 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Further teles. w\ E. Winston and E. Fay re: plan supplement |
| 3488240 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Teleconf. w\ E. Fay re: plan supplement list |
| 3488166 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Conf. w\ R. Dehney re: GUC Trust |
| 3488016 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Fay re: Plan supplement |
| 3488018 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Emails to and from E. Winston re: plan supplement |
| 3493954 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review M. Dedinger email re: confirmation |
| 3493961 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay and E. Winston emails re: LME parties for plan |
| 3493972 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Fay and E. Winston emails re: LME parties re: plan supplement |
| 3493981 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further L. Chiapetta and E. Fay emails re: plan supplement |
| 3493982 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: Liquidating Trust Agreement |
| 3493983 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston and E. Chafetz emails re: Liquidating Trust Agreement |
| 3493988 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Wiszmer and E. Winston emails re: GUC Trust Agreement |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Category | Code | Amount 1 | Amount 2 | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|----------|------|----------|----------|---|
| 3493989 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Emails to and from E. Winston re: Liquidation Trust Agreement |
| 3493990 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Winston email re: GUC trust agreement |
| 3493975 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay and L. Chiapetta emails re: plan supplement |
| 3493985 | 221 Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay and E. Winston emails re: inquiry by Debtor re: plan supplement |
| 3494639 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer and E. Winston emails re: LME parties |
| 3494623 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Winston email re: GUC Trust Agreement |
| 3494624 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further and additional E. Chafetz and E. Winston emails re: GUC trust agreement |
| 3494625 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review R. Dehney email w\ attachment re: oversight committee |
| 3494627 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: further revised plan supplement documents |
| 3494611 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email to L. Chiapetta re: Plan supplement |
| 3494612 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Chafetz and E. Winston emails w\ attachments re: additional comments to GUC trust agreement |
| 3494614 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: revised Plan Supplement documents |
| 3494616 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Fay email re: review of plan supplement |
| 3494618 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: plan supplement (preferences) |
| 3494607 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz and E. Winston emails re: liquidating trust agreement |
| 3494642 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz and R. Dehney emails w\ attachment of further revised GUC Trust Agreement |
| 3490809 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Further tele. w\ E. Chafetz re: Plan Supplement |
| 3490919 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Conf. w\ R. Dehney re: GUC Trust issues |
| 3491078 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Conf. w\ D. Culver re: preference analysis |
| 3491079 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review further revised GUC trust agreement |
| 3490155 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review plan re: preference actions |
| 3490156 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Fay re: plan re: preference actions |
| 3490158 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review plan supplement re: preference actions and other GUC Trust actions |
| 3490161 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Emails to E. Chafetz and E. Winston re: GUC Trust Agreement |
| 3490163 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review preference analysis |
| 3490539 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Chafetz re: plan supplement and GUC Trust |
| 3490545 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Emails to E. Winston and E. Fay re: GUC Trust \ Plan Supplement |
| 3490025 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Conf. w\ R. Dehney re: plan process and GUC Trust matters |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Time | Category | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|------|----------|------|--------|---|-------------|
| 3490083 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Teleconf. w\ E. Fay re: plan supplement | |
| 3491798 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Further conf. w\ R. Dehney re: GUC Trust | |
| 3494825 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further W. Wiszmer and E. Winston emails re: GUC Trust Agreement language | |
| 3494827 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review more Chafetz and E. Winston emails w\ attachment re: GUC Trust Agreement | |
| 3494659 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz and E. Winston emails w\ attachment re: plan supplement materials | |
| 3494843 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Further review plan supplement | |
| 3494763 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz and E. Winston emails re: call w\ Debtors re: Plan Supplement | |
| 3494960 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: Plan Supplement | |
| 3494965 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Laroche email w\ attachment re: plan financing | |
| 3494667 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further and additional E. Chafetz and E. Winston emails re: GUC Trust agreement | |
| 3494669 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Winston emails re: GUC Trust Agreement language | |
| 3494673 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Wiszmer and E. Winston emails w\ attachments re: GUC Trust Agreement language | |
| 3493768 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Teleconf. w\ E. Fay re: plan supplement | |
| 3493630 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Conf. w\ R. Dehney re: status of plan, Vernon | |
| 3495801 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review creditor inquiry re: plan and related E. Fay, et. al., emails | |
| 3495656 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Limited Objection to Confirmation of Plan / Limited Objection of EnerSys Delaware Inc. to Confirmation of First Amended Plan of Reorganization of Exide Technologies | |
| 3496060 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Teleconf. w\ E. Fay re: service of LME list \ plan supplement | |
| 3496128 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review solicitation procedures (.1) and plan (.2) re: confirmation issues | |
| 3496099 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston, G. Bender, et. al., emails re: plan process | |
| 3496113 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member email re: status of plan process | |
| 3495611 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review XL Insurance confirmation objection | |
| 3496085 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member email w\ attachment re: confirmation objection | |
| 3496184 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: plan process issues | |
| 3503341 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email re: plan supplement | |
| 3503345 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Limited Objection of Pacific Chloride Inc. to Plan Confirmation | |
| 3503349 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review JOINDER OF LBUBS 2006-C1 NORCROSS OFFICES LIMITED PARTNERSHIP TO LIMITED OBJECTION OF MIREF FREMONT DISTRIBUTION CENTER LLC TO CONFIRMATION | |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Category | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|----------|------|------|--------|--|
| 3496193 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Kizel email w\ attachment re: proposed plan amendments |
| 3496194 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Kizel email w\ attachment re: plan discovery |
| 3496188 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review proposed plan amendments |
| 3496189 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review Tort Claimants confirmation objection |
| 3496190 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: plan proposed amendments |
| 3503380 | 221 Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review Aaron Lupuloff Declaration in Support of Retail Objectors to Confirmation |
| 3503383 | 221 Schwartz | 03/14/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review E. Chafetz and E. Winston emails w\ attachments re: Tort Claimant discovery requests |
| 3503384 | 221 Schwartz | 03/14/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further G. Bender and E. Winston emails re: Tort Claimant discovery requests |
| 3503390 | 221 Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: voting results re: plan confirmation |
| 3502055 | 221 Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Review Tort Claimants Discovery Requests |
| 3502068 | 221 Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Kizel, et. al., emails w\ attachment re: Tort Claimants discovery |
| 3502071 | 221 Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Motion to Shorten re: Tort Claimants Motion to Compel Confirmation Discovery |
| 3502077 | 221 Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review plan supplement re: confirmation |
| 3502078 | 221 Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review Disclosure Statement re: Tort Claimant Discovery |
| 3502079 | 221 Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review plan re: Tort claimants objection and discovery |
| 3502058 | 221 Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Review Tort Claimants Motion to Compel |
| 3502059 | 221 Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.90 | 589.50 | Participate in call w\ E. Winston, G. Bender, P. Kizel re: Tort Claimant Discovery |
| 3503392 | 221 Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member email re: plan confirmation voting |
| 3503395 | 221 Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review M. Dedingier email w\ attachment re: revised solicitation procedures motion |
| 3503396 | 221 Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email w\ attachment re: Tort Claimants Motion to Compel confirmation discovery |
| 3503408 | 221 Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Kizel and E. Winston emails re: Tort Claimant discovery |
| 3503406 | 221 Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review City of Frisco objection to confirmation |
| 3503412 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay and E. Winston emails w\ attachment re: Committee document request on Tort Claimants |
| 3503415 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review and respond to E. Fay email re: comments to Tort Claimant document requests |
| 3503452 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review C. Miller email, et. al., emails re: Tort Claimant discovery |
| 3503453 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further M. Savetsky email w\ attachments re: Tort Claimant discovery |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Time | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|------|------|------|--------|--|
| 3503447 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Fay email re: Tort Claimant document request |
| 3503449 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review M. Satvesky email w\ attachment re: Tort Claimant deposition notice |
| 3503450 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz, et. al., emails re: tort claimant deposition notices |
| 3503455 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further and additional E. Fay emails re: tort claimant discovery |
| 3503457 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: Tort Claimant discovery |
| 3503458 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Kizel email w\ attachments re: Tort Claimant discovery scheduling order |
| 3503462 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Tort Claimants revised scheduling order |
| 3503463 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review Tort Claimant discovery |
| 3502132 | 221 Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Tele. w\ E. Fay (and in part B. Bronfentinker and E. Winston (.2)) re: confirmation \ lead discovery |
| 3502146 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Tele. w\ E. Winston re: confirmation discovery |
| 3502149 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: confirmation discovery and hearing |
| 3502153 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.90 | 589.50 | Tele. w\ E. Winston, P. Kizel, G. Bender and E. Fay re: confirmation discovery |
| 3503481 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Kizel email w\ attachment re: revised Tort Claimants Scheduling Order |
| 3503482 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email re: confirmation hearing discovery |
| 3503536 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further P. Kizel, et. al., emails re: Tort Claimants Discovery Scheduling Order |
| 3503544 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review G. Bender and B. Baldiga emails w\ attachment re: Tort Claimant discovery |
| 3503547 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Kizel email w\ attachment re: draft response and objection to the tort claimants request for documents |
| 3503548 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review draft response and objection to the tort claimants request for documents |
| 3503551 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Retail Noteholders Motion to file Declaration Under Seal |
| 3503552 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Reservation of Rights of Wells Fargo re plan |
| 3503555 | 221 Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email w\ attachment re: Third Party Document Request |
| 3504397 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay, P. Kizel, et. al., emails re: Tort Claimants discovery |
| 3504398 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: GUC Trustee |
| 3504400 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review 3/18 transcript re: upcoming confirmation hearing and lead investigation |
| 3504404 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review draft answers to Tort Claimant interrogatories |
| 3504405 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: draft answer to interrogatories |
| 3504409 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review G. Bender, et. al., emails re: confirmation hearing discovery |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Time | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|------|------|------|--------|--|
| 3504411 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further and additional P. Kizel emails w\ attachments re: responses and objections to Tort Claimant discovery |
| 3504412 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review tort claimant's proofs of claim |
| 3504413 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review confidential \ privileged document |
| 3504415 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to R. Dehney re: confirmation discovery |
| 3504407 | 221 Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further P. Kizel, et. al., emails re: draft answers to Tort claimants interrogatories |
| 3504422 | 221 Schwartz | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer email w\ attachment re: plan language |
| 3504423 | 221 Schwartz | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review and respond to E. Winston email re: plan language |
| 3504424 | 221 Schwartz | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: draft statement in support of confirmation |
| 3504426 | 221 Schwartz | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston and E. Chafetz emails re: confirmation \ plan supplement issue |
| 3504429 | 221 Schwartz | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review and respond to P. Kizel email re: confirmation hearing discovery |
| 3504430 | 221 Schwartz | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review G. Bender, et. al., emails re: Tort Claimant discovery |
| 3504431 | 221 Schwartz | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: draft confirmation order |
| 3504434 | 221 Schwartz | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: draft claim objection re: Tort Claimants re: confirmation |
| 3504435 | 221 Schwartz | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz, et. al, emails w\ attachment re: amended plan |
| 3504436 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review M. Henkin email re: statement in support of confirmation |
| 3504438 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 1.00 | 655.00 | Review draft confirmation order (.7) and plan (.3) |
| 3504439 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Review draft objection to Tort Claimant claims re: confirmation |
| 3504443 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Review draft Committee statement in support of confirmation |
| 3504444 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review amended plan |
| 3504449 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston, et. al., emails w\ attachment re: statement in support of confirmation |
| 3504450 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email re: confirmation discovery |
| 3506632 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Winston email w\ attachment re: Statement in Support of Confirmation |
| 3506635 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review G. Bender email re: ad hoc tort claimant confirmation discovery |
| 3506625 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to G. Bender, et. al., re: confirmation discovery |
| 3506874 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker, et. al., emails re: Committee statement in support of confirmation |
| 3506647 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Review case law re: upcoming confirmation hearing deposition |
| 3506648 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: Statement in Support of Confirmation |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Time | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|------|------|------|--------|--|
| 3506649 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review revised Committee statement in support of confirmation |
| 3506887 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review scheduling order re: confirmation discovery |
| 3506876 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachment re: confirmation order |
| 3506877 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email w\ attachment re: confirmation order language |
| 3502217 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Conf. w\ E. Fay re: confirmation discovery research |
| 3502122 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ Creditor (B. Harris) re: confirmation |
| 3502052 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Meet w\ R. Dehney re: upcoming confirmation hearing discovery |
| 3502081 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Conf. w\ E. Fay (and tele. w\ E. Winston in part(.1)) re: confirmation \ lead discovery |
| 3502084 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: confirmation discovery and hearing |
| 3502086 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Teleconf. w\ G. Bender, P. Kizel, E. Chafetz, E. Winston and E. Fay re: confirmation discovery |
| 3504447 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review M. Herman email re: confirmation hearing discovery request |
| 3502798 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: confirmation hearing |
| 3506883 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer and E. Winston emails re: confirmation order \ plan language |
| 3506892 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email re: settlement with Tort Claimants |
| 3506893 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston and E. Chafetz emails re: GUC Trust language re: confirmation |
| 3506894 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review term sheet with Tort Claimants settlement re: confirmation |
| 3506895 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Chafetz email re: tort claimant settlement |
| 3506897 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review Declaration of Retail Holders |
| 3506889 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to G. Bender, et. al., re: effective date |
| 3503153 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Winston re: plan supplement issue |
| 3503171 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ D. Reid and E. Fay re: plan supplement issue |
| 3503174 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: plan supplement issue |
| 3503175 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Chafetz re: plan discovery |
| 3506885 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Winston and W. Waszmer emails re: confirmation order \ plan language |
| 3507792 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Chafetz email w\ attachments re: plan and confirmation order |
| 3507793 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review redline of the plan with revisions |
| 3507801 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: joinder in confirmation brief |
| 3507834 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review disclosure statement transcript re: retail note holders objection |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Time | Category | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|----------------|----------|------|----------|------|----------|--|-------------|
| 3507835 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review GUC trust re: confirmation order language | |
| 3507836 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further W. Waszmer email re: confirmation order language | |
| 3507828 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer and E. Winston emails re: confirmation order | |
| 3507829 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review Retail Holders motion in limine | |
| 3507830 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review agenda for March 27 confirmation hearing | |
| 3507831 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Further review of confirmation order | |
| 3503630 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Teleconf. w\ G. Bender, E. Chafetz, E. Fay re: confirmation issues \ hearing | |
| 3506495 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 1.00 | 655.00 | Attend pre-confirmation hearing | |
| 3507839 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Kizel email w\ attachments re: GUC trust and supplement to Plan | |
| 3507840 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review current supplement to plan provided by P. Kizel | |
| 3507843 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay and E. Winston emails re: GUC Trust exhibits | |
| 3507847 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review Declaration of Craig E. Johnson re: confirmation | |
| 3507811 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.80 | 524.00 | Review Debtor memorandum of law in support of confirmation | |
| 3507812 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Review the Third Amended Plan re: confirmation | |
| 3507813 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review E. Mosley Declaration re: confirmation | |
| 3507814 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review R. Caruso Declaration in support of confirmation | |
| 3507815 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Review Declaration of Dan Aronson in Support of Confirmation | |
| 3507816 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review UNC brief in support of confirmation | |
| 3507849 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review amended 2019 statement of Brown Rudnick | |
| 3507850 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Debtor's objection to Motion in Limine | |
| 3507852 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review Second Plan Supplement re: confirmation of plan | |
| 3507853 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review amended agenda for 3/27 confirmation hearing | |
| 3506492 | 221 Schwartz | 03/27/15 | B | B320 | 1.00 | 655.00 | Prepare for confirmation (review agenda (.1), amended plan (.3), Retail Noteholder objection (.2), Retail Note holder declaration (.1), confirmation order (.3)) | |
| 3506493 | 221 Schwartz | 03/27/15 | B | B320 | 6.50 | 4,257.50 | Attend confirmation hearing | |
| 3488258 | 338 Werkheiser | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 128.00 | Confer with E Schwartz re Plan Supplement disclosures of retained causes of action. | |
| 3492417 | 594 Conway | 03/05/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Emails from and to E. Fay re serving plan supplement, plan and disclosure statement on the LME parties | |
| 3492418 | 594 Conway | 03/05/15 | B | B320 | 0.60 | 156.00 | Review email from E. Fay w/attached service party information and extract LME parties and review (.2); review docket and various 2004 services (.3); email to and from L. Gast re assistance with svc preparation (.1) | |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Time | Category | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|------------|----------|------|----------|------|--------|---|
| 3492420 | 594 Conway | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.60 | 156.00 | Extract and review plan supplement Exhibit 6.17-11 and compare to IME party svcs (.4); Email to L. Gast re additional svc updates (.2) |
| 3492535 | 594 Conway | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Emails and calls w/DLS regarding svc of plan supplement, DS and Plan (.2); docket research and follow up w/DLS re svc requirements (.1) |
| 3494213 | 594 Conway | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Further emails and calls w/DLS re svc of plan supplement, DS and Plan |
| 3494214 | 594 Conway | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 104.00 | Review email of E. Fay re additional comments re svc of plan supplement, plan and DS (.1); review revised svc from L. Gast (.1); emails to and from E. Fay re submittal of documents to DLS and submit (.2) |
| 3494216 | 594 Conway | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Email to and from E. Fay re effecting svc of pleadings (.1); email to L. Gast re svc list and labels; review (.1); email to DLS re svc of plan pleadings upon parties (.1) |
| 3494240 | 594 Conway | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Discuss svc of DS and Plan on CD w/E. Fay (.1); email to and from DLS re cover and svc (.1); review cover and forward same to E. Fay for sign off (.1) |
| 3494931 | 594 Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Efile nos re plan supplement, plan and DS |
| 3494735 | 594 Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Draft nos re svc of Supplement to Plan, DS and Plan; email to E. Fay for review |
| 3503714 | 594 Conway | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review email from E. Fay re drafting nos re answers and objections to tort claimants first set of interrogatories and set of document requests |
| 3503718 | 594 Conway | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 104.00 | Research svc parties info (.1); draft nos re answers and objections to tort claimants first set of interrogatories and set of document requests (.2); email to E. Fay for review (.1) |
| 3503726 | 594 Conway | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Revise nos re answers and objections to Tort claimants discovery requests (.1); efile w/the Court (.1) |
| 3503541 | 684 Maddox | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.50 | 130.00 | Emails with E Fay re joinder re plan (.1); draft COS re joinder (.1); file joinder (.1); serve same (.2) |
| 3488000 | 959 Fay | 03/01/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review E Schwartz, E Chafetz, G Bender emails re plan supplement |
| 3488640 | 959 Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review L Chiappetta email re LME party list |
| 3488635 | 959 Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Schwartz re plan issues |
| 3488649 | 959 Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Call with E Schwartz re plan/LME parties list (.1) and review E Winston email re same (.1) |
| 3488650 | 959 Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call L. Chiapetta re LME plan list |
| 3488643 | 959 Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email E Chafetz re plan supplement |
| 3488647 | 959 Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re plan supplement |
| 3488662 | 959 Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Chafetz re plan litigation issues |
| 3488829 | 959 Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Draft email re plan causes of action |
| 3491173 | 959 Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review Enersys plan objection |
| 3491174 | 959 Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with L. Ciapetta re cause of action list |
| 3491198 | 959 Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review additional E Schwartz and E Winston emails re plan trust agreement |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3491204 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review W Wazmur email re LME parties list. |
| 3491190 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Schwartz re cause of action analysis |
| 3491192 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email L Chiappetta re plan entities list |
| 3491193 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Review plan supplement documents (.3) and email E Schwartz re same (.1) |
| 3491169 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call R Li re cause of action analysis |
| 3491195 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz and E Winston emails re plan trust agreement |
| 3491196 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re Stewarts retention call from Debtor |
| 3501392 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re trust agreement |
| 3492568 | 959 | Fay | 03/05/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Review E Chafetz email re plan supplement (.1) and review supplement (.2) |
| 3492930 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Review debtwire article re plan |
| 3492922 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with A Conway re service of plan/disclosure statement and plan supplement |
| 3492923 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Additional emails with A Conway re service of plan supplement |
| 3492916 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Several emails with A Conway re service of plan supplement |
| 3492910 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review service list re plan/disclosure statement and plan supplement |
| 3495055 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review notice of service re plan supplement |
| 3495063 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email E Chafetz re creditor plan contact |
| 3495071 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with A Conway re notice of service of plan supplement |
| 3495043 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Schwartz re plan supplement |
| 3495048 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with C Kunz re notice of service |
| 3498932 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E. Chafetz email re GUC Trust oversight board |
| 3498911 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.50 | 242.50 | Review Vernon claimants discovery motion (.2) and review proposed discovery re plan (.3) |
| 3498926 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E. Winston email re litigation trust claims |
| 3498919 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Additional emails w/P. Kizel re discovery call |
| 3498920 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review deposition notices of Vernon claimants |
| 3498915 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review P. Kizel email re plan discovery |
| 3498916 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails w/E. Schwartz re discovery calls |
| 3499243 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review committee member email re plan voting results |
| 3499230 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Review memorandum re plan trust issues |
| 3499237 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.90 | 436.50 | Attend call with E Schwartz, P Kizel, etc. re discovery/plan issues |
| 3499234 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review E Chafetz email re plan voting results and exhibits re same |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3499241 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with P Kizel re discovery response |
| 3499846 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Further call with M Savetsky re discovery |
| 3499847 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Winston re discovery |
| 3499834 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 2.00 | 970.00 | Attend hearing re plan discovery |
| 3499835 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with M Savetsky re deposition notices |
| 3499854 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review M Savetsky email re document requests |
| 3499855 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Call with E Winston re discovery |
| 3499856 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review deposition notices |
| 3499857 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Schwartz re discovery |
| 3499849 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.60 | 291.00 | Review 2004 motion/reply re document requests |
| 3499851 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with M Savetsky re discovery |
| 3499852 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Winston re document requests |
| 3499862 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re tort claimaint discovery requests |
| 3499864 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Chafetz re discovery |
| 3499901 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review service list re discovery and NOS re discovery (.1) and emails with T Naimoli re filing same (.1). |
| 3500277 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review P. Kizel email re scheduling order |
| 3500278 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E. Schwartz email re scheduling order |
| 3500279 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review NOS re discovery and emails w/T. Naimoli re same |
| 3500619 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review G Bender email re discovery re plan |
| 3500380 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.80 | 388.00 | Attend call with E Schwartz, G Bender, E Winston and P Kizel re discovery issues |
| 3500383 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Schwartz re plan discovery |
| 3500384 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review P Kizel email re discovery order |
| 3500621 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review P Kizel email re plan discovery responses |
| 3501367 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz and P Kizel emails re discovery responses. |
| 3501337 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review deposition notice re city of Frisco |
| 3501338 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re trustee compensation |
| 3501330 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review responses to document requests |
| 3501331 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with P Kizel re discovery |
| 3501321 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Winston email re third party discovery |
| 3501323 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Review/comment on interrogatory responses |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3501663 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review P Kizel and E Winston emails re discovery |
| 3501665 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review committee member and G Bender emails re plan discovery |
| 3501666 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review P Kizel additional emails re plan discovery |
| 3501643 | 959 | Fay | 03/21/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review P Kizel email re tort claimant discovery |
| 3501646 | 959 | Fay | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz email re statement in support of confirmation |
| 3501647 | 959 | Fay | 03/22/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz and P Kizel email re plan depositions |
| 3502448 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 1.70 | 824.50 | Research re deposition/plan issues |
| 3502450 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.50 | 242.50 | Call re plan discovery with E Schwartz, G Bender, P Kizel and E Winston |
| 3502452 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review M Henkin email re plan statement |
| 3502446 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email P Kizel re discovery responses |
| 3502435 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review further E Chafetz email re plan response |
| 3502436 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review A Carty email re plan discovery |
| 3502456 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review additional E Schwartz emails re plan discovery |
| 3502458 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review M Herman email re plan document requests |
| 3502439 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re scheduling order |
| 3502440 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review additional E Winston emails re plan discovery |
| 3502443 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 1.40 | 679.00 | Review plan response |
| 3502430 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz emails re plan discovery |
| 3502432 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.50 | 242.50 | Meet with E Schwartz re plan issues (.4) call with same and E Winston re same (.1) |
| 3502433 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.50 | 242.50 | Attend co chair call re plan issues |
| 3502591 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re confirmation order |
| 3502592 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re settlement re plan |
| 3502593 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to P Kizel email re plan discovery |
| 3502594 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re Henkin deposition |
| 3503283 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re Caruso deposition |
| 3503299 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review additional E Schwartz email re Caruso deposition |
| 3503286 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Call with E Winston re plan supplement (.1) and email same re same (.1) |
| 3503289 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Call with E Schwartz and D Reid re plan issues |
| 3503291 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.70 | 339.50 | Review preference analysis (.3) and research re same (.4) |
| 3503293 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review Debtor interrogatory responses re plan discovery |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3503294 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.50 | 242.50 | Review ad hoc Vernon plaintiffs settlement |
| 3503301 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email P Kizel re discovery responses |
| 3503850 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review/revise plan support joinder (.1) and emails with E Chafetz re same (.1) |
| 3503842 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email D DeSouza re joinder |
| 3503832 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Additional emails with E Chafetz re plan support joinder |
| 3503833 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with M Maddox re filing plan support joinder and review COS re same |
| 3503835 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review chart of objections attached to debtor confirmation brief |
| 3503830 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review NOS re plan discovery and email A Conway re filing same |
| 3503839 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review E Chafetz email re plan update |
| 3504703 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review amended 2019 statement of Vernon tort claimants |
| 3504666 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Chafetz re Vernon tort settlement term sheet |
| 3504667 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review objection re motion in limine |
| 3504654 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review LME plan list |
| 3504669 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review Vernon tort settlement term sheet |
| 3504670 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B320 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review motion in limine |

Total Task: B320 77.60 46,201.50

Litigation/Adversary Proceedings

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|---------|----------|---|------|------|-------|---|
| 3499966 | 605 | Naimoli | 03/18/15 | B | B330 | 0.30 | 45.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing and service of notice (.1); Prepare, efile & serve Notice of Deposition Re: Robert K. Kent & Christopher T. Aumais (.2) |
| 3499967 | 605 | Naimoli | 03/18/15 | B | B330 | 0.20 | 30.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing of notice (.1); Prepare & efile Notice of Service Re: First Request for Production of Documents re Ad Hoc Group of Exide Tort Claimants and Notice of Deposition (.1) |

Total Task: B330 0.50 75.00

Professional Retention (Others - Filing)

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|------|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3488348 | 172 | Reid | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 225.00 | E-mails E. Fay, S. Campbell & A. Eve re retention of foreign counsel |
| 3489605 | 172 | Reid | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 225.00 | E-mails E. Schwartz, Y. Thio & E. Fay re foreign counsel |
| 3491923 | 172 | Reid | 03/04/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 75.00 | E-mails E. Fay re foreign counsel |
| 3492255 | 172 | Reid | 03/05/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails J. Khoo, E. Fay & E. Schwartz re foreign counsel |
| 3492497 | 172 | Reid | 03/06/15 | B | B360 | 0.50 | 375.00 | E-mails J. Khoo, E. Fay, A. Eve & E. Schwartz (.3) & review retention documents re foreign counsel (.2) |

| Case No. | Invoice No. | Client | Date | Category | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|-------------|----------|----------|----------|------|------|--------|--|
| 3494274 | 172 | Reid | 03/09/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 225.00 | E-mails J. Khoo, E. Fay, E. Schwartz & A. Eve re retention of foreign counsel |
| 3494315 | 172 | Reid | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails A. Eve, E. Fay & J. Khoo re foreign counsel |
| 3495575 | 172 | Reid | 03/11/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails E. Fay & A. Eve re foreign counsel |
| 3498375 | 172 | Reid | 03/17/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails E. Fay, J. Khoo & S. Campbell re foreign counsel |
| 3500354 | 172 | Reid | 03/18/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails E. Fay, S. Campbell & J. Khoo re foreign counsel. |
| 3500356 | 172 | Reid | 03/19/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails E. Fay, S. Campbell & J. Khoo re foreign counsel assignments. |
| 3492196 | 209 | Dehney | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 273.00 | Emails from S. Schwartz, E. Fay, and committee members re European counsel re Trafigura discovery. |
| 3497578 | 209 | Dehney | 03/16/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 182.00 | Emails from E. Schwartz and E. Fay re Stewart Law retention; email from E. Fay with retention application. |
| 3493956 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review A. Eve email w\ attachment re: Stewart Law Application |
| 3493973 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay and Co-Chair emails re: Stewart Law firm retention application |
| 3493963 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay and A. Eve emails re: Stewart Retention Application |
| 3493971 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Fay and A. Eve emails w\ attachment re: Stewart Law retention application |
| 3488413 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review \ comment on Stewart Law firm motion to shorten |
| 3488130 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Conf. w\ E. Fay re: Stewart retention application |
| 3488182 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Further conf. w\ E. Fay re: Stewart Law firm |
| 3488225 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Teleconf. w\ E. Fay re: Co-Chairs \ Stewart Application |
| 3488226 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Email to Committee Co-Chairs re: Stewart Law retention application |
| 3488239 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Teleconf. w\ E. Winston re: Stewart Law retention application |
| 3493991 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review Stewart Law retention application re: Declaration issues |
| 3494617 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachments re: Singapore Counsel retention |
| 3494640 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: Singapore counsel retention application |
| 3494622 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay and E. Winston emails to E. Winston re: Singapore counsel |
| 3490090 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Winston re: Singapore counsel |
| 3490075 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Teleconf. w\ T. Ying Ying and E. Fay re: potential retention of counsel re: Singapore law \ issues |
| 3490080 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Comment on email to Singapore counsel re: lead investigation issues |
| 3491784 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Fay re: Singapore counsel application |
| 3491761 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B360 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Review Singapore Counsel retention application (.2), declaration (.1) and order (.1) |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Category | Code | Hours | Rate | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|----------|------|-------|--------|--|
| 3494724 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachments re: Singapore Counsel retention |
| 3494968 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email re: Stewarts retention application |
| 3494953 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review J. Khoo email re: Singapore Counsel retention |
| 3493778 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Teleconf. w\ E. Fay re: Stewart retention \ research issues |
| 3495743 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email re: Stewart Law retention application |
| 3495748 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Fay email w\ attachment re: Singapore Counsel retention |
| 3495670 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review J. Khoo email w\ attachment re: Singapore counsel retention |
| 3495678 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: Singapore counsel engagement letter |
| 3495829 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further and additional E. Fay email re: retention of Singapore counsel |
| 3495800 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further and additional E. Fay email w\ attachment re: retention of Singapore Counsel |
| 3495784 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review J. Khoo email w\ attachment re: retention of Singapore Counsel |
| 3493581 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Review revised Singapore counsel engagement letter (.1), retention application (.1) and declaration (.1) |
| 3495647 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Supplemental Application/Motion to Employ/Retain Deloitte Tax LLP as Tax Advisor |
| 3495648 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Application/Motion to Employ/Retain Baker Botts |
| 3495664 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Supplemental Declaration in Support of the Retention of Sheppard Mullin Richter & Hampton LLP as Special Counsel for the Debtor |
| 3495630 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Supplemental Declaration Of Kenneth S. Ziman |
| 3496036 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review J. Khoo and E. Fay emails w\ attachment re: Singapore Counsel retention |
| 3496038 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Fay emails w\ attachments re: Singapore Counsel retention |
| 3496050 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review A. Eve email re: Stewart Law Retention Application |
| 3494938 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Teleconf. w\ E. Fay re: Stewart Retention Application |
| 3494412 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Conf. w\ C. Miller re: March 18th hearing |
| 3496059 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Fay emails re: Stewart Law retention application |
| 3496186 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Conf. w\ C. Miller re: Stewart Retention application hearing |
| 3503346 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Supplemental Declaration of S. Furey |
| 3496227 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Emails to and from E. Fay re: Stewart law application and lead investigation discovery |
| 3502062 | 221 Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay emails w\ attachments re: Singapore Counsel retention and MNAT January fee application |
| 3502075 | 221 Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Katten and Deloitte retention orders |

| Case No. | Party | Attorney | Date | Time | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|-------|----------|----------|------|------|------|--------|---|
| 3503393 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review J. Khoo and E. Fay emails w\ attachment re: Singapore Counsel retention |
| 3503394 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email re: hearing on Stewart Law application |
| 3503454 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email re: Stewart law retention |
| 3503538 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Fay emails to UK and Singapore counsel |
| 3503485 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Emails to and from E. Fay w\ attachments re: Debtor inquiry re: UK\Singapore counsel |
| 3506875 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Baker Botts supplemental declaration |
| 3489363 | 594 | Conway | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Further emails w/E. Fay, T. Naimoli and B. Springart re service of motion and motion shortening notice period re retention of Stewarts Law |
| 3489364 | 594 | Conway | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Draft notice re retention of Stewarts Law and forward to E. Fay for review |
| 3489365 | 594 | Conway | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Draft COS re Application to Retain Stewarts Law and forward to E. Fay for review |
| 3489366 | 594 | Conway | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Draft notice re motion to shorten notice re retention of Stewarts Law and forward to E. Fay for review |
| 3490465 | 594 | Conway | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.40 | 104.00 | Extract order on shortening notice re retention of Stewarts Law (.1); email to and from E. Fay re svc (.1); email to L. Gast re svc assistance (.1); email to DLS re svc of order upon 2002 parties and calendar (.1) |
| 3490474 | 594 | Conway | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Draft nos re order shortening notice period re App to retain Stewarts Law and email to E. Fay for review |
| 3491406 | 594 | Conway | 03/04/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Revise nos re order on shortening notice to retain Stewarts Law (.1); efile w/the court (.1) |
| 3494542 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.40 | 104.00 | T/c from E. Fay re svc of Stewart Law retention app (.1); review 2002 and fax service (.2); follow up email to E. Fay re svc (.1) |
| 3495267 | 594 | Conway | 03/11/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review service of motion and motion to shorten notice period re retention of professional and discuss same w/DLS |
| 3499781 | 594 | Conway | 03/18/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing retention app of Kelvin Chai Partnership (.1); prep notice and cos for efilng and discuss filing of app w/T. Naimoli (.1) |
| 3499531 | 594 | Conway | 03/18/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Email from and to E. Fay re drafting notice and cos re retention of Kelvin Chai partnership |
| 3499532 | 594 | Conway | 03/18/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Draft notice re retention of Kelvin Chai partnership and email to E. Fay for review |
| 3499533 | 594 | Conway | 03/18/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Draft cos re retention of Kelvin Chai partnership and email to E. Fay for review (.1); email to and from L. Gast re 2002 svc (.1) |
| 3500110 | 594 | Conway | 03/19/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing and svc of retention app of Kelvin Chia Partnership |
| 3500111 | 594 | Conway | 03/19/15 | B | B360 | 0.40 | 104.00 | Prep for efilng and efile retention app of Kelvin Chia Partnership (.3); email to DLS re svc of application (.1) |
| 3500112 | 594 | Conway | 03/19/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re svc of Order retaining Stewarts LLP (.1); extract and email to DLS re svc upon 2002 parties (.1) |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|--------|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3501712 | 594 | Conway | 03/20/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Draft nos re svc of Order retaining Stewarts LLP and email to E. Fay for review (.1); efile w/the Court (.1) |
| 3496187 | 826 | Miller | 03/12/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 175.50 | Confer with E. Schwartz re upcoming hearing and issues |
| 3488830 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with A Conway re service of retention application |
| 3488660 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re Singapore counsel |
| 3488661 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review E Schwartz email re retention issue |
| 3488648 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Additional call with E Schwartz re retention issues |
| 3488644 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review A Eve email re retention application |
| 3488645 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Schwartz re LME party list |
| 3488652 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Research re additional LME parties re plan supplement |
| 3488653 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.80 | 388.00 | Compile and finalize retention application for filing |
| 3488655 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Draft motion to shorten Stewarts retention application |
| 3488656 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Emails with A Eve re retention application (.2), email co-chairs re same (.1), and call with E Schwartz re same (.1) |
| 3488657 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Revise motion to shorten retention application |
| 3488638 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Discuss Stewarts application with E Schwartz |
| 3488639 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review notice and COS re Stewarts retention application |
| 3488641 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Schwartz re retention issues |
| 3488642 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Research re retention application service |
| 3491175 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review N Hunt email re motion to shorten (.1) and email M Kenney re same (.1) |
| 3491177 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Emails with N Hunt and M Kenney re retention application |
| 3491178 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Email E Winston re retention issues |
| 3491179 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.70 | 339.50 | Draft foreign counsel retention application |
| 3491181 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Research re Singapore retention |
| 3491183 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Chafetz and E Schwartz emails re foreign retention |
| 3491184 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz emails re call with Singapore counsel |
| 3491197 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to A Conway email re service of order shortening notice |
| 3491171 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Call with E Schwartz and proposed Singapore counsel re engagement |
| 3491194 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Draft email to proposed foreign counsel re retention |
| 3491200 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review NOS re order shortening notice |
| 3491203 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B360 | 0.70 | 339.50 | Review retention application |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3492029 | 959 | Fay | 03/04/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Revise foreign counsel retention application |
| 3492030 | 959 | Fay | 03/04/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to E Schwartz email re retention application |
| 3492559 | 959 | Fay | 03/05/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review J Khoo and E Schwartz emails re retention issue |
| 3492561 | 959 | Fay | 03/05/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Draft email to S Campbell re retention and research issue |
| 3492571 | 959 | Fay | 03/05/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Additional call with E Schwartz re retention issue |
| 3492572 | 959 | Fay | 03/05/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Schwartz re retention issue |
| 3492932 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review and respond to J. Khoo email re retention |
| 3492912 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email S Campbell re retention |
| 3492921 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email E Schwartz and D Reid re engagement letter |
| 3492927 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review and comment on engagement letter |
| 3492928 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Schwartz re retention issues |
| 3494068 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review J Khoo email re retention application |
| 3494082 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email A Eve re retention issue |
| 3494074 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B360 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Email foreign counsel re retention |
| 3494075 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B360 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Review and comment on foreign counsel engagement letter (.2) and retention application (.2) |
| 3501410 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Schwartz and D Reid re foreign counsel retention |
| 3495049 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Email E Schwartz re foreign counsel retention |
| 3495047 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to J. Khoo email re retention application |
| 3495067 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email co-chairs re Singapore counsel retention |
| 3495104 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Discuss retention application with C Miller |
| 3495059 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Draft email to co chairs re KCP retention (.3) and email E Schwartz re same (.1) |
| 3495060 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review A Eve email re Stewarts retention |
| 3495062 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to committee co chair email re retention application |
| 3495056 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Schwartz re retention application |
| 3498931 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails w/A. Conway re Stewarts retention |
| 3498923 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Emails w/Committee member re KCP retention |
| 3499222 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Prepare order re Stewarts retention |
| 3499224 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review and respond to J Khoo email re retention |
| 3499842 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review and respond to S Campbell email re retention |
| 3499860 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B360 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Revise and finalize KCP retention application |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3500375 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B360 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Revise revised KCP retention application (.1) and finalize same for filing (.3) |
| 3500381 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to E Schwartz email retention application |
| 3500388 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B360 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Email J Khoo re retention |
| 3501319 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B360 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review NOS re Stewarts retention order |

Total Task: B360 26.20 13,915.00

Professional Retention (Others - Objections)

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|---------|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3497770 | 594 | Conway | 03/16/15 | B | B370 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review docket re objs to retention of Stewart Law (.1); email to and from E. Fay re drafting CNO (.1) |
| 3489010 | 605 | Naimoli | 03/02/15 | B | B370 | 0.30 | 45.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing and service of application (.1); Prepare & efile Application of the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Exide Technologies for Entry of an Order Authorizing the Employment And Retention of Stewarts Law LLP, Nunc Pro Tunc to February 6, 2015 (.2) |
| 3489011 | 605 | Naimoli | 03/02/15 | B | B370 | 0.20 | 30.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing and service of motion (.1); Prepare & efile Motion for an Order Shortening Notice Relating to Application Authorizing The Employment and Retention of Stewarts Law LLP, Nunc Pro Tunc to February 6, 2015 (.1) |
| 3498281 | 826 | Miller | 03/16/15 | B | B370 | 0.30 | 175.50 | Emails with Fay re objections re retention and check docket re same |

Total Task: B370 1.00 302.50

Schedules/SOFA/U.S. Trustee Reports

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|----------|----------|---|------|------|-------|--|
| 3495634 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B420 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Debtor-In-Possession Monthly Operating Report for Filing Period of January 1, 2015 through January 31, 2015 |
| 3502076 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B420 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Periodic Report Regarding Value, Operations and Profitability of Entities in Which the Debtors' Estates Hold a Substantial or Controlling Interest for Period ending December 31, 2014 Filed by Exide Technologies. |

Total Task: B420 0.20 131.00

Lead Investigation

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|------|----------|---|------|------|--------|--|
| 3488372 | 172 | Reid | 03/02/15 | B | B440 | 0.40 | 300.00 | E-mails R. Pepperman, N. Roman, C. McLean & S. han re document productions |
| 3489633 | 172 | Reid | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 225.00 | E-mails A. Wolfson, C. McLean & N. Roman re document production issues |
| 3489637 | 172 | Reid | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.40 | 300.00 | E-mails S. Qasir, A. Wolfson & M. Herman re confidentiality agreement |
| 3491924 | 172 | Reid | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 225.00 | E-mails N. Roman & A. Wolfson re discovery issues |
| 3491925 | 172 | Reid | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 75.00 | E-mails C. McLean re confidentiality agreement |
| 3492213 | 172 | Reid | 03/05/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails N. Roman & A. Wolfson re discovery issues |
| 3492254 | 172 | Reid | 03/05/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 75.00 | E-mails S. Qasir re confidentiality order |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|----------|----------|---|------|------|----------|---|
| 3492854 | 172 | Reid | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails P. Schmidt, M. Herman & C. McLean re confidentiality Order |
| 3494250 | 172 | Reid | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 225.00 | E-mails C. Mclean & J. Concannon re document productions |
| 3494276 | 172 | Reid | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails P. Schmidt & R. Pepperman re confidentiality agreement |
| 3494279 | 172 | Reid | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails A. Wolfson & N. Roman re meet & confer issues |
| 3495641 | 172 | Reid | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 75.00 | E-mails E. Schwarz re interviews of debtor |
| 3498347 | 172 | Reid | 03/16/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 225.00 | E-mails E. Schwartz, E. Winston, E. Fay & W. Waszmer re witness interviews |
| 3498865 | 172 | Reid | 03/17/15 | B | B440 | 1.70 | 1,275.00 | Interview of Richard Hall by phone |
| 3500352 | 172 | Reid | 03/18/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails E. Winston, E. Fay & E. Schwartz re Exide interviews |
| 3501157 | 172 | Reid | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 150.00 | E-mails E. Winston re motion to compel |
| 3501496 | 172 | Reid | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.60 | 450.00 | Review document production |
| 3501929 | 172 | Reid | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 75.00 | E-mails M. Hermann & E. Winston re document requests |
| 3502864 | 172 | Reid | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 150.00 | Call E. Fay & E. Schwartz re lead investigation |
| 3502865 | 172 | Reid | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 225.00 | E-mails E. Schwartz, S. Qasir, E. Fay & A. Wolfson re document production issues |
| 3504102 | 172 | Reid | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 225.00 | E-mails E. Fay, E. Schwartz, E. Winston & B. Brofentinker re Traxys and related discovery issues |
| 3497611 | 209 | Dehney | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Office conference with E. Schwartz re lead investigation interviews. |
| 3497619 | 209 | Dehney | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Office conference with E. Schwartz re lead investigation interviews. |
| 3497621 | 209 | Dehney | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Additional office conference with E. Schwartz re lead investigation interviews. |
| 3515378 | 209 | Dehney | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 91.00 | Review emails from E. Schwartz and D. Reid re lead investigation interviews. |
| 3515379 | 209 | Dehney | 03/16/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 182.00 | Review emails from E. Schwartz, D. Reid and E. Fay re lead investigation interviews. |
| 3515439 | 209 | Dehney | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.50 | 455.00 | Emails from E. Winston, committee members, E. Schwartz and B. Bronfentrinker re lead pricing investigation. |
| 3493974 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email re: discovery Update |
| 3493984 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review N. Roman email re: document production |
| 3493980 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/02/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review C. McLean email re: discovery responses |
| 3494608 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review A. Wolfson emails re: lead investigation discovery |
| 3494609 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review S. Qasir email w\ attachment re: confidentiality stipulation |
| 3494633 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review C. McLean emails re: confidentiality agreement |
| 3494621 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email re: foreign entities discovery order |
| 3494615 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review M. Herman and A. Wolfson emails re: confidentiality stipulation |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Category | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|----------|------|------|--------|---|
| 3490787 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.90 | 589.50 | Tele. w\ W. Wizsmer, E. Winston, B. Bronfintinker and in part A. Kornfeld re: lead investigation |
| 3490069 | 221 Schwartz | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Conf. w\ E. Fay re: Trafigura AG \ preference list |
| 3491763 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Winston and B. Bronfentinker re: Debtor document production |
| 3491786 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Further email to E. Winston re: Debtor documents |
| 3491793 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Participate in teleconf. w\ Committee Co-Chairs (E. Winston, B. Bronfentinker, et. al.) re: Debtor document production re: lead investigation |
| 3494762 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review N. Roman email re: meet and confer |
| 3494832 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review S. Qasir email re confidentiality agreement |
| 3494716 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston B. Bronfentinker emails re: access to debtor information |
| 3494722 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review draft E. Winston email to Debtor's counsel re: lead investigation information |
| 3494661 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Winston and Committee member emails re: lead investigation |
| 3494664 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email w\ attachment re: Recent Aluminum Opinion |
| 3494651 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member email re: lead investigation |
| 3494652 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further Committee member and B. Bronfentinker emails re: lead investigation |
| 3494656 | 221 Schwartz | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email re: Debtor providing information re: lead investigation |
| 3494666 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B440 | 0.70 | 458.50 | Review recent Aluminum Opinion |
| 3494971 | 221 Schwartz | 03/05/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Wiszmer, et. al., emails re: Debtor document information |
| 3495758 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email re: discussions w\ debtor re: information request |
| 3495763 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston and Committee member emails re: Debtor interviews |
| 3495696 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review P. Schmidt email w\ attachment re: confidentiality stipulation |
| 3495767 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review C. McLean email re: document production |
| 3495771 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review J. Concannon email w\ attachment re: document production |
| 3493780 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.80 | 524.00 | Teleconf. w\ E. Winston, B. Bronfontinker, W. Waszmer, A. Kornfield re: Debtor information (privileged) |
| 3493781 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Winston re: tele. w\ Debtor's counsel re: debtor information request |
| 3493782 | 221 Schwartz | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Fay re: Debtor information request |
| 3493785 | 221 Schwartz | 03/07/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Email to E. Winston re: debtor information interviews |
| 3495776 | 221 Schwartz | 03/08/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Wasemer email re: debtor document information |
| 3495779 | 221 Schwartz | 03/08/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston, et. al., emails re: Debtor document request |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Category | Code | Hours | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|----------|------|-------|--------|--------|--|
| 3495782 | 221 Schwartz | 03/08/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 196.50 | 196.50 | Review Debtor documents re: lead investigation (privileged) |
| 3495786 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston and B. Bronfentinker emails re: Debtor information request |
| 3495787 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: Debtor interviews |
| 3495798 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Review further E. Winston and W. Wizamer emails re: Debtor interviews |
| 3495803 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Review further E. Fay email w\ attachment re: outline re: Debtor interview |
| 3495804 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker and E. Winston emails re: review of Debtor information re: interviews |
| 3495828 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Review P. Schmidt, et. al., emails re: confidentiality stipulation |
| 3495831 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: certification of counsel re: confidentiality stipulation |
| 3495832 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email re: document production |
| 3495833 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email re: discussions w\ Debtor re: information request |
| 3495834 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker and E. Winston emails re: email to debtor re: interviews |
| 3495835 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 196.50 | 196.50 | Further of review of information provided by W. Wizmer |
| 3493814 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 131.00 | 131.00 | Tele. w\ A. Wolfson re: search protocol and meet and confer re: same |
| 3493816 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Fay re: search protocol |
| 3493819 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.40 | 262.00 | 262.00 | Review \ analyze search protocols of Glencore (.2), Goldman (.1) and JPMorgan (.1) in preparation for meet and confer teleconference |
| 3493832 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.80 | 524.00 | 524.00 | Participate in meet and confer (w\ A. Wolfson, E. Lauer, R. Pepperman, et. al.) re: 2004 discovery production |
| 3493578 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Further teleconfs. w\ E. Fay re: outline for possible Court call re: lead investigation interviews |
| 3493580 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 131.00 | 131.00 | Teleconf. w\ E. Winston re: lead investigation interviews and possible court hearing re: same |
| 3493565 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.70 | 458.50 | 458.50 | Revise Outline for possible Court hearing re: lead investigation interviews |
| 3493567 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Email to E. Fay w\ attachment re: outline for possible Court hearing re: lead investigation interviews |
| 3493568 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Teleconf. w\ E. Fay re: outline for possible Court hearing re: lead investigation interviews |
| 3493644 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Conf. w\ E. Fay re: outline re: possible court hearing re: lead investigation interviews |
| 3493698 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 196.50 | 196.50 | Review Debtor information re: lead investigation (privileged) |
| 3493713 | 221 Schwartz | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Emails to E. Winston and B. Bronfentinker re: review of Debtor information |
| 3494411 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | 65.50 | Conf. w\ R. Dehney re: lead interviews |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Category | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|----------|------|------|--------|---|
| 3494548 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to Committee member re: lead investigation issues |
| 3494549 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Further email to Committee member re: lead investigation issues |
| 3494550 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: lead investigation issues |
| 3494551 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Participate in teleconf. w\ W. Wiszmer, A. Kornfield, E. Winston and B. Bronfentinker re: Debtor information regarding lead investigation |
| 3494937 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Winston re: information request of Debtor |
| 3496051 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: lead investigation interviews |
| 3496052 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email to Committee member re: Debtor lead investigation interviews |
| 3496054 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston and B. Bronfentinker emails re: Debtor lead investigation interviews |
| 3496049 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member emails re: lead investigation interviews |
| 3496035 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email to W. Wiszmer re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496063 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Wiszmer and E. Winston emails re: debtor interviews |
| 3496064 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker and A. Kornfeld emails re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496065 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Winston and B. Bronfentinker re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496066 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Winston re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496067 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Winston email re: Witness interviews |
| 3496078 | 221 Schwartz | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Further review of Debtor documents re: lead investigation |
| 3496091 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review A. Kornfeld and E. Winston emails re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496092 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member email re: Debtor information\interviews |
| 3496114 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Winston, et. al., emails re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496116 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further E. Winston, W. Wiszmer, et. al., emails re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496101 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Wiszmer and E. Winston emails re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496118 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Wiszmer and B. Bronfentinker emails re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496119 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay and D. Reid emails re: Debtor interviews |
| 3495537 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 1.00 | 655.00 | Prepare argument outline re: request for interviews for possible court hearing |
| 3495538 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: request for Debtor interviews |
| 3495540 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Tele. w\ Committee member (and in part E. Winston(.2)) re: request for Debtor interviews |
| 3495542 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Conf. w\ R. Dehney re: Debtor request for interviews |
| 3495543 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to P. Kizel, G. Bender, and E. Chafetz re: request for Debtor interviews |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Category | Code | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|----------|------|------|--------|---|
| 3495544 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review and respond to G. Bender email re: Debtor request for interviews |
| 3495545 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Winston re: request for interviews |
| 3495546 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Winston re: tele. w\ Committee member re: Debtor request for interviews |
| 3495548 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to B. Bronfentinker re: Debtor interviews |
| 3495599 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Further conf. w\ R. Dehney re: lead investigation interviews |
| 3495621 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Winston re: Debtor interviews |
| 3495622 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Further and additional conference w\ R. Dehney re: Debtor interviews |
| 3495627 | 221 Schwartz | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to D. Reid, et. al., re: Debtor representative interviews |
| 3496197 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Analyze search terms for discovery re: Trafigura |
| 3496200 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston and W. Wiszmer emails re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496203 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Winston, et. al., re: JPM price manipulation complaint |
| 3496204 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member and E. Winston emails re: lead investigation |
| 3496208 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Emails to E. Fay re: lead investigation |
| 3496226 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Fay email w\ attachment re: discovery search terms |
| 3496253 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review email from W. Wiszmer and email to E. Winston re: Debtor interviews |
| 3496171 | 221 Schwartz | 03/12/15 | B | B440 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Review JPMorgan Energy price manipulation complaint |
| 3502053 | 221 Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B440 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Participate in teleconf. w\ W. Wiszmer, E. Winston, B. Bronfentinker and in part A. Kornfield re: Debtor interviews |
| 3503382 | 221 Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to W. Waszmer re: Debtor documents |
| 3503359 | 221 Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review A. Wolfson email re: 2004 discovery |
| 3503360 | 221 Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email re: Debtor information |
| 3503370 | 221 Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further B. Bronfentinker email re: Debtor providing information |
| 3503376 | 221 Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further and additional B. Bronfentinker email re: Debtor documents |
| 3503378 | 221 Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review S. Han letter re: discovery |
| 3503379 | 221 Schwartz | 03/13/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member email re: lead investigation |
| 3503385 | 221 Schwartz | 03/14/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer email re: Debtor information |
| 3503386 | 221 Schwartz | 03/15/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review and respond to B. Bronfentinker email re: Debtor providing information \ interviews |
| 3503387 | 221 Schwartz | 03/15/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston and B. Bronfentinker emails re: debtor providing information \ interviews |
| 3503388 | 221 Schwartz | 03/15/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer email re: Debtor interviews |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|----------|----------|---|------|------|----------|--|
| 3502060 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B440 | 0.40 | 262.00 | Review Quinn Emanuel Research memorandum |
| 3502061 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Fay, et. al. re: Debtor interviews |
| 3502056 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B440 | 1.00 | 655.00 | Prepare for Debtor interviews (review certain privileged documents provided by Debtor) |
| 3502063 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review E. Winston email w\ attachment re: legal research memorandum |
| 3502069 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/16/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer email re: Debtor Interviews |
| 3502057 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B440 | 2.00 | 1,310.00 | Participate in Debtor interview |
| 3503404 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member emails re: lead investigation |
| 3503411 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/17/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer email re: debtor information |
| 3503461 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to E. Fay re: Trafigura certification \ order |
| 3502139 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/18/15 | B | B440 | 2.90 | 1,899.50 | Participate in Debtor lead interviews |
| 3503479 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member email re: lead investigation |
| 3503537 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Email to W. Waszmer re: UK\Singapore counsel |
| 3503545 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email re: Debtor interviews |
| 3503554 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/19/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Revised Order Granting 2004 Motion |
| 3504399 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member and B. Bronfentinker emails re: lead investigation |
| 3504401 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review further B. Bronfentinker and Committee member emails re: lead investigation |
| 3504402 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Emails to E. Winston re: lead investigation |
| 3504408 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review S. Han letter re: discovery |
| 3502100 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.50 | 327.50 | Participate in Committee member call (w\ B. Bronfentinker, E. Winston, et. al.) re: lead investigation |
| 3502103 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: lead investigation |
| 3502105 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Tele. w\ E. Fay re: lead investigation discovery |
| 3502106 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Further tele. w\ E. Fay re: lead investigation discovery |
| 3504421 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/21/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer email re: Debtor interviews |
| 3504428 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/22/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email re: Debtor information |
| 3504446 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member emails re: lead investigation |
| 3506636 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer email re: European Debtor interviews |
| 3506642 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review Quinn letter to Debtor re: Debtor information |
| 3506643 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 131.00 | Review W. Waszmer letter re: debtor information |

| Case No. | Party | Date | Time | Rate | Amount | Description |
|----------|--------------|----------|------|------|---------------|---|
| 3506630 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review T. Wooley email w\ attachment re: lead investigation information from Debtor |
| 3506652 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review E. Winston email to W. Waszmer re: various lead investigation issues |
| 3506873 | 221 Schwartz | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 131.00 | Review second letter to W. Waszmer from Quinn re: Debtor information |
| 3503152 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 131.00 | Tele. w\ D. Reid re: 2004 discovery |
| 3506890 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 131.00 | Review A. Wolfson letter re: discovery responses |
| 3506899 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review E. Winston email re: lead investigation discovery |
| 3506902 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 0.40 262.00 | Review Debtor information re: Debtor European interviews |
| 3506884 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email re: Debtor European interviews |
| 3502718 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 2.70 1,768.50 | Participate in further Debtor interview |
| 3502552 | 221 Schwartz | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 2.30 1,506.50 | Participate in Debtor interview |
| 3503397 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 1.70 1,113.50 | Participate in Debtor interview |
| 3507788 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email re: lead investigation discovery |
| 3507789 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review Committee member email re: lead investigation |
| 3503629 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.90 589.50 | Participate in call w\ E. Winston, A. Wolfson, E. Fay and in part B. Bronfentinker re: lead investigation |
| 3503631 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Fay re: lead investigation |
| 3503691 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 196.50 | Tele. w\ E. Winston and Committee member re: lead investigation |
| 3503696 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 131.00 | Further teleconf. w\ Committee member re: lead investigating |
| 3504243 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 196.50 | Tele. w\ Committee member re: lead investigation |
| 3504244 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Tele. w\ E. Winston re: lead investigation process |
| 3507821 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review further and additional Committee member emails re: lead investigation |
| 3507822 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review Committee member emails re: information re: lead investigation |
| 3507819 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review further Committee member emails re: lead investigation |
| 3507805 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review E. Winston email re: lead pricing investigation |
| 3507808 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker and Committee member emails re: lead investigation |
| 3507827 | 221 Schwartz | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review further B. Bronfentinker and committee member emails re: lead investigation |
| 3507848 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review W. Waszmer email re: lead investigation |
| 3507838 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Review B. Bronfentinker email w\ attachment re: lead investigation |
| 3504241 | 221 Schwartz | 03/26/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 65.50 | Tele.w\ Committee member re: lead investigation |

| Case No. | Client | Attorney | Date | Category | Code | Hours | Rate | Description |
|----------|--------|----------|----------|----------|------|-------|--------|--|
| 3507864 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/27/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review Committee member emails re: lead investigation |
| 3507869 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/27/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 65.50 | Review S. Han letter re: lead discovery |
| 3506494 | 221 | Schwartz | 03/27/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 196.50 | Teleconf. w\ B. Bronfentinker, W. Waszmer, et. al. re: Debtor documents |
| 3494561 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Email from and to L. Gast re svc of Order Authorizing the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors and the Rule 2004 Recipients to Enter into a Confidentiality Agreement |
| 3494545 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Review and respond to email of E. Fay re svc of Order Authorizing the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors and the Rule 2004 Recipients to Enter into a Confidentiality Agreement (.1); review related coc and email to L. Gast re assistance w/preparation of svc of Order upon 2002 and other relevant parties (.1) |
| 3494930 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Efile nos re Order Authorizing The Official Committee Of Unsecured Creditors And The Rule 2004 Recipients To Enter Into A Confidentiality Agreement |
| 3494773 | 594 | Conway | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Email to and from parcels re svc of Order Authorizing the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors and the Rule 2004 Recipients to Enter into a Confidentiality Agreement (.1); draft nos and email to E. Fay for review (.2) |
| 3499536 | 594 | Conway | 03/18/15 | B | B440 | 0.40 | 104.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re drafting cos re further revised Trafigura et al order directing production of docs (.1); prepare coc for efilng with the court (.1); draft cos and email to E. Fay for review (.1); email to L. Gast re svc assistance (.1) |
| 3500196 | 594 | Conway | 03/19/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 78.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re svc of Revised 2004 Trafigura Order Directing Prod of Docs (.1); extract and serve (.2) |
| 3501701 | 594 | Conway | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 52.00 | Draft nos re revised order directing production of documents (Trafigura) and email to E. Fay for review |
| 3501705 | 594 | Conway | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 26.00 | Efile nos re revised order directing production of documents (Trafigura) and email to E. Fay for review |
| 3494128 | 605 | Naimoli | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.40 | 60.00 | Review and respond to email from E. Fay re filing and service of COC (.1); Prepare, efile & serve Certification of Counsel Regarding Order Authorizing the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors and the Rule 2004 Recipients to Enter into a Confidentiality Agreement (.3) |
| 3488002 | 959 | Fay | 03/01/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review R Pepperman email re discovery |
| 3488659 | 959 | Fay | 03/02/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review C. McLean email re discovery |
| 3491187 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review S Qasir email re confidentiality stipulation and review stipulation blackline |
| 3501393 | 959 | Fay | 03/03/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review A Wolfson email re confidentiality stipulation |
| 3492036 | 959 | Fay | 03/04/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review N Roman email re meet and confer |
| 3492570 | 959 | Fay | 03/05/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review N Roman and A Wolfson emails re meet and confer |
| 3492918 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review C McLean and M Herman email re re confidentiality stipulation |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3492911 | 959 | Fay | 03/06/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review P Schmidt email re confidentiality stipulation |
| 3493416 | 959 | Fay | 03/08/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review E Schwartz emails re lead investigation discovery |
| 3493417 | 959 | Fay | 03/08/15 | B | B440 | 0.80 | 388.00 | Draft outline re lead investigation information request |
| 3494057 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Discuss discovery issue with E Schwartz |
| 3494071 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.90 | 436.50 | Revise outline re debtor information request |
| 3494061 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Call with E Schwartz re interview request list (.1), call with E Schwartz re same (.2) |
| 3494163 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Finalize coc re confidentiality stipulation (.1), draft COS re same (.1) and emails with T Naimoli re filing/service of same (.1) |
| 3494089 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.40 | 194.00 | Review proposed search protocol (.3) and email E Schwartz re same (.1) |
| 3494086 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.30 | 145.50 | Draft certification of counsel re confidentiality agreement (.2) and emails with P. Schmidt re same (.1) |
| 3494087 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review confidentiality agreement/stipulation |
| 3494076 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review A Wolfson email re meet/confer |
| 3494078 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Revise outline re interview request |
| 3501405 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review R Pepperman email re confidentiality stipulation |
| 3501396 | 959 | Fay | 03/09/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review T Naimoli email re service of confidentiality stipulation COC |
| 3495058 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review committee member and E Schwartz emails re debtor interview request |
| 3495053 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Revise outline re interview request |
| 3495066 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with A Conway re notice of service of confi stip |
| 3495072 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review additional E Schwartz emails re interview request |
| 3495073 | 959 | Fay | 03/10/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Winston emails re interview request |
| 3495730 | 959 | Fay | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Discuss interview issue with E Schwartz |
| 3495731 | 959 | Fay | 03/11/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with E Schwartz re lead investigation interviews |
| 3496502 | 959 | Fay | 03/12/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email A Wolfson re discovery protocol |
| 3496504 | 959 | Fay | 03/12/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to E Schwartz email re 2004 order |
| 3500882 | 959 | Fay | 03/13/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review A. Wolfson email re search strings |
| 3500886 | 959 | Fay | 03/13/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review J. Concannon email re discovery |
| 3498934 | 959 | Fay | 03/16/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails w/E. Schwartz and D. Reid re debtor interviews |
| 3499225 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B440 | 0.80 | 388.00 | Attend portion of telephone interview of Debtor re lead issues |
| 3499235 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email E Schwartz re 3.18 debtor interview |
| 3499238 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B440 | 1.70 | 824.50 | Attend telephone interview of Debtor re lead issues |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|-----|----------|---|------|------|--------|---|
| 3499249 | 959 | Fay | 03/17/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Discuss debtor interview re lead with A Remming |
| 3499841 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B440 | 0.70 | 339.50 | Attend interview of Debtor |
| 3499848 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review COS re amended 2004 order |
| 3499859 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B440 | 0.50 | 242.50 | Attend additional Debtor interview |
| 3499850 | 959 | Fay | 03/18/15 | B | B440 | 0.80 | 388.00 | Draft COC and revised 2004 order (.7) and email E Schwartz re same (.1) |
| 3500620 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Emails with J Khoo re research re 2004 orders |
| 3500382 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review S Qasir email re confidentiality agreement |
| 3500385 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review and respond to P Kizel email re confidentiality agreement |
| 3500386 | 959 | Fay | 03/19/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Email A Eve re additional research |
| 3501318 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Winston re lead investigation |
| 3501664 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review J Concannon email re discovery |
| 3501340 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Additional call with E Schwartz re 2004 discovery |
| 3501328 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Call with E Schwartz re lead investigation |
| 3501329 | 959 | Fay | 03/20/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review NOS re 2004 order |
| 3501645 | 959 | Fay | 03/21/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review W Wazmur email re debtor interviews |
| 3502431 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review T Woolley email re debtor interviews |
| 3502455 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review W Wazmur and B Bronfentrinker emails re debtor interviews |
| 3502447 | 959 | Fay | 03/23/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review additional W Wazmur and B Bronfentrinker emails re debtor interviews |
| 3503300 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review B Bronfentricker email re debtor interview |
| 3503295 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review W Wazmur email re debtor interview |
| 3503298 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Schwartz email re 2004 motion |
| 3503292 | 959 | Fay | 03/24/15 | B | B440 | 1.80 | 873.00 | Research re 2004 motion and draft same |
| 3503836 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Winston email re lead investigation |
| 3503849 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.80 | 388.00 | Call with E Winston, E Schwartz, A Wolfson re lead investigation |
| 3503821 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Winston and E Schwartz emails re meeting re lead investigation |
| 3503826 | 959 | Fay | 03/25/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review E Winston email re 2004 issue |
| 3504671 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review committee member emails re lead investigation |
| 3504662 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B440 | 0.20 | 97.00 | Review B Bronfentricker email re lead investigation and attachment re same |
| 3504663 | 959 | Fay | 03/26/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review W Wazmur email re lead investigation |
| 3505306 | 959 | Fay | 03/27/15 | B | B440 | 0.10 | 48.50 | Review W Wazmur email re call re lead investigation |

| | | | | | | | | |
|---------|-----|---------|----------|---|------------------|---------------|-------------------|---|
| 3499943 | 961 | Remming | 03/18/15 | B | B440 | 0.50 | 250.00 | Participate in rule 2004 interview by telephone; numerous emails w/ E. Fay re same |
| | | | | | Total Task: B440 | 67.20 | 41,273.50 | |
| | | | | | FEE SUBTOTAL | <u>254.00</u> | <u>139,928.00</u> | |

EXHIBIT B**EXPENSE SUMMARY**

**Exide Technologies
(Case No. 13-11482 (KJC))**

March 1, 2015 through March 27, 2015

| Expense Category | Service Provider (if applicable) | Total Expenses |
|-----------------------------|---|-----------------------|
| Transcripts | | \$72.00 |
| Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating | | 9,711.15 |
| Meals | | 310.80 |
| Messenger Service | | 85.00 |
| Courier/Delivery Service | | 671.89 |
| Computer Research | Westlaw | 109.76 |
| In-House Duplicating | | 1,264.80 |
| Postage | | 85.94 |
| Conference Calls | | 3.03 |
| Grand Total Expenses | | \$12,314.37 |

COST ENTRIES

| INDEX | DATE | STAT | AMOUNT | DESCRIPTION | CODE | TKPER | VOUCHER |
|---------|----------|------|----------|---|--------|-------|---------|
| 1276112 | 03/18/15 | B | 72.00 | Transcripts - ESCRIBERS, LLC - COPY OF TRANSCRIPT - 3/18/15 | 506 | 959 | 207889 |
| 1270661 | 03/02/15 | B | 3,644.15 | Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - D DISCOVERY - COPY/PRINT, ENVELOPES, HAND DELIVERY, FAX BROADCAST - 3/2/15 | 510 | 221 | 207650 |
| 1270638 | 03/02/15 | B | 105.60 | Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - D DISCOVERY - COPY/PRINT, INCLUDES STUFFING AND METERING - 3/2/15 | 510 | 594 | 207618 |
| 1270637 | 03/03/15 | B | 259.25 | Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - D DISCOVERY - COPY/PRINT, ENVELOPES, POSTAGE, HAND DELIVERIES - 3/3/15 | 510 | 594 | 207617 |
| 1272475 | 03/09/15 | B | 74.63 | Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - D DISCOVERY - COPY/PRINT, ENVELOPES, HAND DELIVIERIES - 3/11/15 | 510 | 594 | 207754 |
| 1272481 | 03/10/15 | B | 759.76 | Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - PARCELS INC. - BANKRUPTCY SERVICE OF 1 DOCUME ON 160 PARTIES VIA FIRST CLASS MAIL - 3/10/15 | 510 NT | 594 | 207760 |
| 1272476 | 03/11/15 | B | 410.25 | Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - D DISCOVERY - COPY/PRINT, ENVELOPES, HAND DELIVIERIES - 3/9/15 | 510 | 594 | 207755 |
| 1272479 | 03/11/15 | B | 2,408.20 | Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - D DISCOVERY - COPY/PRINT, ENVELOPES, POSTAGE, HAND DELIVERIES, CD MASTER AND DUPLICATION - 3/6/15 | 510 | 594 | 207758 |
| 1279227 | 03/19/15 | B | 1,182.39 | Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - D DISCOVERY - COPY/PRINT, ENVELOPES, POSTAGE - 3/19/15 | 510 | 959 | 208073 |
| 1279224 | 03/25/15 | B | 415.69 | Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - D DISCOVERY - COPY/PRINT, ENVELOPES, POSTAGE, HAND DELIVERIES - 3/25/15 | 510 | 684 | 208070 |
| 1282149 | 03/26/15 | B | 132.36 | PHOTOS/ART/SPEC DUPLICATING-OUT OF OFFICE - D DISCOVERY - COPY/PRINT, ENVELOPES, POSTAGE, HAND DELIVERIES - 3/26/15 | 510 | 594 | 208285 |
| 1282150 | 03/27/15 | B | 318.87 | Photos/Art/Spec Duplicating-Out of Office - D DISCOVERY - COPY/PRINT, ENVELOPES, POSTAGE, HAND DELIVERIES - 3/27/15 | 510 | 594 | 208287 |
| 1282869 | 03/27/15 | B | 310.80 | Meals - ERIC D. SCHWARTZ - REIMBURSEMENT OF COMMITTEE CONFIRMATION HEARING LUNCH WITH P KIZEL, G BENDER, E CHAFETZ, M HENKIN, D MACGREEVEY, A SOLE, L EISENBERG, E WADSWORTH, MURRELL, P LAROCHE, E FAY - 3/27/15 | 512 V | 221 | 208336 |
| 1279563 | 03/03/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/3/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279584 | 03/04/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/4/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279585 | 03/04/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/4/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279586 | 03/04/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/4/15 | 513S | 000 | |

| INDEX | DATE | STAT | AMOUNT | DESCRIPTION | CODE | TKPER | VOUCHER |
|---------|----------|------|--------|---|-------|-------|---------|
| 1279587 | 03/04/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/4/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279588 | 03/04/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/4/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279644 | 03/10/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/10/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279645 | 03/10/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/10/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279650 | 03/10/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/10/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279766 | 03/18/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/18/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279767 | 03/18/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/18/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279768 | 03/18/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/18/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279769 | 03/18/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/18/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279770 | 03/18/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/18/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279771 | 03/18/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/18/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279777 | 03/19/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/19/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1279863 | 03/26/15 | B | 5.00 | Messenger Service - 3/26/15 | 513S | 000 | |
| 1271626 | 03/02/15 | B | 17.99 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271627 | 03/02/15 | B | 21.61 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271628 | 03/02/15 | B | 21.55 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271629 | 03/02/15 | B | 19.16 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271630 | 03/02/15 | B | 19.19 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271631 | 03/02/15 | B | 19.16 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271632 | 03/02/15 | B | 12.45 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271633 | 03/02/15 | B | 21.95 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271634 | 03/02/15 | B | 12.45 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271635 | 03/02/15 | B | 12.45 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271636 | 03/02/15 | B | 19.19 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1271637 | 03/02/15 | B | 19.16 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 207703 |
| 1272480 | 03/10/15 | B | 186.00 | Courier/Delivery Service - PARCELS INC. - MULTIPLE INNER-CITY HAND DELIVERIES - 3/10/1 | 514 5 | 594 | 207759 |
| 1280110 | 03/18/15 | B | 44.31 | Courier/Delivery Service - FEDERAL EXPRESS CORP. | 514 | 594 | 208124 |
| 1280111 | 03/18/15 | B | 44.31 | Courier/Delivery Service - FEDERAL EXPRESS CORP. | 514 | 594 | 208124 |
| 1280121 | 03/18/15 | B | 12.45 | Courier/Delivery Service | 514 | 209 | 208126 |
| 1277861 | 03/18/15 | B | 42.03 | Courier/Delivery Service - FEDERAL EXPRESS CORP. | 514 | 000 | 207963 |
| 1279100 | 03/18/15 | B | 11.15 | Courier/Delivery Service - BLUE MARBLE LOGISTICS, LLC | 514 | 000 | 208016 |
| 1279101 | 03/18/15 | B | 11.15 | Courier/Delivery Service - BLUE MARBLE LOGISTICS, LLC | 514 | 000 | 208016 |
| 1279219 | 03/20/15 | B | 59.58 | Courier/Delivery Service - DLS DISCOVERY - POSTAGE AND HAND DELIVERIES - 3/16/15 | 514 | 594 | 208064 |

| INDEX | DATE | STAT | AMOUNT | DESCRIPTION | CODE | TKPER | VOUCHER |
|---------|----------|------|--------|---|------|-------|---------|
| 1282171 | 03/25/15 | B | 11.15 | Courier/Delivery Service - BLUE MARBLE LOGISTICS, LLC | 514 | 000 | 208304 |
| 1282172 | 03/25/15 | B | 11.15 | Courier/Delivery Service - BLUE MARBLE LOGISTICS, LLC | 514 | 000 | 208304 |
| 1282173 | 03/25/15 | B | 11.15 | Courier/Delivery Service - BLUE MARBLE LOGISTICS, LLC | 514 | 000 | 208304 |
| 1282174 | 03/25/15 | B | 11.15 | Courier/Delivery Service - BLUE MARBLE LOGISTICS, LLC | 514 | 000 | 208304 |
| 1277702 | 03/23/15 | B | 109.76 | Computer Research - Westlaw Search Performed by: FAY,ERIN | 515 | 959 | |
| 1269488 | 03/02/15 | B | 9.00 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 605 | |
| 1269995 | 03/04/15 | B | 83.60 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1274280 | 03/09/15 | B | 7.50 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 605 | |
| 1274516 | 03/09/15 | B | 7.30 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 605 | |
| 1274281 | 03/09/15 | B | 70.20 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 684 | |
| 1270890 | 03/11/15 | B | 0.20 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1270891 | 03/11/15 | B | 17.50 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1271441 | 03/12/15 | B | 2.60 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 605 | |
| 1272902 | 03/16/15 | B | 190.00 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1272903 | 03/17/15 | B | 3.00 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1272904 | 03/18/15 | B | 17.80 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1272905 | 03/18/15 | B | 94.00 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1275804 | 03/18/15 | B | 8.00 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 605 | |
| 1275805 | 03/19/15 | B | 9.60 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1273950 | 03/19/15 | B | 5.40 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 605 | |
| 1276841 | 03/25/15 | B | 41.60 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1276842 | 03/25/15 | B | 0.40 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1276840 | 03/25/15 | B | 2.40 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 605 | |
| 1276843 | 03/26/15 | B | 4.00 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 603 | |
| 1276844 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.20 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 603 | |
| 1276845 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.40 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 603 | |
| 1276847 | 03/26/15 | B | 174.60 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 603 | |
| 1276848 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.20 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1276846 | 03/26/15 | B | 2.10 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 010 | |
| 1276849 | 03/27/15 | B | 0.40 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 594 | |
| 1276850 | 03/27/15 | B | 25.60 | In-House Duplicating | 519 | 554 | |

| INDEX | DATE | STAT | AMOUNT | DESCRIPTION | CODE | TKPER | VOUCHER |
|---------|----------|------|--------|--|------|-------|---------|
| 1279955 | 03/04/15 | B | 23.66 | Postage - 3/4/15 | 520 | 000 | |
| 1279960 | 03/10/15 | B | 1.40 | Postage - 3/10/15 | 520 | 000 | |
| 1279961 | 03/10/15 | B | 1.40 | Postage - 3/10/15 | 520 | 000 | |
| 1279991 | 03/18/15 | B | 23.66 | Postage - 3/18/15 | 520 | 000 | |
| 1279994 | 03/19/15 | B | 4.20 | Postage - 3/19/15 | 520 | 000 | |
| 1279998 | 03/20/15 | B | 13.42 | Postage - 3/20/15 | 520 | 000 | |
| 1280010 | 03/26/15 | B | 18.20 | Postage - 3/26/15 | 520 | 000 | |
| 1268609 | 03/02/15 | B | 2.20 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 17:35; to | 541 | 605 | |
| 1268610 | 03/02/15 | B | 0.60 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 17:35; to | 541 | 605 | |
| 1268608 | 03/02/15 | B | 1.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 17:23; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1268611 | 03/02/15 | B | 3.55 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:46; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1268612 | 03/02/15 | B | 2.65 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:45; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1268613 | 03/02/15 | B | 2.90 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:45; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1268614 | 03/02/15 | B | 5.80 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:37; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1269496 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:52; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269497 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.15 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:52; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269498 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.50 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:52; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269499 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.40 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:52; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269500 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:53; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269501 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.90 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:53; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269490 | 03/03/15 | B | 3.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:56; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269491 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:57; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269492 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:57; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269493 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.60 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:57; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269494 | 03/03/15 | B | 5.75 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:57; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269495 | 03/03/15 | B | 3.00 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:57; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269502 | 03/03/15 | B | 2.85 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:53; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269503 | 03/03/15 | B | 1.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:58; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1269489 | 03/03/15 | B | 1.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:44; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1270892 | 03/03/15 | B | 3.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:45; to | 541 | 959 | |

| INDEX | DATE | STAT | AMOUNT | DESCRIPTION | CODE | TKPER | VOUCHER |
|---------|----------|------|--------|--|------|-------|---------|
| 1269504 | 03/03/15 | B | 1.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:19; to | 541 | 553 | |
| 1274517 | 03/09/15 | B | 5.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 21:07; to | 541 | 605 | |
| 1274518 | 03/09/15 | B | 0.35 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 21:07; to | 541 | 605 | |
| 1274519 | 03/09/15 | B | 1.75 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 20:38; to | 541 | 605 | |
| 1274282 | 03/09/15 | B | 8.25 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 17:59; to | 541 | 605 | |
| 1274283 | 03/09/15 | B | 0.95 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 14:39; to | 541 | 684 | |
| 1274284 | 03/09/15 | B | 0.85 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 14:39; to | 541 | 684 | |
| 1274523 | 03/10/15 | B | 2.85 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 12:04; to | 541 | 554 | |
| 1274524 | 03/10/15 | B | 0.60 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 12:04; to | 541 | 554 | |
| 1274525 | 03/10/15 | B | 1.90 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 14:43; to | 541 | 221 | |
| 1274520 | 03/10/15 | B | 1.60 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 12:23; to | 541 | 553 | |
| 1274521 | 03/10/15 | B | 1.60 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 12:53; to | 541 | 553 | |
| 1274522 | 03/10/15 | B | 1.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 12:48; to | 541 | 553 | |
| 1270895 | 03/11/15 | B | 4.65 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 16:21; to | 541 | 221 | |
| 1270896 | 03/11/15 | B | 2.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:32; to | 541 | 221 | |
| 1270897 | 03/11/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:32; to | 541 | 221 | |
| 1270894 | 03/11/15 | B | 1.70 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 12:29; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1270893 | 03/11/15 | B | 1.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:37; to | 541 | 826 | |
| 1271442 | 03/12/15 | B | 1.55 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 12:27; to | 541 | 221 | |
| 1272906 | 03/16/15 | B | 3.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 16:33; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272908 | 03/17/15 | B | 0.50 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:31; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272909 | 03/17/15 | B | 2.40 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:33; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272910 | 03/17/15 | B | 2.75 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:36; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272911 | 03/17/15 | B | 0.50 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:37; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272912 | 03/17/15 | B | 3.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:45; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272913 | 03/17/15 | B | 2.60 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:47; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272914 | 03/17/15 | B | 4.50 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:49; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272916 | 03/17/15 | B | 3.55 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 16:34; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272907 | 03/17/15 | B | 2.60 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 09:26; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1272915 | 03/17/15 | B | 1.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 16:26; to | 541 | 959 | |

| INDEX | DATE | STAT | AMOUNT | DESCRIPTION | CODE | TKPER | VOUCHER |
|---------|----------|------|--------|--|------|-------|---------|
| 1272922 | 03/18/15 | B | 3.75 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 17:51; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1272917 | 03/18/15 | B | 2.25 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:53; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272918 | 03/18/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:53; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272920 | 03/18/15 | B | 1.35 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:36; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272921 | 03/18/15 | B | 0.15 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:36; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1272919 | 03/18/15 | B | 1.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:26; to | 541 | 553 | |
| 1275808 | 03/19/15 | B | 1.95 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:48; to | 541 | 553 | |
| 1275809 | 03/19/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:48; to | 541 | 553 | |
| 1275806 | 03/19/15 | B | 1.70 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 09:36; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1275807 | 03/19/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 09:36; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1274962 | 03/23/15 | B | 1.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:51; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1274963 | 03/23/15 | B | 0.20 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:51; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1274964 | 03/23/15 | B | 1.20 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 09:34; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1274965 | 03/23/15 | B | 1.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 09:34; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1274966 | 03/23/15 | B | 0.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 16:56; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1274967 | 03/23/15 | B | 2.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 16:56; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1274973 | 03/23/15 | B | 2.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:16; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1274974 | 03/23/15 | B | 1.20 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:16; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1274975 | 03/23/15 | B | 4.60 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:09; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1274976 | 03/23/15 | B | 1.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:17; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1274977 | 03/23/15 | B | 1.70 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:34; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1274978 | 03/23/15 | B | 4.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:31; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1274969 | 03/23/15 | B | 3.00 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:55; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1274970 | 03/23/15 | B | 0.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:55; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1274971 | 03/23/15 | B | 1.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:51; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1274972 | 03/23/15 | B | 0.20 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:51; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1274968 | 03/23/15 | B | 2.20 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 17:36; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1275413 | 03/24/15 | B | 2.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:14; to | 541 | 221 | |
| 1276853 | 03/25/15 | B | 4.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:44; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276851 | 03/25/15 | B | 1.90 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:23; to | 541 | 959 | |

| INDEX | DATE | STAT | AMOUNT | DESCRIPTION | CODE | TKPER | VOUCHER |
|---------|----------|------|--------|--|------|-------|---------|
| 1276852 | 03/25/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:23; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1276866 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.80 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 17:19; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1276861 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 12:09; to | 541 | 454 | |
| 1276859 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.15 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 09:00; to | 541 | 455 | |
| 1276854 | 03/26/15 | B | 4.60 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 14:20; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276872 | 03/26/15 | B | 2.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 14:32; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276875 | 03/26/15 | B | 3.75 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 14:17; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276876 | 03/26/15 | B | 3.75 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 14:21; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276877 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.20 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 14:29; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276858 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 08:56; to | 541 | 451 | |
| 1276860 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:55; to | 541 | 451 | |
| 1276889 | 03/26/15 | B | 6.35 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:27; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276890 | 03/26/15 | B | 3.80 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:27; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276891 | 03/26/15 | B | 2.95 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:29; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276892 | 03/26/15 | B | 2.80 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:29; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276894 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:30; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276895 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:30; to | 541 | 670 | |
| 1276902 | 03/26/15 | B | 4.50 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:32; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276903 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:15; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276868 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.90 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 17:13; to | 541 | 605 | |
| 1276869 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 17:13; to | 541 | 605 | |
| 1276855 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 16:52; to | 541 | 603 | |
| 1276856 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.25 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:10; to | 541 | 603 | |
| 1276857 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.25 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:12; to | 541 | 603 | |
| 1276862 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:12; to | 541 | 603 | |
| 1276863 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:14; to | 541 | 603 | |
| 1276864 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:28; to | 541 | 603 | |
| 1276865 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:32; to | 541 | 603 | |
| 1276880 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:55; to | 541 | 221 | |
| 1276870 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:55; to | 541 | 554 | |

| INDEX | DATE | STAT | AMOUNT | DESCRIPTION | CODE | TKPER | VOUCHER |
|---------|----------|------|--------|--|------|-------|---------|
| 1276871 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.70 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:55; to | 541 | 554 | |
| 1276873 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.55 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:53; to | 541 | 554 | |
| 1276874 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 15:53; to | 541 | 554 | |
| 1276896 | 03/26/15 | B | 16.25 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:45; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276897 | 03/26/15 | B | 4.50 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:43; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276898 | 03/26/15 | B | 2.80 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:30; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276899 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.10 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:31; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276900 | 03/26/15 | B | 4.80 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:32; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276901 | 03/26/15 | B | 2.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 10:22; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276884 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.30 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:40; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276885 | 03/26/15 | B | 5.25 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:32; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276886 | 03/26/15 | B | 2.95 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:34; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276887 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.40 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 12:18; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276888 | 03/26/15 | B | 2.95 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 12:20; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276893 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.15 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:30; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276867 | 03/26/15 | B | 19.00 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 16:51; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276878 | 03/26/15 | B | 10.95 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:42; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276879 | 03/26/15 | B | 3.35 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:50; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276881 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.90 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:35; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276882 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 13:41; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276883 | 03/26/15 | B | 1.05 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 11:40; to | 541 | 594 | |
| 1276904 | 03/27/15 | B | 30.50 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 09:08; to | 541 | 554 | |
| 1276905 | 03/27/15 | B | 1.20 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 09:06; to | 541 | 554 | |
| 1276908 | 03/27/15 | B | 5.65 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 19:18; to | 541 | 605 | |
| 1276907 | 03/27/15 | B | 2.65 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 08:56; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1276906 | 03/27/15 | B | 18.25 | In-House Printing - black & white Call time: 08:56; to | 541 | 959 | |
| 1268615 | 03/02/15 | B | 1.00 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1269505 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.25 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1269506 | 03/03/15 | B | 4.00 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1269507 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.25 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |

| INDEX | DATE | STAT | AMOUNT | DESCRIPTION | CODE | TKPER | VOUCHER |
|---------|----------|------|--------|---|------|-------|---------|
| 1269508 | 03/03/15 | B | 3.25 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1269509 | 03/03/15 | B | 0.25 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274285 | 03/09/15 | B | 1.25 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274286 | 03/09/15 | B | 3.75 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274287 | 03/09/15 | B | 0.25 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274288 | 03/09/15 | B | 1.50 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274526 | 03/10/15 | B | 2.75 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 221 | |
| 1271443 | 03/12/15 | B | 2.25 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 221 | |
| 1274979 | 03/23/15 | B | 1.50 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274980 | 03/23/15 | B | 3.50 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274981 | 03/23/15 | B | 25.00 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274982 | 03/23/15 | B | 17.50 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274983 | 03/23/15 | B | 2.75 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274984 | 03/23/15 | B | 5.50 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1274985 | 03/23/15 | B | 1.00 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1276912 | 03/26/15 | B | 3.25 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1276915 | 03/26/15 | B | 17.50 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1276916 | 03/26/15 | B | 25.00 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 670 | |
| 1276909 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.50 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 010 | |
| 1276910 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.50 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 010 | |
| 1276911 | 03/26/15 | B | 0.50 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 010 | |
| 1276917 | 03/26/15 | B | 2.75 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 221 | |
| 1276913 | 03/26/15 | B | 2.00 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 221 | |
| 1276914 | 03/26/15 | B | 13.00 | In-House Printing - color | 542 | 221 | |
| 1281405 | 03/18/15 | B | 3.03 | Conference Calls - SOUNDPATH CONFERENCING SERVICES, LLC | 552H | 959 | 208167 |

12,314.37

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, Erin R. Fay, certify that I am not less than 18 years of age, and that service of the foregoing **Twenty-Second Monthly Application Of Morris, Nichols, Arsht & Tunnell LLP, As Co-Counsel For The Official Committee Of Unsecured Creditors, For Allowance Of Interim Compensation And For Interim Reimbursement Of All Actual And Necessary Expenses Incurred For The Period March 1, 2015 Through March 27, 2015** was caused to be made on April 28, 2015, in the manner indicated, upon the entities identified below.

Date: April 28, 2015

/s/ Erin R. Fay

Erin R. Fay (No. 5268)

BY HAND DELIVERY

Mark S. Kenney
Office of the United States Trustee
for the District of Delaware
J. Caleb Boggs Federal Building
Room 2207, Lockbox 35
844 North King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801

Pauline K. Morgan
Young Conaway Stargatt & Taylor LLP
Rodney Square
1000 King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801

Anthony W. Clark
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher &
Flom LLP
One Rodney Square
920 N. King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801

Dennis A. Meloro
Greenberg Traurig, LLP
1007 N. Orange Street, Suite 1200
Wilmington, DE 19801

Mark D. Collins
Richards, Layton & Finger, P.A.
One Rodney Square
920 North King Street
Wilmington, DE 19801

BY FIRST CLASS MAIL

James J. Mazza, Jr.
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher &
Flom LLP
155 N. Wacker Drive
Chicago, IL 60606-1720

Alice Belisle Eaton
Paul, Weiss, Rifking, Wharton &
Garrison LLP
1285 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10019

Kenneth S. Ziman
J. Eric Ivester
Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher &
Flom LLP
Four Times Square
New York, NY 10036

BY FIRST CLASS MAIL

Exide Technologies
13000 Deerfield Parkway
Building 200
Milton, GA 30004
Attn: Phillip A. Damaska

Damian S. Schaible
Davis, Polk & Wardwell LLP
450 Lexington Avenue
New York, NY 10017

David B. Kurzweil
Greenberg Traurig, LLP
3333 Piedmont Road NE
Suite 2500
Atlanta, GA 30305

Wells Fargo Bank, N.A.
150 East 42nd Street, 40th Floor
New York, NY 10017
Attn: James R. Lewis

Mark F. Hebbeln
Foley & Lardner LLP
321 North Clark Street, Suite 2800
Chicago, IL 60654

U.S. Bank National Association
Global Corporate Trust Services
60 Livingston Avenue, EP-MN-WSID
St. Paul, MN 55107
Attn: Cindy Woodward

Andrew Silfen
Arent Fox LLP
1675 Broadway
New York, NY 10019

Kenneth A. Rosen
Sharon L. Levine
Paul Kizel
Lowenstein Sandler LLP
65 Livingston Avenue
Roseland, NJ 07068

Gerald C. Bender
Lowenstein Sandler LLP
1251 Avenue of the Americas
New York, NY 10020

Robert J. Keach
Michael Fagone
Sam Anderson
Bernstein Shur
100 Middle Street
P.O. Box 9729
Portland, ME 04104-5029